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i Consultarnts
i B AR Pre Lig Campany Registration Mo 19960T158R
S UBIAYVE 1. #1225 PAYA UBEINDUSTRIAL PARK. SING VPORE J08933 TEL : (065) 625635061 FAX @ (065 62564313
Your ref: D19004736MEFSH
QOur ref; CS/FCII9013109/T1vi3 Date: 26/7/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO,SLE 1948R

We thank you for your instruction on 247772019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
25/7/2019 at the premises of M/s HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §57,060.50
Revised Estimate Amount 1 554,162.50
"Check” Items Amount : §%365.25
Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value + 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s front portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automaohile Assessor




i H M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co=eg bie 1950001000 C5T Reg Mo H2-0001676-9
MS . FIrStcaplta I B Rafiles Quay #21-00 Sinpapore 048580
Tet 65} 6222 2311 Faol (B5) 6222 3547

[aims & Metor Undensriting Depr: 36 Fobinsen Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65} 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
‘wiww. mafirstcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 18-07-2018 Our Ref No. D19004736MFSH
Accident Date 17-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC216892 Third Party Vehicle. SLE1948R
Survey Location JUN TAIYO SERVICE CENTRE NO 8 FOURTH LOK YANG ROAD
Contact Person. NG JIONG HOW
Contact No. 68336282/ 0 Fax No. 0
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST. COR - 57554.74
Appointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number., MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA

Cc : Workshop PACIEIC PTE. LTD. Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer genarated letter, no signatura reguired.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 11:15 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Serene Ler’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004736MFSH/1-5LE 1948R
Attachments: SLE 1948R PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLE 1948R
Date of survey: 25/7/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 11:04 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004736M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmUtc-rc!aims@mﬁﬁrstcapital.cam.ﬁgf

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 4:45 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKEAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004736MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
.. ; WWW . avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LEKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 11:16 AM

To: JiongHow, Ng

Cc: Vonn, LM Siow: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim; SUR
Subject: RE: SLE 194BR-DOA: 17/7/2019v

Dear Jiong How,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm COR @ $4269.00 Before GST @ 5 working days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 3:17 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Vonn, LM Siow <vonnim.siow@hcspl.com.sg>; Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLE 1948R-DOA: 17/7/2019v

Dear Veron,

Please confirm COR @ 54269.00 Before GST
Thank you

Regards

Mg liong How

Mator Claims Advisor

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

t: 6833 6282

e: jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg

we www . hitachi-capital.com.sg

HITACHI
Trwplre the Mewd




DISCLAIMER:
This email and/or any files andfor attachments transmitted are PRIVATE & CONFIDENTIAL and may be LEGALLY PRIVILEGED.

This email is intended solely for the attention and use of the name addressee(s).
If you are not @ named addressee, you must not use, disseminate, forward, print or copy this email and all its contents/attachments.
If you have received this email in error, please natify the sender immediately by email and delete it from your system.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, August 19, 2019 2:55 PM

To: liongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLE 1948R-DOA: 17/7/2019

Dear Jiong How,

Can finalise?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 3:23 PM

To: Veron Chen [LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLE 1948R-DOA: 17/7/2019

Hi Veron,

Vehicle repaired. Will finalise later on
Thank you

Regards

Mg Jiong How

Motor Claims Advisor

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

t: 6833 62382

e: jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg

w: www. hitachi-capital.com.sg

HITACHI
Inagdre the Mot

DISCLAIMER:

This email andler any files and/or attachments transmitted are PRIVATE & CONFIDENTIAL and may be LEGALLY PRIVILEGED.
This email is intended salely far the attention and use of the name addressee(s).

If you are not a named addressee, you must not use, disseminate, forward, print or copy this email and all its contents/attachments.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately by email and delete it from your system.
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2019 3:12 FM

To: JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>

Subject: SLE 1948R-DOA: 17/7/2019

Dear Jiong How,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



FCIL

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

No. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705
Fax : 68966591
Co, Reg.No. 199400399N  GST Reg.No. M2-011899-3

ATTN MOTOR CLAIME DEPT

PARTS REPLACEMENT

1. Body Repair

1 Front Bumper
2 Front Bumper Clips

3 Front Bumper Outer Bracket LH/RH

4 Headlamp LH
5 Headlamp Chrome LH
& Front Fender LH
7 Front Fender Clips LH
8 Front Fender Shield LLH
8 Front Fender Shield Clips LLH
10 Bonnet
11 Bonnet Hinge LH/RH
12 Bonnet Lock
13 VVT-I Logo
14 Side Mirror LH
15 Side Mirror Cover LH
18 Front Door LLH
17 Front Door Stickers LH

Discount 253%

Fu+ Poavw L H £ dr gL, Luﬂulf[ﬂ“s

2. Labor Charges

Mo. of repair days:

Tel - 4663022

Repair

Qty

=

—_—

10

—
=

Ind =

Jun Taiyo Service Centre

VEHICLE ESTIMATE

QUOTE NO
ACCIDENT DATE
VRN
MODEL
TP VRN
55 Unit

3 458.00
5 5.50
3 82.00
b 850.00
5 181.00
& 781.00
3 17.00
3 200.00
3 5.50
$ 1,037.00
5 75.00
] 130.00
B 50.00
5 1,250.00
3 78.00
$ :

5 45.00
TOTAL

1 Remowve, repair and replace parts for the affected areas

2 Spray paint on affected areas

3 Check wiring, re-align headlamps and ensure proper functioning

4 Remove & reinstall 2 pieces of bumper sensors

5 Conduct water seepage test

Sub Total

17/07/2019@1920HRS

SLE1948R

Toyota Altis

SHC218872

S$ Amt S% Labor

s 45800 K>

S 5500 """ _de”

& 164.0044- 7 £H Xnm .«

$ 850000

$  181.00cdf —

$  781.00 47—
. Yo

$ 170,00 ek 0

$ 20000 %™

$ sEigg T <N

s 1.037.00K7

$  15000% 7 Stk

$  130.007 nn

5 50.00 A% —

§ 1.250.00 bwo

5 78.00 Atrs—"

E ) M.

$ 4500 * "

$ (1,413.50)

S 424050
$ 1.250.00 &°0
$ 1.250.00 Jeo
g §0.00 Zo
$  120.00 xAn-
$  120.00 #-
S 282000

Grand Total $ 7.080.50 1[05.:0

Add 7% GST 3 494 24

Nett Total $ 755474



HITAGHI CAPTIAL ASIA PACIFIC PTELTD

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE
(MANAGER)
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P -
KK Auto Consyltants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey before/after spray painting
 To desplay damaged pant(s) during resurvey
» Parts prices are subject ta can’irmation
= Third party survey (5 on a “Without Prequdice” basis
® No illegal modificationis) s aliowed
* Supplementary ftemis| mas! pa resurayed dng
Is subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repairer
Signature:
Dase:




Mo ef 1

epar days: I

Pk - 3B
g 672, W Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
1.-157‘ = Y B0 Jun Taiyo Service Centre
any ON Mo, 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705
Aok Tel 64663022 Fax : 68966591
: Co. Reg.No. 199400389MN  GST Reg Mo. M2-011899-3
\oed? 3 VEHICLE ESTIMATE
FCIL WG 9 X QUOTE NO
T ¢«I|. TR ACCIDENT DATE  17/07/2019@ 1920HR5
N VRM SLE1848R
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MODEL Toyota Altis
TP VRN SHC2169Z
Qty 5§ Unit S$ Amt S§ Labor
PARTS REPLACEMENT
1. Body Repair
1 Front Bumper I & 458.00 S 458.00 K>
2 Front Bumper Clips 10 8 550 & 55.00 %
3 Front Bumper Outer Bracket LH/RH 2 S 200 3 154.3,,:’#)(
4 Headlamp LH I B 85000 % B50.00 0 —
& Headlamp Chrome LH I & 181.00 % 181.00 codf —
& Fromt Fender LII L 5 781.00 § 781.00 47—
7 Front Fender Clips LH 10 5 17.00 3 170.00 gfu’f’é'i'fi .
8 Front Fender Shield LH I 5 20000 % 200.00
9 Front Fender Shield Clips LH 10 5 8§50 8 55.00 7
10 Bonnet I § 1,03700 § 1037.00R¥
11 Bonnet Hinge LH/RH 2§ 7500 $ 150004 7
12 Bonnet Lock I B 13000 & 130,00 ™
13 VVT-I Logo & 5000 S 50.00 Ak
14 Side Mirror LH | $§ 125000 § 1,250.00 Pwe '
15 Side Mirror Cover LH S 78.00 § 78.00 At 5~
16 Front Door LEH 1 % - 5 -
17 Front Door Stickers LH . 4500 S 4500 *
Discount 23% 1,413.5
R- + ,';I.:\.u v L H C |w'-..'-"~4. Pl l"r""\) u—*ﬂ& "f RLJQ e s { ' ﬂ‘}
- TOTAL 5 4,240.50
2. Labor Charges
; éf*i’-;i'
1 Remave, repair and replace parts for the affected areas $ 1,230.00
2 Spray paint on affected areas $ 1,250.00 jee
3 Check wiring, re-align headlamps and ensure proper functioning 3 80.00 %o
4 Remoaove & reinstall 2 pieces of bumpar sensors s 120.00 »
5 Conduct water seepage test $ 120.00 4=
Sub Tolal 5 2,820.00
Grand Total 5 7,080.50
Add 7% GST 3 494 24
MNett Total 5 755474
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19013108/T1vf3n2
3? aﬁcﬂsgrﬁ? HSL?;EDSINGAFGRE 068877 Dk 2BHealB Imlm”lm”"”"‘"“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SHC 21692 Veh. Inspected SLE 1948R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004736MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From SEREME LER Assign Date 24/07/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MROS3IREH104554832 Colour SILVER
Odometer 287849 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/55 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/55R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[205/55R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/07/2019 ~ |inspection Date 25/07/2019
Survey held at HITACHI CAPITAL (S} PTE LTD
JUN TAIYO SERVICE CENTRE
NQ. 8 FOURTH LOK YANG ROAD
SINGAPORE 629705
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSFPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Fage No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 1948R
Estimate By | Qur Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ~Stmate tg}l {s!j
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 458,00 ;
LABOUR
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @$5.50 NOT NECESSARY 55.00 3
2|FRONT BUMPER OUTER BRACKET LH/RH @%$82.00 N/S DEFORMED 164.00 82.00
0/S NOT
MNECESSARY
1|HEADLAMP LH cuT 850.00 850.00
1|HEADLAMP CHROME LH cut 181.00 181.00
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENT 781.00 T81.00
10|FRONT FENDER CLIPS LH @$17.00 NOT NECESSARY 170.00 )
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD LH NOT NECESSARY 200.00 A
10|FRONT FENDER SHIELD CLIPS LH @$5.50 NOT NECESSARY 55.00 .
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1,037.00 -
LABOUR
2|BONNET HINGE LH/RH @%75.00 NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|BONNET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 130.00 g
1VWWT-1 LOGO NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|SIDE MIRROR LH BROKEN 1,250.00 1,250.00
1|SIDE MIRROR COVER LH MISSING 78.00 T8.00
1|FRONT DOOR LH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE : 5
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR STICKERS LH NOT NECESSARY 45.00 -
1|FRT DOOR LH CHROME MOULDING cuT 60.00 60.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,428.50 -833.00
4 28550 2.489.00
LAEBQUR
REMOVE,REPAIR AND REPLACE PARTS FOR THE 1,250.00 800.00
AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FROKNT BUMPER,BONMNET AND FRONT DOOR LH.
SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1,250.00 900.00
CHECK WIRING,RE-ALIGN HEADLAMPS AND ENSURE 80.00 30.00
PROPER FUNCTIONING.
REMOVE & REINSTALL 2 PIECES OF BUMPER SENSORS. [NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013109/T1vi3n2




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8507198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
i P Workshop 5)| __ ($)
CONDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST. 120.00 40.00
2.820.00 1,770.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,105.50 4,269.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 4,269.00|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013109/T1vi3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report s made acbsly for tha use and banafit of the Client named on the frond page of this Repon.




