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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX © (065} 62564315

Your Ref: D19004790MFSH Date: 30 July 2019

Our Ref: CS/FC119013083/R1gf3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLW 2424J .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 29/07/2019 at the premises of M/s TRANS EUROCARS. and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;S8 6.704.91
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 4.746.60
“Check” ltems Amount 1 8% 261.17
Market Value 1 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ -
Nett Value : 5% -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



Ms @ FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg Mo 1950000060 CST Rew. Na. H2 00016769

Clatms & Mator Unaerwrising Dept: 35 Robinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) G507 3848 Fax [65) 6507 3843
wwrws msfirstcapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
23-07-2019 Qur Ref No.
18-07-2019 Claim Type.
SHB167H Third Party Vehicle.

27 A TANJONG PENJURU

JOBI THOMAS

633106880/ 0 Fax No.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D12004790MFSH

Third Party

SLW2424.1

63310690

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec: Workshop

Cc : TP Soclicitor

Officer Incharge

EUROKARS HABITAT

Attention.
PTELTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 12:00 PM

To: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: jobithomas@eurokars.com.sg; sarah.candida@eurokars.com.sg;
rickteo@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION MS FCI TP - SLW2424) xIsx

Dear Jessica,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $4,746.60 before GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly send the relevant documents to MS First Capital Insurance company.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto,com | fax: H2R6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S${408033)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 10:57 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION MS FCITP - SLW2424) xlsx

CSIFC19013083/R1af3

From: iessicahs@eurokars.com.sg <jessicahs{@eurokars.com.sg>

sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 10:56 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: johithomas@eurokars.com.sg; sarah.candida@eurokars.com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg
Subject: FINALIZATION MS FCI TP - SLW2424) xlsx

Dear Rasul,
Please find our computation attached for your agreement.

COR: $4,746.60 before GST
3 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for liability/wait for
survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Appreciate your confirmation for this case urgently.
Thank you very much.

Regards,

Jessica Shastri

Admin Executive — Insurance Claims
27A, Tanjong Penjuru



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 11:51 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments

Cc: ‘Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 9004790MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCI19013083R1qf3.pdf

Dear Joanne,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLW 2424).

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@|kkau m | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

Erom: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 4:15 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <ewsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004790MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6a56-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims IrnaiItn:c-wsmc:-tu::n::laims@r‘nsﬁrstcanital.com.sg]
sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 12:27 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong
<loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004790MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



EUROKARS HABITAT PTE LTD
27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS

WS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD MAME : Mr ] WIP : 28361
36 Robinson Road, ADDRESS : 78 Anchorvale Crescent #10-12 EXCESS :
City House #16-01 Singapore 544624 DATE: 23.07.2019
Singapore 068877 f
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL: 96459297 / s Lo GREDEGRSS
FAX :
VEH NO : sLw2424) DATEIN : CONTACT PERSON : JOBI THOMAS 63310682
CHASSIS NO : WMWYSS20703E09979  |MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : P
MIODEL : F&O DATE REG.: 29.01.2018 POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
S/NO Parts Description
aTy REVISED PRICES
1 |Rearsumeer € vf 1 MS1.12.7.389.377 $ 225082
: |REAR BUMPER SPOILER cd ~ 1 M51.12.7.391,199 5 395.20
3 |BUMPER SPOILER COVER & )C’“V“ 1 M51.12.7.411.083 5 261.17
« [rowcover X 1 M51.12.7.389.350 s 80.08
5 |RIVET L 7 4 MO7.14.9.807.127 5 4,68
B |PLUG-INNUT AL 7 4 B51.12.7.461.407 g 15.88
7 |BLIND RIVET Mt = 2 B51.24.8.226.003 5 10.02
s |REARBUMPERSIDETRIMCOVERLH, X %% 1 M51.12.7.391.205 g 153.53
5 |REAR BUMPER SIDE TRIM COVER RH X 1 M51.12.7.391.206 5 153.53
TOTAL PARTS 5 3,324.91
5
TOTAL PARTS COST 5 3,324.91

Labour Dem‘igla% éﬁ L

1 |TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR ALL

%
ST

2% ls et

AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.

-
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"

2 |TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER,

L P

31 |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL S¥YSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING.

4 |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS.

A [ er<Ey

\?\Mﬂ Ltrl?-m.:._

5 |SUNDRIES. R

JA?QGM!'

TOTAL LABOUR

3,380.00

TOTAL PARTS

3,324.91

TOTAL

6,704.91

LESS EXCESS

in | Ban (4n

TOTAL AFTER EXCESS

GST 7%

GRAND TOTAL

we |4 [ jin e fdn A
'

MS FCI TP - SLW2424J) Page 1 of 2



REMARKS

THIS 15 OMLY AM ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD THERE
BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF REPAIRING, YOU WILL
BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING CARRIED OUT,

TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED WITH THE REPAIRS, A

QUOTATION FEE OF $400.00 WILL BE APPLY AS ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVOLVED
[N SOURCING EOR PARTS PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES,

MS FCIL TP - SLW2424.) Page 2 of 2



EUROKARS HABITAT PTE LTD

FINALIZATION MS FCI TP - SLW2424) xlsx Page 1 of 2

27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042 (5) ELROKARS GROUF
FINALIZATION COST OF REPAIRS
=
|'M5 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD MAME : MrJ WIP 20361
36 Robinson Road, ADDRESS : 79 Anchorvale Crescent #10-1% EXCESS:
City House #16-01 Singapore 584624 DATE: 23.07.2019
singapore D6B877
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL: 96459297
FAX :
VEH NO : sLwz2424) DATE IN : COMTACT PERSON : 10BI THOMAS 63310682
CHASSIS NO : WMWYS920703E09979  [MILEAGE TYPE OF CLAIM : TP
MODEL : FE0 DATE REG.: 25.01.2018  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
5/ND Parts Description
ary REVISED PRICES
1 |REAR BUMPER 1 M51,12.7.369.377 5 2,25082 [ 2,250.82
7 |REAR BUMPER SPOILER 1 M51,12.7.391.199 5 395.20 | § 395.20
3 |BUMPER SPOILER COVER 1 M51.12.7.411.083 5 - 5 261.17
4 |TOW COVER 1 M51.12.7.389.350 s - |5 £0.08
5 |RIVET 4 M07.14.9.807.127 5 4.68 | 3 4.68
6 |PLUG-IN NUT 4 B51.12.7.461.407 5 15.88 | 3 15.88
7 |BLIND RIVET 2 B51.24.8.226.003 s 10,02 | § 10.02
8 |REAR BUMPER SIDE TRIM COVER LH, 1 M51.12.7.391.205 5 - 5 153.53
g |REAR BUMPER SIDE TRIM COVER RH 3 M51.12,7.391.206 5 5 153.53
TOTAL PARTS 5 2,676.60 | 5 3,324.91
£ =
TOTAL PARTS COST 5 2,676.60 | 5 3324.91
L_!Egur Dgscr Ek:m
1 |TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR ALL $ 840.00 | 3 1,680.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
7 |TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER. s 800.00 | 5 1,000.00
3 |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. s 150.00 | § 250,00
4 |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS, 5 250.00 | & 350.00
5 |SUMDRIES. 5 30.00 ) 5 100.00
TOTAL LABOUR 5 2,070.00 | S 3,380.00
TOTAL PARTS 5 2,676.60 | § 3,324.91
TOTAL 5 4,746.60 5 6,704.91
LESS EXCESS 5 5 5
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS 5 4,746.60
G5T 7% & 232,26 | & -
GRAND TOTAL 5 5,078.86 | 5 -




WUMBER OF DAYS: 3 WORKING DAYS{EXCLUDE WAITING FOR SURVEY, AUTHORIZATION, PARTS,SAT,SUN & PH)

FINALIZATION MS FCI TP - SLW2424.J s« Page 2 of 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. No: 199607 198R 35T Reg. Mo, 19-8507198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19013083/R1qf3n2
#16.01 Oy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 R Ehan MM”M”“IW"IW
Code
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH B167H Veh. Inspected SLW 2424
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004790MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JOANNEY YONG Assign Date 24/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MINI COOPER c.c 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2018
Chassis No. WMWY S920703E09079 Colour BLACK
Odometer 19534 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R19 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R19 PIRELLI G mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[225/45 R1g PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R13 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/07/2019 |inspection Date 29/07/2019
Survey held at 274 TANJONG PENJURU
Repairer EUROKARS HABITAT PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CHIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




i ”L/ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Ml B = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
-—"—'_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Fage Na.-1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLW 24244
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) cuT 2,250.82 2,250.82
1|REAR BUMPER SPOILER (SN) cuT 395.20 395.20
1|BUMPER SPOILER COVER (SN) SERVICEABLE 261.17 .
1|TOW COVER (SN) SERVICEABLE £0.08 2
4|RIVET (SN) NECESSARY 468 468
4|PLUG-IN NUT (SN) NECESSARY 15.88 15.88
2[BLIND RIVET (SN) NECESSARY 10.02 10.02
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE TRIM COVER LH {SN) SERVICEABLE 153.53 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE TRIM COVER RH (SN) SERVICEABLE 153 53 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
3,424.91 2.706.60
LABQUR
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER & TO REPAIR ALL AREAS 1,680.00 840,00
AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT.
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER. 1,000.00 800.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 250.00 150.00
FUNCTIONING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 350,00 250.00
WORKS.
3,280.00 2,040.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,704.91 4,746.60
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | ! | 4,746.60|
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19013083/R1qf3n2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely for the use and bepefit of thi Clinnt namad an the front page of this Report.

i mummmmmmmumwmw




