Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 April 2020 11:23 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: [A]E: ESTIMATE & GIA FOR SMC7382G *** LKK REF: CS/INC19013080/Gqd3

Dear Guogiang,
We confirm COR $1,200 (before GST) and 4 working days.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Wednesday, 29 April 2020, 05:42:15 pm GMT+8, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Steven,
Finalize COR $1200 before GST @ 4 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

& A : Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>
RiEAYE): 2020F48 16 13:24

W% A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

$2i%: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
EEEQ: Re: ESTIMATE & GIA FOR SMC7382G *** LKK REF: CS/INC19013080/Gqd3

Dear all,

Any updates on the COR and repair days for this case?
Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Friday, 16 August 2019, 12:51:55 pm GMT+8, Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> wrote:
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Dear All,

Please revert on the cost of repair and repair days. Estimate was emailed to Guogiang on 25 July
2019.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Thursday, 25 July 2019, 07:26:02 pm GMT+8, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi GQ / Shiau Chan,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan @lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 12:02 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ESTIMATE & GIA FOR SMC7382G

Dear Guogiang.

Please see attachments and we hope to finalise soon.

Warmest regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295



