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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 September, 2019 9:03 AM

To: Advance Auto Garage

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident between SGU9641Y and SLL3187U on 22/07/2019 along Junction of 

Sembawang Ave and Sembawang Drive - LKK REF CC4/AIG19013022/Khb3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Xavier, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Kindly furnish us a copy of the LTA Deregistration Letter as requested by our principal. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Advance Auto Garage [mailto:advanceag@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, 26 August, 2019 2:42 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Accident between SGU9641Y and SLL3187U on 22/07/2019 along Junction of Sembawang Ave and 

Sembawang Drive 

 

OUR REF: SGU9641Y 

YOUR REF: SLL3187U 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

As per tele-conversation we had earlier, I am writing in as per your request to inform you formally that Advance 

Auto Garage has taken over the claim W.E.F 24/08/2019 from Cheng Hoe Motor PTE LTD. As I understand, the 

survey has already been done over at Cheng Hoe Motor, and no further survey is required. In the meantime, the in-

principal offer from your surveyor is $3,600 for COR and 14 Repair Days. Is it possible for me to scrap the car as it 

has already been a month since the accident and my client is losing out on the rebate amount as the days pass. 

Please advise. Thank you. 
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Please find GIA report attached as well.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Xavier Lim 

(+65) 9007 9247 

Advance Auto Garage 

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #04-01 

Singapore (415933) 
 


