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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

B

From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 3:17 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: claims@hushong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Finalize Case for SMJ4854U - DOA: 20/07/2019
Dear Steve,

COR (Part by Part) $2,396.48 before GST - Confirm
Thanks,

Regards

James Tan

Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 5UNGE|! KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W, huahong.com.sg

 flinBENE

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.coms
Sent; Monday, 30 March 2020 9:45 am

To: lames Tan <james@huahong. com.sg>

Cc: claimsi@huahone.com,sg

Subject: Finalize Case for SMJ4854U - DOA; 20/07/2019

Dear lames,
Kindly refer our finalize 52,396.48 (P/P, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Repards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phaone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)




MSs @ FirstCapital

6 Ratfles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax [85)6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cofre o DSS0000TEC  C4T Reg bo H2-0OREETE-S

Clalms & Hator Undenwaliing Depe: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0BEBTT

Telk {65) 6507 3848 Fao: (B5) B30T 3849
woww mafirstcapltal.comsg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

22-07-2019 Our Ref No
20-07-2019 Claim Type
SHD7250H Third Party Vehicle

250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1
JERLEEN TANG
BB619888/ 0 Fax No

. D18004771MFSH

. Third Party

. SMJ4854U

. 66619659

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

A, Fax No
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. BB416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

HUA HONG PRIVATE

Attention
LIMITED
MA, TP Solicitor Fax No
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is @ computer generated letter, no signature required.
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FLURBEAVE L, #01-25 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363560 FAX : (065} 62564313

Your Ref: D19004771MFSH Date: 11 Oct 2019
QOur Reft CS/FCI19012994/Evd3

The Motor Claims Departiment
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SMJ4854U

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 08/10/2019 at the premises of M/s HUA HONG PTE LTD. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S8  4.380.75
Revised Estimate Amount 8% 2.403.68
“Check™ Items Amount 1 S8 -
Market Value 1 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 88 -
Nett Value ' 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automotive Assessor



Yvonne Wnng (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, October 11, 2019 7:03 PM

To: "CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: "May Chua'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1200477 1MFSH/
Attachments: SMIAB54U DOA 20072019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMJ4854U
Date of survey : 08/10/2019
Number of days : 4 days

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consnltants Pte Ltd

Phome: 6256-3561 | email: ywonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 2:47 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004771M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange,

Best Regards

G.INIVITHA

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; pssignments@likauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BTk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 2:33 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004771MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Mote: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Repards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel ;: 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail,

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.ave.com




> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwner |D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

“ehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligihility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Catepory:

COE PeriodiYears):

P Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount;

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Oct 2019

Company
309mM

SMJ4854U

Ma

08 Oct 2019
HONDA
SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTO
Red

2018

LEB7104597
GP72003534
101.0 kW (135 bhp)
$23,244.00

07 Mar 2019

07 Mar 2019

0

$14,542.00

Yes
0& Mar 2029
£10,204.00

06 Mar 2029

B - Car above 1600cc or $7kW (130bhp)
10

£36,961.00

£34,776,00

$45,682.00

n
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Lty HHTPCLAIMS 19-128
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCELTD  / /|
36 ROBINSON RD, #16-01 =
CITY HOUSE g AL §v

SINGAPORE 088877
Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ4854U & SHD7250H ON 20/07/2019 ALONG BT PANJANG RING
RD AT ABOUT 1635 HOURS

Insured : HUA HONG PTE LTD
vehicle Registration No. ! SMJ4854U
Vehicle Make E HONDA
Vahicle Modal : SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTO
Vehicle Chassis No. f GP72003534
Policy No. - 5087272208-03
Date of Accident : 20/07/2019 Type of Clalm: Third Party
S/ Quantity Description . Unit Price 5§  Amount 5%
1 1 Rear Bumper X ! s 5 1,150.60
2 10 Rear BumperClip ~ ™ $ 380 5 39.00
3 1 RearTallgate /[ : $ 1,193.00
4 1  Rear Logo (SHUTTLE) .~ /X s % 55.00
5 1 Rearlogo (HYBRID) - /N | | $ 8010
$ 2517.70
Less 20% $  503.54
$ 2,014.16
B 1 Reverse Sensor X MM NETT $  200.00
7 1 Sealant  (|/C NETT S 40.00.—
To dismantle & change rear bumper, rear tallgate, knocking & pull straight rear $ BOD.0O i-’j 07
end panel and all area affected by accident
To perform wire checking $ 20.00/
To dismantle & refit rear windscreen $ ma.nu/
To dismantle & refit rear bumper sensar 3 60.00
To dismantle & transfer rear tailgate mechanism and fitting to new tailgate L 60.00 5S¢
To spray rear bumper, rear tailgate and rear panel $  B00.00 f, 77
! T% GST % 286.59
[ 9771 Total § 4,380.75
e R 4 ] '."}l-" n
- Authorisdd by Claims Dept |/ /|- e
wiedged by Repairar Co.Reg. No. 200900309M | hughongcomsg | G3TRed. Mo, 200700307M
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