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8 Kaki Bukit AVE 4

#05-25 Premier @KB
Singapore 415875

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4, #05-25 Premier @Kakl Bukit Singapore 415875

10 A1

Accident date. 18 07 2019
Eatimated repair cost for vehicle no. SKN2377X VOLVO S60 D213

il INIFS84ARE 2302359

sin aty Items/Nett Wiprice Amount
' 1 Frontbonnet P $2.786.00 &
2 ! Front head lamp - Om~l—¢ ¢ $1.842.00 »
3 1 Fromt head lamp r brackot- ped o $88.00 %
4 | Frontbumper D 3100800 /560,
] i Front bumper side bracket - $94.00 ~
6 1 tront Bumper inner sponge 3l o $317 004 y
7 4 Front bumper clips A 50 moo/
] 1 Front bumper center lower cover Pt phs $289.00 X
9 t  Front bumper log lamp- $245.00
10 1 Front bumper fog lamp cover f g $89.00 4
1" 1 Fronl bumper wiper cover- $105.00.F
12 1 Front bumper wiper motor $480.00
13 1 Front bumper wiper motor bracket Ak - '_u’::‘afz_'
14 1 Fronttender e d(d $4:350° 25
15 ! Front  fender cowling Jb( ~~ $257.00 ©
16 4 Fromt  ftender cowling clips o« $4.00 $16.00 4
17 1 Fromt  lower arm L $300.00 7
L) 1 From stabaliser bar v $1,106.00 ©
19 1 Front shock absorber *:V,_, $325.00
20 t  Front! knuckle arm $883.007
21 1 Fromt' . knuckle arm bearing $394.007
22 1 Rimd ifremt 4 w-#j';{-r’“—"
23 1 Tyre - fromt  p}f pie mnu){- .
Subtotal ;- $14,788.00
A<
SN-63D

NEE 8D



Sheet!

Labour charges

To Remove & Refix front undercarriage $380.00 A
To Roset computer $200.00
To check wheel alignment computer SW L
To Check Wiring System u’x L)
Tuff Kote $100.00.4
To Towing Fee $150.00 *

1o panetBesne O ot o

To Spray Painting -

Subtotal - $2.860.00

Total: - $17 648,00
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» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type Company
Cwner ID: B32G

Vehicle No SKNZ3TTX

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Jul 2019

Vehicle Makes: Voo

Vehicle Modal 560D2

Primary Colour: Sllver

Manufacturing Year 2013

Engine Na: D4142T2710323
Chassis Mo YW1FSB4ABE2302359
Maximum Pawer Output B4.0kW (112 bhp)
Dpen Market Value $32.298.00

Original Registration Date: 28 May 2014

First Registration Date 26 May 2014

Transfer Count

1
Actual ARF Paid: $22 21B.00
PARF Eligibility:

Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 25 May 2024
PARF Rebate Amount $15.552.00
COE Expiry Date 25 May 2024
COE Category A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Perlod[Years) 10
QP Paig $65,689.00
COE Rebate Amount £31.802.00
Total Rebate Amaunt; 547 354.00

Thet information contained herein is correct a5 at 22 Jul 201%

OK



aMa2019 Menmean e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with

*SKN2377X (05728392495G)
[SMASBO4E]

™
CARRO LEASING PTE. LTD.
Jul 1B 2019 9:00PM
[DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE, LTD.]
Green Forest Automoebile Pre Lid

["Reply | meply all | Mark as Unresd | Print Message || Delete Message | Forward |

From ALG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 10/09/2019 10:33 AM,
To LEK_HG

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$5550.45) - SKN2377X - Claim Handler: MdNoor, Norsiah

Approved:5550.45,

ID_GCI.IIHEHTE SUMMARY
There are no documents.

hitps:/isingapore. merimen comiclaimsfindex.cfm usebox=SVCmalibluseaction=dsp_viewdmode=1alinboxid=1546641&iDomainld=114I0bjld=8... 172




Jia Le !LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 11:33 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <sMelkwan@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKN2377X & SMASB04E DOA 18.07.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Claim AIG .

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , video camera , LOA , invoice & Ita fee .
Please advise OIC & Claim number .

As request following :

1. RC § 5243 /- | 54900 + 7% GST )-AS AGREED

2. Loss of use $600 ( Volvo luxury car ) x 6 days -4 day recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 day
weekend )

3. ltafee $7.45

@ 100 % ( cut lane case with video )
Total $5850.45

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214

N’é Virus-free. www. avg.com



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Maonday, 5 August 2019 12:25 PM

To: osman.affan@daimler.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA S804E AND SKN 2377X ALONG/AT TPE TOWARDS

CHANGI NEAR OPPOSITE IKEA ON 18/07/2019

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19012936/Adb3

05 AUGUST 2019

DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTELTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 5804E AND SKN 2377X ALONG/AT TPE TOWARDS CHANGI NEAR OPPOSITE IKEA ON
18/07/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKN 2377X against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as your
vehicle changed lane and resulted the accident. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5702 | email: Jisle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

Card LoaSines Mg | 4d

- -~ “of —t —

Sk L stF X
. owner of -

I'We,

hereby

suthorize Green Forest Automobile Pre Lud, (“The Workshop™) to act for uw’ui;?’u‘l;. respect to my four
claim for the repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my/our vehicle _ Mo/

that was, . { ts the peci - _ on (7T )'-})’ 14 al
olp K " — I,r ArQ | pef pett) h{i {ﬂm:m vehicle number
Sk ST ol J I |

I'We further authorize the Workshop 1o settle my/our above mentioned ¢laim in a manner that they deem
fit and The Workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my/our claim with
payment cheque being made in favor of Green Forest Automobile Pre Ltd.

'I'I'ne-mﬂmmmWurkshnpmnm:hmmﬁmbchnlfisonwtﬂmmprduﬁumdwﬂhmn
admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfownerfinsurers of the ather vehicle/s is concerned.

Pursuant to Personal Data Protection Act 2012, I'We hereby lgmethliﬁt%'wuhpmydiuhmur
shmm:.rmnmmmmemmﬁmwmmwmmmum
10 cooperate, interact or work in one wnyarmhuinmingmurmain;mqum

lfﬂwnrﬂnbl:tnremmﬁdlmurﬂfurﬂ:mpdrm&umﬂlethi:dler'! Insurance Company
in 6 (six) months’ time Emminvoi;udue.ﬁmnFurﬂlﬁmmnbthuudshli bill o yowyour
Cumpm:rt'orﬂwhnhnm'ﬁlllmmmuufﬂrmpuirmﬂt'i’uhhpwi!lﬂmemilmwimw
notice if we are unable to recover within 2 years.

—

IWe understand the above mluu&mbyﬂrwnm

Automobile Pte Ltd.

=
Claimant il uTe ]
(Company s stamp for company vehicle) Green Forest Automobile Pie Ltd



RELEASE YOUCHER
(AIG Asia Ppcific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We'l. GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE FTE LTD (“the workihop™) hereby confirm that we'l
heve resched an agreemont with the appommted purveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Immmnce Pre Lid
LEK AUTD CONSULTANTS FTE LTD (nsme of sarveyor) with respect to the smouns clammed
for S55.500.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle oo SKN JITTX thar was damaged porsuant o the
ccident which occurred on |KDT019 (date) slong SLIP KD TO TPE (CHANGI AIRPORT)
AFTER TAMPINES involving vehicle no's SMA SSOE,

This is puarsusnt to the inspection conducted on JLOT2019 (dete) o “the workabop™

W'l confirm that we/l are/am suthorized by the owner CARROQ LEASING PTE LTD (“the third
party clazmani™) of vehicle no. SKN JITTX maks the clazm ae set out m the sbove paragraph and
wefl have full sushority 1o settle the master on hisher bebalf i & manner tha: we'l deem fit. Wel
enclose herein the letier of suthority grven by “the third party claiman™

lows ancior expense tha they will or have already incurred in the cvent that “the thind party
claimant™ afler the shove mid agroement lodges a further claim againa the former for any loss and
expotses suffered pertamung o cons of repars andior resmal andior loss of use puriuant 1o the
damage o SKN LITTX |vehicle no. ) as & result of the sccident.

W'l confirm that the agrosment rmached above is in fall and final seniement of sy claim of “the
third party clumant™ parssamt o the sccident snd that frther this settlemens {i resched on &
without peejudice med without sdmision of lability hasis

This agresment s whject o the spplcation of Singapore law and the Singapore Courn have
exclusive jensdicnos over aoy dispute srsing out of the seme

ik o
Duindthin 16" (duy)or__SEC  (omcmit) 2015 yeur)

\\ ") 1w .
Signed by appouted surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)




2017

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

8§ Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

INVOICE

CARRO LEASING PTELTD . Date: 31" JULY 19
8 Kakl Bukit Avenue 4 GST Reg.No: 201723238H
#05-25 Premier (@ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Accident date:18™ JULY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SKN2377TX VOLVO S60 1.6A 13

Descriptions

ump Sum repair cost as recommended by
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
Surveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

S/ DLRS : FIVE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED FORTY THREE ONLY

Page 394



Land Transport Authority

Land Transpart Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0008528-2

Recsipl Mo - ITNET-00000-180720-000937
Previous Receipt Mo. ©
Ristinte Transbcion Red .
No.

Resull of Insurance Enquiry - SMAS804E
As a1 18 Jul 201821:30:00

Tax Involoa/Receipt

Insurance Co: ANG ASIA PACIFIC INSURAMNCE PTE. LTD

1 Insurance Enguiry - SMASB04E
Enquiry Fee
2018072013181 2367765

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding

Total Amount Payable
Paid By

Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amouni

Excess Refundahle Amount

Print Date/Timse :
Receipt Dawe/Time

g

GST
(s%)

048

048
049

20 Jul 2018 / 13:18:07
20 Jul 2018 7 131807

GST
(5%)

T4

T48

T 45




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Repart)

Fastlane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING n
Case | Notifen Est Submitted Assignad Ad] Rt 4] Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Siatus
‘ iy |23 i 2019 i $54,900.00 | 5$4,900.00 "'""".“m far Ruvewy

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster] |
Insured: DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD., Co. fng Mo 1998037782
Main .
B ant. | CARRO LEASING PTE.LTD., Co. Reg. No.: 2018258326
Wehicle Reg, L lisjor2019 21400 - 159
No.: SKN2377X Date of Loss: | gy wonths and 23 Days From LTA Beg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP / 05728392495G Policy/Cover | 09994155 (Comprehensive)
Yehicie Reg.
o, SMASBOME Paliey No. | gs0361547
(Insursd)! [mm"
| Excoss:

I Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd (Kaki Bukit) B Kaki Bukit Avenus 4, #05-25,, Premier@Kaki Bukit, 415875 Kaki Bukit - Tef:
Repalier: | pypasa83

ling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, [Express) - Tel: 65-841%- 3000 ... [Handied &y MdNoor, Morsiah] Norsiah, Mdfoonag. com l
{

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel |
‘Adyuster. |LKX Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 62561561 _ [Handied by ADRIAN LING] . [Final Rpt due 01/08/2019] ]

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Campose Case Mo |
i « AIG_SG_EXPRESS (10/09/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (535550.45) - SKN1377X - Clalm Handler: MdNoor, Nor...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Sesrch Tasks | Create Mew Task | cCompiste |

Due Date  Priority  Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dona?
Mo results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 2/10/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SKN23I77X (05728392495G)
[SMASBD4E]
™
CARRO LEASING PTE. LTD.
Jul 1B 2019 9:00PM
[DATMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.]
Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd

Upiosd Documants |  Upioed Bhotos |  Compass wew Lemer | upioed viass | [y | View [ w Browser| >
Video liperpoge [~} W |
Mo | Finalized On LK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HG) Thumbmnail | Print
|t |20/08/1915:41 | Video - Accident (TP) [ BT
‘Letters/Correspondances [1perpage [v] WA
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) | Thumbinall | Print
1 ||Draft] Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Broakdown | Em
Assessment Reports m &
Mo | Finakoed On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HG) Thumbnall Print
1 |25/00/19 1550 | Adjuster Immediate Advice O | Load Hiw
Phatos/Images s
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |31/07/19 10:01 | General View 0 | aawc | B
2 |3vorrie 10 Ganeral View 0 | dire |
1 |307/1810:01 | Ganaral View load 10G | A
4 (3107719 10:01 | Ganarsl View | leadivc | &
5 |307/19 10001 | Genarsl View 0 | tsaars |
6 |31/07/15 10:01 | General View 0| wades | &
7 |ayorie 1001 | General View O wave | 2
8 |30/07/19 10:01 | General View 0| sarc |
§  |3/0719 10:01 | General View 0 | Load s | B
10 |31/07/19 10:01 | General View 0| aws | A
11 |3/07/15 10:01 | General View 0| wawre | &
12 |34/07/19 10:01 | General View 0B omrs | A
13 | 31407710 10:01 General View D drc | A
14 |31/07/19 10:01 | General View 0| wawc | B
15 |31/07/19 10:01 | Genersl View 0| baars | A
16 |307/1%10:01 | General View 0| waws | B
17 |3u07/1e 1001 | General View | warwc | A
18 |33/07/19 10:01 General View D | oades | &
15 |31/07/19 10:01 | Genersl View Q| v | D
20 |31/071910:01 | General View 0| adirs | @
21 {30719 10:01 | General View 0| weerc | A
22 3071910101 | Genaral View @ | roadws | B
23 [34/07/10 10:01 | General View 0| wdirc | &
24 |31/07/19 10:01 | Reinspection Phote 0! cwiwrc |
25 |31/0719 10001 | Reinspection Photo 0O s | H
26 [31/07/19 1001 | Reinspection Photo O | xiic | B
27 |31/07/19 10:01 | Reinspection Fhoto 8| dc | M
Documentation ] per «|| &
Ne |Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lisd (HQ) Thumbnail Brint
23/07/1210:23 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | lesdroF
1 |2000m/19 15:45  |LOD Load PDF
{3 |29/08/19 15:45 | LTA SEARCH ] Lend POF
4 |29/0B/19 15:57 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 2/10/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 01 2

Video 1 ~]| A
hig | Finakz=d On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
5 |02/10/19 10:05 | WORKSHOP INVOICE . | @ | lesdPoF [ |
& |02/10/18 10:05 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM ) | Losd POF |
7 |02/10/15 10:05 Reolesse Voucher Load POF |
B |02/10/15 10:05 | LETTER TO OI t& Load POF |

No | Fimalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Fte. Ltd. {5G) Thumibinall | Print
1 |24/m7/1% 16:20 |01 GIA REPORT @ | Lood POF |

Documents Checklist

DOCLMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | bt |
There are ne document checklists canfigured _]
i

Remarks - LK Consultants Ltd {HG)

.M Remarks To: O wandiing Insurer

o REreleih AT provats weiess peu Ahow B 10 etfed [eriem.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 2/10/2019



Page | of |

Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| venhicie No: SMASB04E (Insd veh) Model: OLVO S60 1.6 D2 (A)
SKN23T7X (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 18/07/2019
Global Sum Settiement| [ [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate - 18,883.35
Final Repair Cost 4 §,500.00
Loss of Usa '§ 6.00 days at $50.00 per day
Rental (if any) % days
LTA / GIA Search Fee ' $
Others: : 3
1§
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) g 5,500.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindyindcale
below)

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Mo BOLA Scenario No

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Aszessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessad Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Green Forest Automobile Ple Lid 5 5,500.00
2) 5
3) 5
02 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)
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Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reg No:1ase0r188m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6258-3561 Fax: G844-B805 Email uur@lmm.m:mimmnts@}khum com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our File No: CCB/AIG19012936/ADB3Q2
Date: 021072018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid Policy No: 0869884155
Claimant )
Vehicle No : SKN23ITTX Insured Vehicle No : SMAS804E
Date of Loss: 18/07/2018 Mature of Claim. TP Claim No: 0572836824856
DES | M
Reg No: SKN23ITTX
Make & Model: VOLVO S60, 1.6 D2 (A) Engine No: D4162T2710323
Reg Date: 26/05/2014 (Man. Year 2013) Chassis No: YV1FS84ABE2302359
Colour: Silver Odomeler 0km
Engine Capacity: 1560 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (5%): Market Value/New Car Price
LE R
General Condifion: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION QF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235145 R1T Rear Tyre Size: 235145 R17
Front Lefl Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Left Side: Goodyear B mm
Fromi Right Side: Goodyear 6 mm Rear Right Side Goodyaar 6 mm
Tha sbove vailes reprosent the femainng fyre reads dapth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference Diff %)
Parts 14,788.00 4,938.50 984050  66.60
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.860.00 1,210.00 1,650.00 5769
Paintwork Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S8) 17,64B.00 6,148.50 11,499.50 65.16
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 4,900.00
(SS) 17,648.00 4,900.00 12,748.00 72.23
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 1,235.36 343.00 892 .36 72.23
Nett Amount (5§) 18,863.36 5,243.00 13,640.36 72.23
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x 5$550.00/day) (535) 300.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 745
Nett Liability (55) 5,550.45
Global Sum Settlement (55) 5,500.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 22/07r2019
Date Inspected: 22/07/2019 Inspected At

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd (Kaki

Bukit)

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25,,

Premier@HKaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ind ex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 2/10/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE: This mpart represents our findings af the time abd place of ingpection stated hersin. Such ingpection has been camed ol io fhe best of our
knowledge and ability bt any other labilly under any olfer circumstances is hemeby expressly sxciuded.
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Adjuster Report Page 3o 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BONNET Repair 2,786.00F *-FN
2 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP Cracked 1.842.00F *1,B4200FN
3 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET Not Necessary 8B.00F *-FN
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1,898.00F *1.580.00FN
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET Mecessary 94 DOF 04 00FN
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE Mot Mecessary 317.00F "
7T 4 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 34 00F *34.00FN
B 1 *FRONT BUMPER CENTER LOWER COVER Not Necessary 289.00F “~FN
a 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP Mot Necessary 24500F “FN
10 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER Mot Necessary B9.00F "
11 1 *FRONT EUMPER WIPER COVER Mot Necessary 105.00F -
12 1 *FRONT BUMPER WIPER MOTOR Mot Necessary 480,00 F “FN
13 1 *FRONT BUMPER WIPER MOTOR BRACKET Mot Necessary 240.00F .
14 1 *FRONT FENDER Dented 1,35000F =1,215.00FN
15 1 *FRONT FENDER COWLING Mot Mecessary 257 00F “FN
16 4 *FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIPS Not Necessary 16.00F “FN
17 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM Mot Necessary 300,00 F “-FN
18 1 *FRONT STABALISER BAR Not Necessary 1,106.00F - FN
19 1 *FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER Not Necessary 325.00F “-FN
20 1 *FRONT KNUCKLE ARM Mot Necessary 883.00F *~FN
21 1 *FRONT KNUCKLE ARM BEARING Not Necessary 384 .00 F *-FN
2 1 *‘RIM -FRONT Cut 900.00F5 "850.00FS
23 1 *TYRE -FRONT Mot Necessary 750.00F “-FN
FsFranchise part S=SpcNefl N=NettliemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 14,T28.00 5.415.00
- Nett Item Discount on N Iltems 0.00/10.00% (S5} 0.00 476.50
Total Parts (S$) 14,788.00 4,938.50

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuscaction=g... 2/10/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
There are no new miscellanecus items selecled.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer’'s Amount
Labour items
1 TO REMOVE & REFIX FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE New 380.00 0.00
2 TO RESET COMPUTER MNew 200.00 0.00
3 TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT COMPUTER New 150.00 80.00
4  TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM MNew B0.00 30.00
5 TUFF KOTE Mesw 100.00 0.00
& TOTOWING FEE MNew 150.00 0.00
7  TO PANEL BEATING New 800.00 500.00
B8  TO SPRAY PAINTING New 800.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 2,860.00 1.210.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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