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FINAL SETTLEMENT __ Duic/Time 301w [\8____ Confirm with_{ 7 © o Emal[ ] [
Final Liability % 100 {Agreed / Assessed) BOLA SN No. - 3 [IfNO or B 28, Ass Lia :
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Frepared By

Inthizan A/L Thurasasy

GET REG. NO . M2 - DD2008H1 - X 12 JUL 0%
ESTIMATE
Ewt imate Mo bl 52072 Fage Ho. 1 of 4 ]
Date Estimared 22/07/2019

- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR -
Ang Siok Kuwan Dominigque

8¢ Corporation Road
#15-09%

Singapore 649821

- ACCOQUNT - 121

AIG Asia Pacific Insuranca Fta. Ltd.
T8 Shenton Way

#0B-1€ Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

EEI N CHANRTS mO SEUN AT EITF L MILEAGE
SMEZODEN EB1%00% 26/09/2018 X7 sbhrivez20i 0
S—— ——
e,
lo rgrlice el Lsormpess med gftse = veents # 2-;1_] 1 IEI:I ¥
Pauritinig vear Gurmpes ﬁs*’ 18800 |
T cherch mimctrcal sering yyslerms ard lightage it the 1 s
roar pechion for propel unehion {ru Fﬁ’
Surcnes NV 7 wot .
Torsl La 157000
DESCRI FTI0N - ER1 PRl
TAILMIPE TRIM BHIGHT CHROME D=00LM . 1 118 08 ARLT:
BEAR BUMPER LH SIDE NNER SUIDE 7 il 1 A1 50 8180
HEAR HLMPER | SIDE (NNES Dariy 7 }“ 1 &% 50 B &0
MOUNTING SMART DPENER W { % 30 A& 30
REAR BUMPER TINWING EYE COVER FRmED ¥ v o 1 51 45 5148
REAR BUMPEHR PANEL PRIMED (M POCACA Jf“‘r“' 1 188D t I3 70 &
REAR BUMPER TRIM BOTTOM PANEL PAINT - Pt Al 1802 80 4
SET MOUNTING PDCPM SENSOR REAR 7 " ' o0 35 &0 35
HEAR LM REAR REFLECTOR ¥ ?f ' L5 iTs0
pE -5

#.‘-‘{o&'ﬁ"l(ﬁ' Nay
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Final Report

Estmate by b1 52072
Date Exzrmatod 221072019
Fropared By Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 121
Ang Siok Kuwan Dominique AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.
84 Corporation Road 78 Shenton Way
#15-00 #08-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120
Singapore 649821
REON. NO CHASSIS NO AEGN DATE MOOEL MILEACE
SME2996H EB19009 26/09/2018 X2 sDrive20i 1]
ACCOUNT
CESCRIPTION QRIGINAL PRICE OISC. % NETT
To tepiace et burmgs and sllachments 850,00 a #5000 -
To respnmy (B Durmpse 93400 d 93400
To chacs, slectnesl winng syaterms and lightvigs al the 150.00 i 150,00
iaa saction for prope function
Sundnes, B0.00 ] B80.00
DESCRIPTION LINIT PICE aty ISC, %% NETT
[ ]
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (M POCACA 1,185.70 1 0 1,985.70
REAR BUMPER THIM BOTTOM PANEL PAINT 1,602.60 1 1] 1.602.60
& EXPANDING RIVET BLACK  wet 1.35 10 o 1350
"
a
# S EMENTASY (TEMS
Total Laboes 201400
Total Parts 2801 B0
e — Tolal Rapal Costs less Facess 4A15R0
GS5T @719 3711
T wl 3 Grand Tolal 515291
L ey L
. — e CAR RENTAL SUPPLIED BY AIG

GlA SEARCH FEE - $2.00

52072 - SME2996H xlx, Page ! Finalised by: Sharen Heng DID: £3190123 Fax 64743229



Performance Muturs Limited
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Propared By

Supplementary
b1 52072
22/07/2019
Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
- ACCOUNT =~ 121

- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR -
Ang Siok Kuwan Dominique

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pto. Ltd.

B4 Corporation Road 78 Shenton Way
#15-09 #08-16 Chartis Bullding
Singapore 079120
Singapore 649821
REGHN. NO CHASSIS MO REGHN. DATE MODEL WMILEAGE
SME2996H EB19009 26/09/2010 X2 sDrive20i o
ACCOUNT:
CESCRIPTION ORIGINAL PRICE DISC % MNETT
DESCRIPTION UKIT PRICE QTY ISC. W NETT
] ’
& EXPANDING RIVET BLACK At/ 135 10 o 1350
& S AN TaRY (TTEMS
Total Labour
Totsl Party 1350
Toln Reppair Cosls ks Escosy 13.50
52072 - SME2996H.visx, Page 1 Fraligad by: Sharon Heng DID: 53190123 Fac 64743229



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 4:48 PM

To: PBSP

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: PAYMENT STATUS - DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SME2996H & SGT5576) ON 20/07/2019

==+ KK REF; CC3/A1G19012900/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

The above matter refers.

We confirm settlement as per your LOD/Payment breakdown for § 5,154.91(all in).
We will be proceeding to do the necessary.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on @ without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /[ Inferred fram this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by sither party that will materially affect/influence on the ssues of
liability/damages, either party ls not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | emaill: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 1:56 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: PAYMENT STATUS - DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SME2996H & SGT5576) ON 20/07/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G19012900/ka3

Dear Khanchna

What's the update now?

Thank you

Regards,
Caroline



Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941
DID: 6318 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 6:20 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Ce: WEB © <admin-a@|kkauto com>

Subject: RE: PAYMENT STATUS - DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SME2996H & 5GT5576) ON 20/07/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18012900/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Caroline,

We are pending mandate approval from our principal and will follow up and revert promptly.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 5:56 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <kbanchna@®@lkkauto.com=; C5 A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.cams

Subject: PAYMENT STATUS - DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SME2996H & SGT5576) ON 20/07/2019 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G19012900,/ ka3

Dear Khancha
Please advise status. You had finalized the case and our invoice issued on 2 September 2019,

Our invoice is now aging for more than 40 days. Please ensure that you seek mandate during finalization to
avoid unnecessary delay in payment.

Thank you

Regards,
Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limitad - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 158841
DID: 6318 0174 Fax 6478 4601

"This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments (“the Message"| is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime
Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify

2



the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all
liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious

software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily
represent those of Sime Darby's.”



10182018 Adjuster Immediate Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icores no1sssorions;
51 Liki Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408833
Tol 6256-3561 Fax 6844-B805 Email sur@ikkauto.com assignmentsi@ikkauto com

To - AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid

Altn : Chan, Kian-Meng

Your Raf TA3T1276B45G

Our Ref CCI/AIG19012900/R1KAT

Date 16 Oct 2019 "WITHOUT PREJUDICE™

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGT5576J & SME2996H ON 20/07/2019
Refer to the above accident.

The accident occurred when our Insured head 1o rear collided with Third party vehicle. We have clarified with the Ol on
the nature of the accidant and helshe is awara that his/her NCD wotlld be affecied.

On behalt of AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd., we have successfully | not successfully camied oul TP Express
Settlement batween your insured (vehicle no. SGT5576.) and third party claimant (vehicle no. SMEZ888H),

Summary of offer made 1o workshop Performance Motors Limiled |s as follows

Claimed Revised
Cost of Repairs (w/GST) § 921019 § 51529
Loss of Rental (W/GST)( 2
days x $120) $ 24000 § 240,00 | 2 days x $120) (w/GSTHBKW RENTAL)
LTA search lee - 200 § 2.00
Total § 945219 § 5384917
Amount of elaim al Liability 100% § 5384

Enclose herewith the relevant supporting documents for your perusal,
** 3 days recommendation for repair

For your approval please,

Regards.

Khanchna Paothuraj
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

hitpa:singapore menmen comiglaimsindex.cfm Husebox=5VCdocAluseaction=dsp_viewersmaninoimgviewer=14&fype=2&docid=44851282&co. 1"



Khanchna (LKK Autnz

From: Chan, Kian-Meng <Kianmeng.Chan1@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 4:19 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 73371276B45G-003 /7 SME2996H (TP) & SGT5576) on 20/07,/2018
Dear Khanchna,

Kindly settle at best up to 55411.71.

COR: $5152.91

LOR |BKW): $256.80
Search fee: $2.00
Total: 55,411.71

Best regards.

Chan Kian Meng

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid

AlG Building. T8 Shenton Way. #08-16. Singapore 072120
Tel +(B5) 6418 1678

KianMeng Chan1@aig.com | www.a1a.5g

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mallto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2019 1:15 PM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Ce: Admin A

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG ref: 73371276845G-003 // SME2996H (TP) & SGTS5576] on 20/07/2019

This message is Trom an external sender: be cautious with links and attachments,
Dear Mr. Chan Kian Meng,

The above matter refers.

We seek your mandate approval as third party is chasing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Exprasa

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case |Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Ag) Submitted | Lns Auth'ed Status
. . far
|70 2018 e $$4,015.80  5$4,815.80 m"' Survey
Lot Aeg edie Ad) Rpt | mmmmlr wiew Aot | Cancw Casa |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]

Insured, LAW CHENG TECK, 1D: 517794475
Main "
Clairmant DOMINIQUE ANG SIOK KUWAN, 1D: 5168805006
Wehicle Reg. . (20/07/2019 12:00 - :59
oo P |SME2996H Date of LoSS: |19 Menthy and 24 Days From LTA Reg Data (Man ¥r))
Claim Type: [TP / 733712768456 Folcr/Cover 2100016215 (Comprehensive)
Vehicle Reg, Policy No.
Mo  |sGTss76) Cetmmaary: | coos7Te?
(Insured):
Exvess:

Performance Mators Limited {Alexandra) 101 Alexandra Road, Sime Dacby Performance Centre, 153941 Mesandra - Tel:
Repairer: |y 90172/63190174
Handling AlG Agia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... |Handled by Chan, Kian-Meng]
Ingurer: Kinnmeng.Chan ] Siaig.com

F‘m' Libarty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) 6221 85611

Adjumter: LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 31/07/20149]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Man |

« MG SG_EXPRESS (20/11/2015): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$5411.71) - SME2Z986H - Claim Handier: Chan, Kian-...
* AIG_SG [11/07/2019): Re: Request for DI GIA Report
« AIG_SG (23/07/2019): Mo OT GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handlar Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
No resuits. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 27/11/2019



Mermmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

=SME2996H (73371276845G)
[SGT5576]]
TP
DOMINIQUE ANG SIOK KUWAN
Jul 20 2019 12:00PM
[LAW CHENG TECK]
Performance Motors Limited

Page 1 of 2

Upioad Docamants | ussesd mates |  Comoase wew vamer | upined viden | upisad Ause | View [View m Srowser| |
vides ipecpoge  [v]| BA
Mo | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |2z |i4e - Accdent © | Load Moy
Letters/Correspondences tperpage [~]
No | Finalizea Gn LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd (HGQ) Thumbsnall | Print
1 |(Dran) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Braskdown O e
Assessment Reports 1 per page .@ %3]
No_ | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 18/10/19 18:16 | Adjuster Immediste Advice € | Lead T
Ne | Finalized On AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (56) Thumbnall | Print
1 |31/07/19 08:03 wm:u a LAW CHENG TECK @ | Load HTM
Photos /Images 3 per page E_‘g_
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pts Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |16/10/12 18:37 | General View 0| weawe | A
2 |16/10/19 18127 Chassis Number 0| mcws | A
1 |1610/19 18:17 | General View 0| weaws | B
4 [1810/1918:17 | General View O dws | &
5 [1610/19 18:17 | General View 0| s | &
6 |16/10/19 18:17 General View 0| wwdwrc | A
7 |16/10719 18:7 General View g Laaa P | B
B |16/10/19 18:17 | General View B | wwws | 4
9 [16/10/19 18:17 | General View O edwes | A
10 |16/10/19 18117 | General View 0| leaaws | A
11 |16/10/19 18127 General View 0| dirc | A

|12 |se/10719 1827 General View Q| Loaaws | A
11 | 16/10/19 18:17 | General View 0| wews | &
14 |18/10/19 18117 General View 0 edwc | B

15 16710719 18:17 | General View Q| letirs | A

|16 |16/10/19 18117 Goneral View 0 wowe | A
17 | 16/10/19 18:17 | General View 0| dis | B
18 |16/10/19 16:17 | General View 0| edws | H
15 |16/10/19 18117 | Genaral View | s |
20 [16/10/19 18118 | Reinspection Photo O | sedies | @ |
71 |16/10/19 18118 | Reinspection Photo 0| sarc | A
22 |16/10/19 1818 | Reinspection Photo 0| wedwc |
73 |16/10/19 18:18 | Reinspection Photo 0| wwaws | B
24 |18/10/19 18:18 | Reinspection Phota Q| adws | 4
Doecumantation 1 per poge =] =]
No | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |22/07/1917:41 | TP ESTIMATE + DOCS = Load POF
2 |22/00/1917:41 | TP GLA REPORT Load POF
3 |07/08/19 11:30 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
4 |16/08/19 15:17 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
5 |02/10/19 16:39 |LETTER TO OT Load FOF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 27/11/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Video ippee V]| 8
Mo |Fnakzed On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
6 |D8/10/1915:27  |TPLOD ) | iosd POF

{7 | 27511719 0814 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

& |27/11/19 O6:14 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

9 |Z7/11/190B:14 | Release Voucher Load POF

10 | I7710/18 DB:14 LoD Load POF

11 | Z7411/18 DA:14 GIA SEARCH Lood PLF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | et |

Thare are no document checklists configured.

Our Checkilst Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Mandiing lnsurer
ke - BefAfis 8T BAAEE LTSS yeu thaw B By othee partes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 27/11/2019



Page 1 of |

Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[ vehicte No: SGT5576J (Insd veh) Model: BMW X2 2.0 SDRIVE20I LED
SME2936H (TP veh) NAV MSPTX (A)
| Date of Accident: | 20107/2019
Global Sum Settlement | : | | | Yes | 1x] No
Repair Estimate o 6,319.26
Final Repair Cost $ 5,152.91
Loss of Usa -8 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 25680 2 days
LTA | GIA Search Fea - 2.00
Others: & 0.00
'8
Final Settlement Sum - 541171
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ X ] YES [ ] ND (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)
LA licable: Yes/ Me- BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: E‘i? Applicatie e
BOLA Liability: 100 (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
11 | Performance Motors Limited 5 5,154.91
2) |BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Lid -5 258,80
3) 8
27 Nov
JOAMNNE LEE KHANG MIN ,ﬂ
LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid Dais

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation te Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill {If any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 27/11/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regne 1sssor1ssm
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408533

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emall sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/AIG18012900/R1KAIO2

Date: 271172018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy No: 21000168215
Claimant .
Vehicle No SME2996H Insured Vehicle No ;: SGTE57B)
Date of Loss: 20/0772019 Mature of Clairm: TP Claim No: 733712768456
Ri MEI F |
Reg No: SME2996H
Make & Model: BMW X2, 2.0 SDrive20i LED NAV MSPTX (A} Engine No! F598HB50B4BA20F
Reg. Date: 26/09/2018 (Man. Year. 2018) Chassis No WEBAYH32010EB18008
Caolour: Black Cdomeler 17464 km
Engine Capacity: 1988 cc
Market Value/MNew Car NIA
Price:
Surm Insured (5%5). Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45 R19
Front Left Side; Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestona 6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The sbove valums represent the remamng fyre eads degih
/COST OF CLAIMS Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference Diff %)
Parts 3,315.85 2,881.80 43405 13.09
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.580.00 1.934.00 65600 2533
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total [S5) 5,805.85 4,815.80 1,090.05 18.46
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 41341 3T 7630 1846
Nett Amount (S§) 6,319.26 5,152.91 1,166.35 18.46
+ Car Rental (2.0 x $5120.00/day + 7.00% GST) (S§) 256.80
+ Doc/Search Fee (S$) 2.00
Natt Liability (S5) 541171
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 05/08/2019
Date Inspected: 05/08/2019 Inspacted Al Performance Molors Limited
(Alexandra)
303 Alexandra Road, Sime Darby
Performance Centre
Singapore 159841
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This report represanis our findihgs al the time and place of inspaction stated hersin. Such inspection has bean carmed ouf fo the besl of our
krwledge and ability but any other labililty under amy ofber circumatances is heraby expressly exchaded,
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Conditien  Repalrer's Amount

1 1 *SUNDRIES Mecessary 80.00FS “E0.00FS
2 1 *TAILPIPE TRIM BRIGHT CHROME D=90MM Serviceable 116.05FS *.FS
I *REAR BUMPER LH SIDE INNER GUIDE Serviceable 61.50FS “FS
Bl 1 *REAR BUMPER LH SIDE INNER GUIDE Serviceable B81.50FS *FS
5 1 *MOUNTING SMART OPENER (M) Serviceable 45.30FS ~.FS
6 1 *REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER PRIMED  Serviceable 5145FS ~FS
7 1 *REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (M PDC/ICA) Deformed 1,18570FS *1,185.70FS
8 1 *REAR BUMPER TRIM BOTTOM PANEL PAINT Deformed 1,602 80FS *1,602.60FS
g 1 *SET MOUNTING PDC/PMA SENSOR REAR Serviceable 80.35FS “FS
0 1 *REAR LH REAR REFLECTOR Serviceable AT 90FS “~FS
1 10 *EXPANDING RIVET BLACK Necessary 13.50FS  *1350FS

F=Franchise part S=SpcMeil
Total Parts (S$) 3,315.85 2,881.80

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous ltems selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour llems
1 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER AND ATTACHMENTS MNow 1.375.00 B50.00
2 PAINTING REAR BUMPER MNew 1,038.00 83400
3 TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AND How 177.00 160,00

LIGHTINGS AT THE REAR SECTION FOR PROPER

FUNCTION

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2,590.00 1,934.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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