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51 URLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065} /2564315

Your Ref: D19004741MFSH Date: 03 Sep 2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19012859/Ky13

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __ SGZ837TH .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abnvementin_ned vehicle
on 29/08/2019 at the premises of M/s Poon Siang Seow. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 31.041.50 .
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 14.149.86 .
“Check” Items Amount h -
Market Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -
Nett Value : S% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s bodyv.

Fromd

Yours faithfully

Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



MS@ FirstCapital

B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4BSED
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (BS)6222 3547

Claims & Moty Undereiting Dagt: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Gty House Singapore 0BBETT

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6207 3849
werwmsfirsteapital comsg

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg we 1950001060 C5T Reg ho H2-DOOLETE-

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 19-07-2018 Our Ref No. D19004741MFSH
Accident Date 18-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHDB517H Third Party Vehicle. SGZ837H
Survey Location BLK 180 SIN MING DRIVE #05-13
Contact Person. ALBERT
Contact No. 64537511/ 96169634 Fax No. 64538046
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointed

Sy LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop POON SIANG SEOW Attention. NIL
Cec : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge HENRY KAO

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yvonne Wnnﬁ (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Waong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, October 10, 2019 3:52 PM

To: sitti1 @singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004741MFSH/1
Dear Albert

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed amount $9200.00 @ 5 working days,

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE
LTD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2019 1:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Henry Kao' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004741MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 22 July, 2019 1:02 PM




To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004741MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE Pg. 1

Mame of Policyholder  : TAN TENG KIAT Vehicle No. » SGZBITH
Period of Insurance : 01 Apr 2019 To 21 Mar 2020 Policy Mo. + 1800044756
Engine No. : 015046154834 204PT Endarsemant No. 2

Chassls No. : SALCAZAGIGHEZE2EE lssued Date : 12 Mar 2019

ABOUT THE COVER

Make/Model LANDROVER Dhscovery Sport 2.0P SE (57 seater)

Engine Capacity/Tonnage  1.987.00 CC Sum Ingured  Market Value Firat Wear of Registration : 2017 |
| DCnver Restriction N Off Peak Car = No Inguring with COE/PARF  * Yes |
| Person or Classes of Persons Entitied to Drive®

&) The Potoysgide:

il Any oinar person who ip dnving on e Palicyhoniers el o willh ST g T

Tray Poicy wll ngermndy e Poecybaidar o @y suldnaed dires! only F hedsthe mesis the spacbed age condisgn |
| *ouhave o pay an ecdEhona’ sum of 53000 48 egmeenoid Dme Eactas” (IR 7 Vi 8 of Yo Authofed Dfiser (Ml o unindmed) bas st han 2 yesry’ diving expenencs
|
| Age Condition 40 years oid and above

Limitation &s 1o use® |

ik Oy iDF $o0al, Snme o and pleasurs puposes ang for e Polcyhciders huuneis |

Ths Py fdbed Aol coves ulb fof hine oF Rewiet dineng UBon, dising sl roong, pace-mang, rEubdEy Wl or seed-teiting, Pe camasge of QoS o (hin aTEES in COMMBEEES will Iy IRfe o |

ik P2 OF et RO BT DutDOSE W COnnecton wish Kiolor Trace
[ Loss of Uss 2000cc |
| = Lomitwioas renderrd inoperatiee by Saciion A of the koins WVehicies [Thes-Party Riaks and Comperadtion] &t (Cap. 9605 and Seckon 95 of the Rosd Transport Bci TRE7 (Malwysia) & 521 1o be
| inchuded under thisd Matngs :

Saciion 1
Fira - 50 Own Damage - §900 The® - §0 Ficod Cower - 30

Section 2
Prepaerty Damage - $0

Windscreen 1 §100

Named Drivar and Excass weere srpicanie;

TAN TEMG KIAT - $900 {Own Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS

1 Waarnes Aulomotv Pie L8 Agd® 45 Leng Hee Road Sgapors TS0 83789550

Forother Appeoes Reporing Certreell Aunodaad Fepmmn poase coract var 24-hour scodent emengency holine st &8 500 6200 Alemativily, you Iy nEier 50 A15 walsds ws g com 5y
(F AN S0T RAIDGE M) Semply MemeTh mn downdoss TAIG BG° fom (Tunes o Geagse ey

IMPORTANT NOTES

| Hire Purchase Company/Emplayer's Loan: OVERSEA-CHINESE BANKING CORPN LTD

W% henaby corMy Lhal he policy o which This Cariicane of insuninch sHEnes i§ (EUSE i Aooniance wilh Par prowisions of Me Soer ' shiciesThed Party Risks and Compensaimn} &ct {Cac 108), B v s
T Moad Trakasen acl, 1987 (Mawysia) and Mpor Vehioes {Thind Party Riss) Reles, 1959 {(Malaysa)

503486111

WEARMES AUTO-JAGEENTLEYLA 3‘\£//‘

45 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPDRE 153103
Linderwrittan by &G Asia Pacific Inturance Phe. Lid,

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AUTHORSED REPRESENTATIVE

Py
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

lofl

> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 10

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;

Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Singapore NRIC
AF4E

SGZEATH

Yes

20 Jul 201%
LAMD ROVER

DISCOVERY SPORT 2.0 514 5E
75TR

Brown

2016
015046154834204PT
SALCAZAGIGHAZT254
177.0%W (237 bhp)
$45,695.00

31 Mar 2017

31 Mar 2017

0

$55,973.00

Yes
30 Mar 2027
$41,972.00

30 Mar 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW
{130bhp)

10

554,000.00

$41,545.00

$83,524.00

The infarmation contained hereinis correct as at 19 Jul 2019

htps://vrl lta.g

OK
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POON SIANG SEOW

Sin Ming Autocity, No, 160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-13, Singapore 575722.
Tel- 6453 7511 Fax: 6453 8046 Email: sittii@singnet.com.sg Regn. No. 05396600K

ey Aﬂém‘v
Lthy 8 72 o

Tan Teng Kiat
19 Cotswold Close /4, /f'ﬁﬂp
Singapore 359617 Foesiy /f:n,?
&

Dear sir / 4 ﬁw ..5— ;,-,/‘?7
Estimate cost of repair to vehicle no. SGZ 837H ey
To supply

1. Frontdoor mirror 3026 P (&g 390680 —

2. Front leftfender /P F5 47 189580 —

3. Front fender garish Pyt 78000 —

4. Front head lamp fo- &4 598280 —

5. Front bumper #T 3,60560 X

6. Front door M 588050 ¥

7. Rear door A 540000 ¥

8. Rear door garish &7 65000 —/

9. Rear fender garish / . { fir 55000 —
Labour charges
Rust proofing 10000 Fel
Panel beating 1,20000 FS5et
Spray painting 1,000.00 6’.%(

Total
2\oh So
(/i,‘

Your faithfully

() $ALcqInciaH 62925¢

r"'.—"f} 1 Ve
e -

ALBERT POON



i VU LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FC119012859/Kyf3n2
#96.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Belta: “HENRON lemmmumm
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 8517H Veh. Inspected SGZ 83TH
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004741MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD Assign Date 22/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model LAND ROVER DISCOVERY (A) |c.c 1999
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. SALCAZAGIGHE29256 Colour METALLIC LIGHT BROWN
Odometer 24702 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/60 R18 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/60 R18 PIRELLI 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/60 R18 PIRELLI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/60 R18 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  18/07/2018 Inspection Date 29/08/2019
Survey held at POON SIANG SEOW
Mo 160 SIN MING DRIVE
#05-13 SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS COMDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE ma 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-09607108-R Page Mo.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGZ 837TH

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ cstmare By {51]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOOR MIRROR DENTED / CUT 3,996.80 3,026.00
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER BENT 1,885.80 1.775.00
1|FRONT FENMDER GARNISH SCRATCHED T80.00 TEQ.00
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP cuT 5,982.80 4.180.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 3,605.60 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 5.880.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 5.400.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR GARMISH cuT 650.00 650.00
1|REAR FENDER GARNISH cuT 550.00 550.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -1,086.10
28,741.50 9.864.90
LABOUR
RUST PROOFING, 100.00 30.00
PAMNEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,200.00 750,00
BUMPER,FRONT DOOR AND REAR DOOR.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 900.00
2,300.00 1,680.00
GRAMND TOTAL 31,041.50 11,544 90
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 9,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18012859/Kyfan2

Y 454

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Roport is made sololy for the use and benefit of ths Clhent namad on tha front page of this Report.

third party wiho may reoly on the Beport wholly or in parl. Any thicd pact




