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SMK | Automotive JOTVICE e L

FAX Humber EIGASEE]
Ealmatar T oegpnong Murmnbe GRAR RS

Apcidant Repomng Humbes EABEZET

SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates

Section A - To be completed by claims Advisor/Duty officer at Accident Reporting Centre

Reg No SHBS@18P

Ref No TAX/OB/MTI20TE

Reg Dale 05/08/2013

vehicle Type TAXI - — ~

Make CHEVROLET EPICA 2.0 VCDI

Mode EPICA-20

name of Drivar VINCENT LIM CHENG '-": g
CHUAN 4

Type of Accident SIDE SWIPE ’ e

Date ! Time of Accident 14082017 10:30.00 AM

Accident Reported Date / Tima ~ 14/08/2017 12:00 00 AM

Surveyor is Reguired? Yes ° ' o

Survay by -
Vehicie is Towed Back? No

Towed Back Date/Time

Replacement Vehicle issued? No

Acciaent Repair Job Card No 0000240691473

special instruchion to ARG &l‘ly

SIEBBSET [ﬂrﬂ"f ey 4 Y f!’fhf

Prepared Date 14/08/2017 10.56:51 AM

AX/08/1772079 Page: 1




Section B - To be Completed by service Advisor, Accident Rapair Centre

fhassis No KL1LAGSRJBE 134878 Mieage 0
Wiark Shop Repai Compieted Date / Time
Sammary of Repair Estimates
Quotation from ARC Ad|usted by Surveyor, it applicable
Total Labout Charges 507 00 000
Total Spray Painting Charges 75600 000
Tatal Matenal Charges 267290 2672890
Otner Charges 4B0.00 ao0
TOTAL ¢ 4,395.80 0.00
Lum Sum Total : 4,400.00 0.00

No of Repait Days 4.00 MGLF"Q,.,'O..W

Prepared / Adjusted By
Arc | Surveyor Sing Off Date 14/08/2017 04 05 24 PFM 01/01/1900 1200 00 AM

el
[5’}631'-1 P{‘F‘?—‘U

Prepared / Adjusted Date
Remarks

Prepared Date 14/08/2017 04.06 24 PM

Section C - To be Completed by Admin Assistant. Accident Repair Centre, Upon Completion of Repair

Quaotation No Invyoice Na
Quotation Dale Invoice Date
Invoice Amount Prepared Data

TAX/0B/17/2079 Page: ]



section D - Details of Ropair Estimates
Part 1 - Labour Works

Job Scope

Quctalion from ARC

Adjusted Dy Surveyor if applicable

TD REPAIR RH FRONT PORTION

507 00

0 00 Fro

Total Labour

507.00

0.00

Pan 2 - Spray Painting & Panel Beating Related Works

Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable

Job Scope Quetation from ARC

TO RESPRAY FRONT FENDER RH 378.00 0.00 Jero
TD REPSRAY FRONT BUMPER 37800 .00 oV
Total Spray Painting & Panel Beating 756.00 0.00

Part 1 - Other Costs - Accident and Accident Repair Related Expenses

Job Scope Quotation from ARC Adjusted by Surveyor. it applicable
"0 CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION  [80.00 0.00 To

10 APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED 100 00 000

AREA Lo

TO DO WHEEL ALIGNMENT / TYRE BALANCING |12000 0.00 (o

TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS 100 00 0.00 20

TD WASH AND VACUUM EO 0O 000 Lo

Total Other Costs 460.00 0.00

TAX/0BI17/2079

Page: 3




Part 4 - Spare Parts | Material Usage

Part Portion | Stock No Part Name Qty List Price | Drscount | Final Price ARC Surveycr | Photos |
Numbar ] i) T iS) focommen| Approved Attached |
d
SRAIGIZB|RIGHT  |0504581 |PANEL FRT FENDER 1|606.00 1000 |54540 Replace |Replace |No
RH ot~
SPAAI040|RIGHT  |6504585  |LINER FENDER FRT 1[12400 1000 |80 Reploce  |Bopw@e” |No
AM | PROTECTOR | &
COMMOD |6503708 |TYRE 112674 000 126 74 Replace Na
N
COMMO |6504868 |TYRE RIM 1]328.99 000 3268 99 Aeplace No
N =
53744480 |[FRONT |BSDE5HZ BUMPER FRT ASSY 1|1 238.00 10.00 111420 |Replace Rm% Ao
TOTAL MATERIALS 2,226.93(2,226.83
TOTAL MATERIALS(Discounted) 2,672.90(2,672.80
Added Spare Parts | Material Usage After Surveyor Signed off
~ Pan Paortion Part Name Oty | Ust Price | Dincount Final Price | ARC Check | Surveyor T |
Number (5 ") {$) Check | Check
l TOTAL SUPPLEMENTARY MATERIALS
TAYINRMTIZNTG

Page:

4



Shu Pei SLI{]{Autn!

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 2:41 PM

To: Admin A; Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & |1A/Tans/Claims)

Cc CS A Team

Subject: [AIG]: FINAL / LAST ATTEMPT  Re: Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P & SIE
6658T (AIG's insured) Our Ref TAX/08/17/2079/1g // LKK Ref:
CC3/AIG1T015894/R1yb3g2

Attachments: proof of settlement pdf

LEK Ref: CC3/AIG17015894/R1vb3a2

Without Prejudice
Thank you for your emall, Lee Gek We will check back with our Principal on this.

Admin Team - please

Bl Regonds
Olivia Loy | Adimir Manogie:

LEE Auto Cm‘-u“u"li
i
- (

Jodak)

phons: 2583540 | emoll glvlgloy @ik oyt com | b 4741-4108

Bk 51. Poyo Ubd indusinol Pork. Ubl Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Taxis) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 10:36 AM

To: C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; admin <admin@I|bs-auto.com>

Subject: FINAL / LAST ATTEMPT Re: Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P B SJE 6658T (AIG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/0B/17/2079/ Ig

URGENT
LAST ATTEMPT

Dear All,

Please note that your insured has commenced action and we have settled his claim at 50%. We attach the proof of
settlement for your perusal.

Breakdown of settlement as follows:-
Damages 52832.00
Costs (writ issued) $1400.00
Dishursements 594895



Total $5180.95

Please review the matter and let us know by 26™ July 2019 if your principal is prepared to consider settling our claim on
a reciprocal basis otherwise we will pursue our claim accordingly. Thanks.

Reégards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 4866 2647)
aims Department

ive Services Pte Ltad

S SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

SMET Aytam




Jia Le (LKK Auto) e

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 11:26 AM

To: Jia Le {LKK Auto)

Subject: Your ref: 4629275097SG-003 Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P & SJE

BESET (AIG's insured)

Dear Jia Le,
We have re-opened the matter, please proceed with settlement at 50%.

Prior to that, please engage insured as a matter of courtesy & inform him that we do not have a strong basis to
maintain rejection when he has accepted 50% of his counterclaim against TP.

Kind Regards,
Sallha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1917 |
www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any coples or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising In any way from its use.

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Sunday, August 4, 2019 11:17 PM

To: lia Le (LEK Auto) <liaLe@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff @aig.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 46292750975G-003 Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P & SJE 6658T (AIG's insured)

Hi Jia Le

Apologies on the late response.



Matter been reassigned to Saliha.
By copy Saliha: FYNA on Jia Le’s email below.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Litd

78 Shenton Way #0B-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 4:21 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your ref: 46292750975G Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P & SJE 6658T (AIG's
insured)

This message is from an external sender: be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Bennle,
Kindly assist forward the case to respective handler as third party would like to settle the claim at 50%.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Taxis) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 10:36 AM

To: C5 A Team; admin
Subject: FINAL / LAST ATTEMPT Re: Accident on 13/8/2017 involving SHB 5918P & SJE 6658T (AIG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/08/17/2079/1g

URGENT
LAST ATTEMPT

Dear All,

Please note that your insured has commenced action and we have settled his claim at 50%. We attach the proof of
settlement for your perusal,

Breakdown of settlement as follows:-
Damages S$2832.00
Costs (writ Issued) $1400.00



Disbursements $948.95
Total $5180.95

Please review the matter and let us know by 26™ July 2019 if your principal is prepared to consider settling our claim
on a reciprocal basis otherwise we will pursue our claim accordingly. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte L1d

& SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply"” command and permanently delete the onginal and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)

Subject: FW; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHE 591BP & SIE 6658T {AIG INSURED) ON 13,/08/2017
(Our Ref: TAX/08/17/2079/1q)
Attachments: 08 17 2079.pdf

From: Tan Lee Gek (Autn Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims B [A/Taxis/Claims)

Sent: 14/11/2017 10:12

To: Jas Khine (LKK Auto)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 5918P & SJE 6658T (AIG INSURED) ON 13/08/2017 (Our Ref:
TAX/08/17/2079/1g)

Dear Jas,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of repairs 52450.00
(}'rs!- of rental S 369.15 (573.83 x 5 days)
“Loss of income S 300.00 (560,00 x 5 days)
LTA search fee S 500
5312415
S re——=a

We attach the proof of rental, repair bill, laid-up report, GIA report of our taxi and LTA search for your perusal.

Please review the matter as the traffic light is In favour of our driver and let us know if you are prepared to consider
settling our claim. Thanks.

Regards

Ton Lee Gek (DID: 6B66 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid

S SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE



Jas Khine {l.I{KAutn!

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 August. 2017 2207 PM

To: 'DQW1980@HOTMAILCOM'’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 6658T & SHB 5918P ALONG/AT JUNCTION OF

TAMPINES AVE 4 & TAMPINES AVE 7 ON 13/08/2017

OUR REF: CC3/AIG17015894/R1yb3
24 AUGUST 2017

DING QIAN WEI

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 6658T & SHB 5918P ALONG/AT JUNCTION OF TAMPINES AVE 4 & TAMPINES AVE 7 ON
13/08/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

if you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 03/09/2017, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against
the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

This also refers to our tele-conversation earlier.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Thank you.

Bt Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone 6841-2028 | email! jaskhine@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
tilk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408943)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
Al ia Pacific - Express Third P laim

|, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimanmt™) of _HBLK 60 WOODLANDS

INDUSTRIAL PARK Ed (§) 757708 (address), owner of SHB S918P (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no
SHB 5918P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which ocourred on 13/082017 (date) along
TAMPINES AVE 4 (location) involving vehicle no/s SJE 6658T (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concemed.

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim

“We/l, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES FTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that
we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (namg of gurveyor) with respect to the amount ¢laimed
for $$1.225.00 (Repair Cost), $3309.58 (Loss of tse/Rental), $85.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle
no. SHB 5918P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 13/08/2017 (date)

along TAMPINES AVE 4 (location) involving vehicle no/s SJE 6658T. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 15/08/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no, SHB 5918P make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SHB 5918P (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this S (day) of (month) 204 _ (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

== This Discharpe Voucher appiies ony 1o fhe clsmanty. clam
o hiw property damage and will nol sfiect his peroasl
inpurien claim angice uninsuned oaes Claim in 3 laler Gale.

Further, the safiermsnt teemy hermn shoukd ol be used
AN eniEnCE 10 PreRsice 0 e Clamants personal jumes
chmirm mnedlor olher uninsured iaes claim Jisag af the
wubisect matier in i action.




&5 SMRT

BAT Automotive Earvices Pte Letd
251 Worth Bridge Road Singspere 175102
Tal: 65 E3X11000 Fax: 3 EI40247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Heg No. ¢ ME-8500001-7
CRN + 1950042802
SMAT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice Ho. IvV171100032
Date : 01.11.2017
Block fUnit Vehicle No. : SHBS918F
Your Ref Wo. : TRAX/08/17/2078
60 WOOOLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Our Ref No. 24091473
SINGAPORE 157705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Qty nit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cast L Amount
LUMP S5UM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 -] 2,450.00

AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENMOATION

O

Remark -

Hake /Modeal ¢! CHEVROLET EPICA 2.0
Aoocideant Date : 13.08.2017

%.B. Paymant by cheque should be crosssd mnd

mace payable to 'EMET Automotive Sercvicss Pte Ltd'.
o receipt will be lssusd unless requested.

Page 1/1

GRAND TOTAL 3 2,450.00

>

= __J ~
Authorised S{gnature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & 0.E




-@smnr

Our Ref : TAX/08/1722079/L.G

Date : 24/08/2017
To : Claims Department
From : SMRT Taxis P18 U1y

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB5918P & SJE6658T ON 13/08/2017 ALONG TAMPINES AVE
4

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHB5918P is $73.83/day.

Kindly proceed 1o recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this accident.
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‘ Enquire Transaction History TAX/08/17/2079 SHB5918P
Transaction History Details

Log Date/Time
Aszel Type
Azsal 1D
Transaction Type
Usar ID:

Search Date [ Time:
Insurance Company:

15 Aug 2017 | 09:02°27

‘Vehicle Transaction Amount! $5.35

SJEBSSET

18.32 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO Paymant) Channel Extermal Agency
ESASBAHO - BALOISH BINTE ABDUL  Business Transaclion 2017081509022T505648
HALIL Raference Mo

13 Aug 2017 10:30:00
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

Information displayed ls comect es at the log date and lime.

| Enquire Related Lngs || | Back 1o List,|

Ll Trannspeot l&\ulluny
Plegse read through the Privacy Sistement. Terms of Use and Disciaimer.

Please do nof use the Back of Forwand butlons on your browser as this may aller the resulls of the ansaclions.

Bl viewed wilh |E § 0 573 and above 1024 X TES resciuton
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Menmen ¢-Claims

Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

_AIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _
Case | Natified [Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed TStatus
v | 16 Aua 2017 ;g:';‘&‘" 017 $$2,450.00 S$2,450.00 lllﬂ‘ll eriing for Survey
Edit Reg con Adl ot | Edit Estimates | | view Rpt Conce Case: |

Referance

Claim Details

Insured:
Main
Clalmant:

Jemce e cups918P

| SMAT TAXIS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.! 198905369K

13/08/27017 10:00 - :59
[50 Months and 8 Days From LTA Reg Dak= {Man ¥r)]

1700009324

Date of Loss:

Policy/Cover
MNote MNo.:

Pelicy No.
| (Claimant):

- | Excess; -
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands} 60 Woodlands Industnal Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: SBE62628
AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel! 65-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Syed-Yusolf, Sallha] Saliha Sy=d-
Yusoffi@aig.com

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 62222311

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5255-3561 ... [Hundied by MOWD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 07/08/2019]
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

'+ AIG_SG_EXPRESS (05/08/2015): Report Send Back Alerts - SHBS918P (TP)

TP/ 46292750975G

SIEGGSBT C-17087562MFSH

view Al | Compose Case Mail |

view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | mmmﬂ
Subject  Handler Asgsigned By Completed On Created On Done?

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

Due Date  Priority  Type
| Mo results.

Task Group

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 5/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Upioad Documents | Ugtoad Photos | Compese New Letter | Upload Viden | Uplead ausio |

Claim Documents

*SHB5918P (462927509756G)
[SIE6658T)
™

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Aug 13 2017 10:00AM
[DING QIANWEI]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Video 1perpage  [v]|
Ne_|Finaiized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print |
1 |DS/08/17 14:51 01 Video 0 | oo MOV | _,i
Letters/Correspandences 1 perpage Lv]| A
[tz [Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print
L (Deal) Third Party Express Settiement - Paymant Breakdown 0| =
‘Photos/Images 3 per bage g [
Ne | Relabel/Reccdar | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |07/09/17 11:43 | Odomater Reading 0 | e | A
2 |0%/09/17 11:43 | Chassis Number O | aare B
(3 |07/09/17 11143 | General View © | Loaows | |
|'4 O7/09/17 11:43 | General View O s | A
s  low09s17 11:43 | General View D losrs | A
s |07/09/17 11:43 | General View ® | cwws B4
17 [07/09117 11:43 | Geners! View O sws | A
!I D7/00/17 11:43 | General View 0D | e |
@ |07/09/17 11:43 | Ganeral View O | esawc | A
(10 07/09/17 1143 | General View g Lood 7G| B4
;11 O7/09/17 11:43 | General View 0 | weaws | F
12 |07/09/17 11:40 | Genersl View O | sdws | M
11 0209/17 1141 | General View 0 cedws | A
14 O7/09/17 1143 | Genersl View D | e | B
15 070917 11143 | Genersl View 0 | Ladwc | BB
16 |07/09/17 11143 | General View 0 | leadiec | A
17 |07/09/17 11:41 | Geners! View O | aaws |
18 |07/09/17 11:43 | General View 0| owwws | B
19 |07/09/17 11:4 | General View D | loadiec | 4
20 (07/08/17 11143 | General View 0 | caaws | A
21 07/09/17 11:43 | General View D | waawc | A
27 [07/09/17 11143 General View D | adirc | A
(231 [07/09/17 1143 | General View D | eacirs |
24 |07/09/17 11:43 | General View D | cwsws | B
25 [07/09/17 11143 | General View D | wedws A
|26 |07/09/17 11:43 | General View O | i & |
|27 |07/09/17 11:43 | Rainspection Phata 0| wsaws | B
38 | 07/068/17 11:43 | Reinspection Photo O | waws |
19 |07/09/17 11:43 | Reinspection Photo 0 waaws | 4
30 |07/D9/17 11:43 Reinspection Photo - D | tesdws | A

hitps:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 5/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Video 1perpoge  |v] B4
No_|Finsized On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. [SG) Thumbnail | Print
31 |D7/09/17 11:43 Reinspection Phota Losd IPG | [A
3 |O7/08/17 11140 Reinspection Photo ﬁ Losd PG | BA
|23 |07/09/17 11143 | Relnspection Photo 0 | wedws | A
Deocumentation e [
Mo | Aelsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) !‘nmmli Print
! 16/08/17 18:57 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED ) | Losd PoF

I | 16/0R/17 18:57 TP GIA REPORT == B  ‘losdFDF

3 05/09/17 18:27  EMAIL APPROVAL FROM PAULINE 0 | Loaaror

4 05/08/17 18:31 EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH SMRT [

S |05/00/19 16:56 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF
& | 05/0%/19 16:56  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load PDF
7 |05/09/1% 16:56 | Release Voucher Load PDF

B 05/09/19 16:56 | RENTAL RECEIPT Luad POF

5 | 05/09/15 16:56 | RENTAL MILEAGE Load POF

10 |05/09/1% 16:56 | LTA SEARCH 0 | Losdpor

11 |05/09/13 16:56  |LOD 0 | LoadPoF !
12 |05/09/19 16:58 | LETTER TD O1 0 | ioedroF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | prim |

There are no document checklists configured.

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
fonte Rpmarks Sre Orieats unkes) you ihos € £ SMer DaFDEs.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 5/9/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SJEGESBT (Insd veh) Model: CHEVROLET EPICA 2.0 (A)
SHBS5818P (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 13/08/2017
Global Sum Settlement | (| [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Eslimate | 414673
Final Repair Cosl - 1,225.00
Loss of Usae -1 125.00 5.00 days at $50.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 1B45B| 5 days
LTA |/ GIA Search Fee - 5.00
Others: . 0.00
'3
Final Setilement Sum 1 1,539.58

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registored? [ 1 YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate

halow)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 50 (%)
B) For GIA Registared Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
BOLA, Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |SMRT Taxis Ple Lid ' § 1,538.58
2) ‘S
3 '3
4) : §
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN g
LKK Auto Cansultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (If any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docltr... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg ne 1sseo7198m
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax; 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3AIG17015894/R1DB3G2-1
Date: 05082018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte_ Lid. ~ Policy No: 1700008324
Clalmant Vehicle sypse18p Insured Vehicle No :  SJE6B58T
Date of Loss: 13/082017 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 462827508756
DESCRIPTICN & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SHBS5918P
Make & Model: CHEVROLET EFICA, 2.0 (A) Engine No: Z2051483237TK
Reg. Date: 05/06/2013 (Man, Year: 2012) Chassis No KL1LABSRJBB134E678
Colour Maroan Cdometer: 408630 km
Engine Capacity 1891 cc
Markst Value/Mew Car Prica: N/&,
Sum Insured (5$): Market Value/New Car Price
ITI F I AT T | F R
Genaral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size. 205/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 205/85 R15
Front Lefi Side: Falken 5 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 5mm
Front Right Side: Falken 5mm Rear Right Side: Falken 5mm
The above valuws represan! ihe remaining lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Pars 242373 1,850.60 76413 31.53
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.723.00 880.00 733.00 42 54
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4.146.72 2,649.60 1,497.13 36.10
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5§) 2,450.00
Nett Amount (S5) 4,146.73 2,450.00 1,696.73 40.92
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x S550.00/day) (S5) 250.00
+ Car Rental (5.0 x S573.83/day) (S§) 369.15
(55) 3,068.15
Liable Amount (50.00%) (55) 1.534.58
+ Doc/Search Fes (S§) 5.00
Nett Liability (S$) 1,539.58
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 15/08/2017
Date Inspected. 15/08/2017 Inspeciled Al SMRT Automotive Services Ple Lid

(Woodlands)

htips://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

60 Woodlands Indusirial Park E4

Singapare 757705
Estimaled Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: CHAN JIA LE

WOTE- This report represents our findinga ot (e fme and place of innpeciion stafed herein, Such inspection fus been camed out fo the best of our
kmpwigdge and abilty but any other iatility under any ather circumatances is hereby express!y excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount

1 1 *PANEL FRT FENDER RH [DISC 10%) Buckled B06.00F *545 40F
2 1 *BUMPER FRT ASSY (DISC 10%) Deformed 1.238.00F *1.11420F
3 1 *“TYRE Not Necessary 1268.74F *F
4 1 “TYRE RIM Repair 328 89F =F
5 1 *LINER FRT FRT RH (PROTECTOR) *Chack 124.00F “F
F=Franchise par

Total Parts (S§)  2,423.73 1,650.60

l Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen p... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

Thera are no new miscellaneous ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour items

1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK New 507.00 400.00

2  SPRAY PAINT New 756.00 400.00

3 TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION New 80.00 30.00

4  TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREA New 100.00 40.00

5  TO DO WHEEL ALIGNMENT /ITYRE BALANCING New 120.00 80,00

f  TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS Mew 100.00 20.00

7 TOWASH AND VACUUM New 60.00 40.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,723.00 900.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019



