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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 2

thuire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
2001

FBC3809A
No

22 Jul 2019
YAMAHA
T135

White

2007
S5YP720639
5YP720639

$1,818.00
22 Feb 2008
22 Feb 2008
7

$273.00

Mo

$0.00

21Feb 2023
D - Motorcycle
5

$3,438.00
$2,466.00
$2,466.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Jul 2019

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F0304...

OK

22-Jul-19
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Cansultants
Fie Lid

0LKEAVE Eo#u2-23 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL:

Your ref: To Be Advised

Our rel:

The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer to the above matter.

CC4/LPC12012837/Udb3

Company Registration Mo, 19960T198R

1631 62363561 FAX 1 1065 62564315

Date: 23.07.2019

FBC3809A

Flease be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 22.07.2019
at the premises of M/s _Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
MNett Value

Drescription of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion & O/S Body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs:

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

1 8% 5,731.40
5% 1,600.00
v 53 -
P55 -
: 5% -
1 5% -
o Ir=v-=—,-——'—“-. .
| i T
.
5 Iﬂﬂ}'ﬁ



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417683
Tel : 67527740 Fax : 67528669

Co. Reg No. 201202259N

Owner: Fong Kim Yew Accident Date ; 1-Jul-19
Vehicle No : FBC 3809 A Vehicle Model:  Yamaha T135
Estimated Repair Costs
Oty Description Amount 5(%)
List Items
2 Front fork tube assy N9 74 M’#/ s 77 64000
1 Front wheel rim s /19 28000 X
1 Fork under bracket $ A1 185.00.X
1 Front rim shaft $ 11 4500
1 Front rim bearing 2 }/ ?’/f" § A1 3800X
1 Front brake disc |69 § 4N 15500 X
1 Handle-bar / ﬁ"/"q,é{, r’,xf- s 3 88.00 —
1 Handle-bar end _{ z L $ €«n) 320__—
1 Hand grip (1 set) $ At 3500
1 Side mirror -R/H $ W7 5500 —
1 Brake lever $ < e 3200 —
2 Front signals $ plrew? 14000 F &
1 Headlamp $ A7 18500 X
1 Fairing assy (1 set ) $ U7 495.00—
] Radiator $ Aq 45800 N
I Front footrest bracket $ 4+ 6500
1 Front footrest rubber $ Fs.a 35007
1 Brake pedal $ A 400X
1 Rear footrest $ o 40003
1 Rear footrest bracket 5 A 78.00.%
1 Exhaust assy $ 1 48500
1 Exhaust protector - chrome $ cun 6000~
1 Exhaust protector- black $ 2 45.00—
1 Rear absorber ( 1 set ) 5 s 35000
1 Side stand $ 2. 7500X
1 Main stand 5 AL 95.00.%
1 Rear taillamp $ 13500
1 Rear fender $ e~ 12000 >
1 Rear rim ;.O/ S uf 15000 y/
1 Rear rim shaft 5 nua 45.00
1 Rear rim bearing 5 38.00 ';?
1 Swing-arm $ m [~ 425.00
5 5,166.00
Less 10% % 516.560
5 4,649.40
1"1‘ q{tf

FAGE10OF2



c/f: $ 4,649.40

Special Nett Items

1 Number plate ( 1 set ) 5 £ 28.00 /o
2 Fork oils S A4 30.00 \4/
2 Fork oil seals S a9 56.DD.){
1 Steering cone ( 1 set ) $ A1 90.005(
1 Coolant 5 AN 18.00 /{
$ 222.00
S/MNo. Labour
1 To provide towing service. $ 1< 5000
2 To check wiring and reset headlamp focusing $ A1 x 8000
3 To provide labour. $ S 380.00
- To repair body frame. $ J oo 35000
% 860.00
Grand Total 5 5,731.40 «

EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

PAGE20OF 2



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

%

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 8:58 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Accident@kscgp.com

Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3809A [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/022005

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as arranged.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

i ot The all €¥%3 lonpac.com.sg
TN _;'-'

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Erofia Motor - LeelLee Tan [mailto:erofia@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 7:05 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3B09A [External General]

Dear Gerald
Kindly arrange Marcus Chua
Thank you

Regards

LeeLee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
Tel: 67527740

Fax: 67528669

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: 19 July, 2019 2:08 PM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3809A [External General]

Lonpac External - General



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : 18/19/19/vC05/022005
Dear Sirs,
Your fax of 19 July 2019 refers.

We append the list our motor surveyors below:-

Sharan Bin Sharif
Jackson Quek

Paul Thanapal

Aw Po Huat (Andrew)
Ng Chun Wei (Adam)
Mohd Taufik

Nicholas Tey

Marcus Chua
Kenneth Kong

Steve Chen

WO O =S un | [l |

-
o

Please let us hear from you.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

“| E- The all &) lonpac.com.sg
i i : :

Experience It Mow »

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:=

Sent: Wednesday, 24 luly 2019 B:49 AM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAuUto)

Ce MT_Claim_SG; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3809A [External Confidential]
Attachments; 24072013084248.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

T g A

| 7 o | : The all @& lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pei (LkKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July, 2019 6:29 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Clalm_5G; Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Autg)

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3B09A [External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle FBC 3809A at M/s Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792,
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 10:08 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cec: 'MT_Claim_5G" «<mt_claim@lonpac.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkaute.com>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FEC3809A [External Confidential]

Diear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.
Best Regards

Celine Fong

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841=-1072 | email: assignmentsilkkauto com | fax: Gagh-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 8:58 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Accident@kscgn.com
Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3809A [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/022005

Dear Nivitha,

Kindly proceed as arranged.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Z



65) 6296 2706

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax:

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parlies only.

From: Erofia Motor - Leelee Tan [mailto:erofia@singnet.com.sa]
Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 7:05 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3809A [External General]

Dear Gerald
Kindly arrange Marcus Chua
Thank you

Regards

Leelee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd
Tel: 67527740

Fax: 67528669

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:peraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: 19 July, 2019 2:08 PM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY OF FBC3B09A [External General]

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref :18/19/19/VC05/022005
Dear Sirs,
Your fax of 19 July 2019 refers.

We append the list our motor surveyors below:-

Sharan Bin Sharif
Jackson Quek

Paul Thanapal

Aw Po Huat (Andrew)
Mg Chun Wei (Adam)
Mohd Taufik

Micholas Tey

w=J T U R L R =




8 | Marcus Chua
Kenneth Kong
10 | Steve Chen

0

Please let us hear from you.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all @8 lonpac.com.sg

o [T Now »

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
WWW.AVE.COMm



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-96071598-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18012837/Uda3s2
#17-04107 THE GONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 Da8: 10012020 I“‘”||"I|IH|||”|| m
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  YP 1319U Veh. Inspected FBC 3809A
Policy No. Z19VC05001743 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. 19M19/19/V/C05/022005 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD POH Assign Date 221072015
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YAMAHAT135 c.C 135
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. 5YP720639 Colour BLUE
Odometer 78000 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |70/20-17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |80/90-17 MAXXIS 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION AND O/fS BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/07/2019 |Inspection Date 22/07/2019
Survey held at EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#02-62
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




¥

LY

L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-5607156-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBC 3809A
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [ = mhop?;}} f$]}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
Z2|FRONT FORK TUBE ASSY NOT NECESSARY 640,00 -
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM NOT NECESSARY 280,00 -
1|FORK UNDER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 185.00 -
1|FRONT RIM SHAFT NOT NECESSARY 45.00 -
1|FRONT RIM BEARING NOT NECESSARY 38.00 -
1|FRONT BRAKE DISC MOT NECESSARY 155.00 -
1|HANDLE-BAR BENT BB.00 88.00
1|HANDLE - BAR END CuT 32.00 3z2.00
1|SET HAND GRIP MECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|SIDE MIEROR - R/H cuT 55.00 55.00
1|BRAKE LEVER SCRATCHED 32.00 3az.00
2|FRONT SIGNALS Qs CuT 140.00 70.00
1|HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 185.00 -
1|SET FAIRING ASSY CcuT 495,00 495.00
1|RADIATOR NOT NECESSARY 458.00 -
1|FRONT FOOTREST BRACKET BENT 65.00 65.00
1|FRONT FOOTREST RUBBER TORN 35.00 35.00
1|BRAKE PEDAL TO REPAIR SEE 4200 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FOOTREST SERVICEABLE 40,00 -
1|REAR FOOTREST BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 78.00 -
1|EXHALST ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 485.00 -
LABOUR
1|EXHAUST PROTECTOR - CHROME cuT 60.00 60.00
1|EXHAUST PROTECTOR - BLACK CuT 45.00 45.00
1|SET REAR ABSOREER SERVICEABLE 350.00 -
1|SIDE STAND TO REPAIR SEE 75.00 -
LABOUR
1|MAIN STAND TO REPAIR SEE 95.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TAILLAMP CRACKED 135.00 135.00
1|REAR FENDER CRACKED 120.00 120.00

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18012837/Uda3s2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9807188-R Page No.:2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition ‘E:;LT:;?:“ Our A{:]}ustcd
1|REAR RIM DENTED f BENT 150.00 150.00
1|REAR RIM SHAFT NECESSARY 4500 45.00
1|REAR RIM BEARING MECESSARY 38.00 38.00
1|SWING - ARM BENT / TWISTED 425,00 425.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -516.60 -194.50
4,649.40 1,750.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET NUMBER PLATE (SN} BENT 28.00 10.00
2|FORK OILS {SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
2|FORK OIL SEALS (SN} NOT NECESSARY 56.00 -
1|SET STEERING COME (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|COOLANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 18.00 -
22200 10.00
LABOUR
TO PROVIDE TOWING SERVICE. 50.00 35.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND RESET HEADLAMP FOCUSSING. |NOT NECESSARY B80.00 -
TO PROVIDE LABOUR. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 380.00 300.00
BRAKE PEDAL, EXHAUST ASSY, SIDE STAND AND MAIN
STAND.
TO REPAIR BODY FRAME. 350.00 200,00
860.00 §35.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,731.40 2,295.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,600.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC19012837/Uda3s2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




