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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August, 2019 3:31 PM

To: Sg Motor

Cc: Sg Motor

Subject: RE: Plse arrange PRI on bike FBB 184T as per attached. *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM19012730/wa3

Attachments: SDN 1008B.mp4

 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir/Madam,  

   

Accident on FBB 184T & SDN 1008B on 12/07/2019 

   

We refer to the above matter  

   

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Based on our 

Insured’s video, your client squeeze into our Insured's lane.  

 

We attached herewith our insured’s CCTV video Footage for your perusal. 

 

Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim. 

 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 7:27 PM 

To: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
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a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Plse arrange PRI on bike FBB 184T as per attached. *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19012730/wa3 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement. 

 

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

 

 
 

Please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey.. 

• evidence i.e. video and scene photo. 

• PIR result (if any) 

• Estimated cost of repair 

 

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 10:35 AM 

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 

Cc: Sg Motor <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg> 

Subject: Plse arrange PRI on bike FBB 184T as per attached. 

 

Attn:  Motor Claims Dept 
 
Plse arrange PRI on bike FBB 184T as per attached. 
 
 
Thank You 
 
Regards 
Leena 
 

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd 

Blk 4001 #01-21  
Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 
Singapore 569622 
Tel: 64524898   Fax: 64526898 


