Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 5:50 PM

To: Motor Claims

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019 Our Ref:

19/19/19/VP05/022092 [External General]

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@autocare.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 11:39 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022092
[External General]

Dear Asher,
Kindly revert us on liability status.

Thank you



With Regards,
Angela Tan
Claims & Admin Executive

P LTI T
------ i

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd

176 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-05 SINGAPORE 575721
Email: motorclaims@autocare.com.sg

Tel : 6455 0600 | Fax : 6455 6192

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 11:33 AM

To: 'Motor Claims' <motorclaims@autocare.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022092
[External General]

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Asher,

Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/LPC19012715/eb3

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims [mailto:motorclaims@autocare.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 11:32 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022092
[External General]

Dear Sir,



We would like to know who is the case handler in order to check liability.
Thank you

With Regards,
Angela Tan
Claims & Admin Executive

LT

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd

176 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-05 SINGAPORE 575721
Email: motorclaims@autocare.com.sg

Tel : 6455 0600 | Fax : 6455 6192

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 2:59 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@autocare.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022092
[External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm
FYI, our Insured has not reported the accident to us.

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of liability.

Dear Nivitha
FYA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



The all € Innpac com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Motor Claims [mailto:motorclaims@autocare.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 2:15 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SGY3347R & SKD7783B ACCIDENT ON 15.07.2019

To: Lonpac Motor Claims Dept. (Arrangement of Surveyor Unit)

RE: NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY PURSUANT
TO

PARAGRAPH PHOTOCOL FOR NIN-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGY3347R & SKD7783B ALONG KALLANG LEISURE PARK CARPARK ON 15.07.2019

We are repairer for LA'BROOY LYNETTE KIARA the owner of vehicle no SGY3347R.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can inspected at the following venue:

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-05 Singapore 575721
Tel: 6455 0600 Fax: 64556192 Email: motorclaims@autocare.com.sg

Contact Person: Angela Tan

Please also provide us a list of 10 surveyors as your nominated SJE (Single Joint Expert)

PLEASE ARRANGE OFFICER-IN-CHARGE TO LET US KNOW ASAP IF WE COULD DO DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR THIS CASE.

Thank you

With Regards,
Angela Tan
Claims & Admin Executive

¢~ sin ng\v\t\:‘?

T

Sin Ming Autocare BFG Pte Ltd

176 SIN MING DRIVE, #02-05 SINGAPORE 575721
Email: motorclaims@autocare.com.sg

Tel : 6455 0600 | Fax : 6455 6192
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