Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF)

Cc: Frankie THAY (SPF); Cui Fen ENG (SPF); sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle GBJ 1831K
Attachments: LKKAdjustment-GBJ 1831K.pdf

Dear Sir,

As requested.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeq, »

From: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF)
[mailto:Hafizul_Farhan_RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 3:35 PM
To: Elaine (LKK Auto)
Cc: Frankie THAY (SPF); Cui Fen ENG (SPF); sur@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle GBJ 1831K

Your ref: CS/SPF19012709/R1tf3e2
Our ref: AEMD/105/009/2019/078

Hi,
Can you include the ‘Estimated Upper Range of Repair cost’ for this report?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hafizul Farhan Bin Rahmat
Assistant Logistics Support Officer
Logistics Support and Services Division



Tel: 6842 8429
Police Logistics Department | Singapore Police Force

3) | SPF2C0

SALUTING THE PAST - SAFEGUARDING THE FUTURE )

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in
reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender
immediately if you receive this in error.”

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2019 4:13 PM

To: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: Frankie THAY (SPF) <Frankie THAY@spf.gov.sg>; Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle GBJ 1831K

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Survey Report of GBJ 1831K.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ELAINE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,




