ATTN TO:

BILLTO:

TYPE OF CLAIM:

Make / Model :

Parts Cost / List :
Supp. Parts :
Special Nett :
Total Parts :
Total Labour:

TOTAL REPAIR COST :

Submitted by / Date :

Confirmed by / Date :

Chencing
Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd (Co.Reg. No: 20160623C)
6 Benoi Sector, Singapore (629904)
Tel : 6358 3031 | Fax No : 6694 4929
FINALIZATION FORM

LKK-STEVE Date of Accident : 13/7/2019

Surveyor Name and Company

VEHICLE REG. NO.
ERGO

TP Insurer

SLUG635R

TP

XJ 5.0L AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR GA

COST OF CLAIMS
S 7,360.04 Total Parts Cost/List : S 7,360.04
$ - Plus/Lless: 5% 368.00
S 120.00 Total : 6,992.04
S 7,112.04 Lump Sum Discount : 20% 1,652.41
S 1,150.00 Lump Sum Amount: 6,609.63
S 8,262.04 Final Lump Sum Amount:  $ 6,600.00

MINOKO

No. of Repair Days:

5




Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd (Co.Reg. No: 20160623C)
6 Benoi Sector, Singapore (629904)
Tel : 6358 3031 | Fax No : 6694 4929

Vehicle Reg. No. : SLUG35R
Vehicle Reg. Date:  7/7/2011
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Make /Model:  JAGUAR XJ 5.0L AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR GAS, L / j
Engine No. : 11032918333508PN
Chassis No. : SAJAC22F5BLV20478 R{ / L \V
7 7PAGE 1
Estimates on Parts
ADJUSTED
No | Qty PARTICULARS, CONDITION AMOUNT S/N AMOUNT
1 1 |FRONT BUMPER (¢ “l 2 $3,000.30 $3,000.30 25’9/
2 1 |FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETIANERRH / {JR $ 9450 $ 9450|407
3 | 1SET |FRONT BUMPER CLIPSRH /~ $  86.00 s 8600 397
4 | 1SET |FRONT BUMPER RIVERT .~ $§ 97.00 § 9700 34 r
5 1 |FRONT BUMPER FOLAMP GARNISH RH X S 272.88 =
6 1 |FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP CHROME GARNISHRH | /([ S 473.44 § 473.44 PY 0/
7 | 1 |FRONT PARKING SENSOR RH Yzl $  428.00 S 428.00 2o/
8 | 1 |HEADLAMPRH $3,180.80 $3,180.80 | § 600/
9 1 |HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVERRH X S 71.60
10 | 1 |HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKETRH X NO USE
11 | 1 |HEADLAMPPANELRH X NO USE S710
12 | 1 |FRONTFENDERRH X $1,505.30 3
13 | 1 |FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELDRH X S 348.60 070
14 | 1 |FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS X S 86.00 5139
15 | 1 |FRONTFENDERAIRDUCTRH X NO USE 100
16 | 1 |FRONT FENDER EMBLEM RH X S 388.10 :
17 | 1 |FRONT FENDER STICKERRH X ' 573 7
18 | 1 |FRONTRIMRH _ X R ( Leco] ftpau] (i $1,826.60 | 12000 | [00/
19 | 1 |FRONTTYRERH X 5 $ -
20 | 1 |FRONT LOWERARMRH X $1,091.40
21 | 1 |FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER RH X S 852.60
22 | 1 |FRONT WHEEL BEARING RH X S 561.20
23 | 1 |FORNTWHEELHUBRH X $ -
24 | 1 |FRONT KNUCKLE ARM RH X S 507.10
25 | o |o
26 | 0 |o
27 | 0 Jo
22| 0 o
29| o o
30 [ o |o
31 [ o Jo
32| o0 Jo
33| 0 Jo
3| 0 |o
35 | 0 |0
36| 0 |o
37| o |o
38 [ 0 |o
39 [ o Jo
20 | o |o
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Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd (Co.Reg. No: 20160623C)
6 Benoi Sector, Singapore (629904)
Tel : 6358 3031 | Fax No : 6694 4929

Vehicle Reg. No. : SLUG35R
Vehicle Reg. Date: 7/7/2011
Make / Model : JAGUAR X) 5.0L AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR GAS/
Engine No. : 11032918333508PN
Chassis No. : SAJAC22F5BLV20478
PAGE 1
Estimates on Labour
ADJUSTED
No MECHANICAL / ELECTRICAL / PANEL / PAINT LABOUR AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 |To knock jack out damged parts,panel beating welding,align,refix & to replace $ 1,500.00 | S 400.00 /
accient parts. FRONT LH Portion.
2 |To putty,respray painting and polish affected areas. FRONT LH Portion. $ 1,200.00 [ $ 600.00 v
3 |To rust proof affected areas. $ 15000]$ 3000|/
4 |To check and rectify wiring after disconnect and reconnect. $ 150.00|$  30.00 4
5 |To replace & refit front LH rim $ 180.00|S 30.00 /
6 |Todo tyre balancing $  150.00 X
7 |To do wheel alignment $ 180.00|$ 60.00 /
8 |Toremove & refit undercarriage to assist work load. S  280.00 )(

/150

LKK Auto Consultants h

the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey before/after sprdy painting

 To display damaged part(s) during resurvey




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: ezel.t@vermogen-group.com

Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 12:41 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); 'Minoko Chan'
Subject: RE: REMINDER: SLU635R FINALISE
Dear Steve,

We confirm the revise finalise amount to $5100.00 in 4 repair days.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
Operation Address:

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36
Carros Centre Singapore 737869
Tel: 6904 4596

Fax: 6694 4929

Mailing Address:
1 Bukit Batok Crescent #04-54
Wcega Plaza Singapore 658064

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2019 9:41 AM

To: 'Minoko Chan' <minoko@vermogen-group.com>

Cc: ezel.t@vermogen-group.com

Subject: REMINDER: SLU635R FINALISE

Dear Minoko,
Our finalize is $5100 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




