


1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April, 2020 5:16 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Lily Loi; Adeline Lim; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: 

TP#864 // Your ref: CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3

Attachments: 21042020170900.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
Enclosed the signed DV for your process payment. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

 

Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 

purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April 2020 5:05 PM 

To: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim <adeline@ow.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) 

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: 

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sharon, 

 

Please find attached DV as requested. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and should 

not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement should also 

not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made 
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solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other 

related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Sharon Ten [mailto:sharon@ow.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April, 2020 4:58 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; Lily Loi; Adeline Lim 

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: 

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 

 

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
We accept your offer at $9,145.00. Please send DV.  
 
Thank you.   
  
Best Regards, 

  

Sharon Ten (Ms.) 
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 

purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 6:52 PM 

To: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Angela Tan <angela.tan@ow.sg>; Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>; Adeline Lim 

<adeline@ow.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: 

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 
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Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sharon, 

  
We refer further to the below email. 

  
Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we had further reviewed the 

matter and in the view that both parties are equally liable due to conflicting version. As such, we have our principal’s mandate 

and we propose a global sum of $9,145.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.  

  
If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us for our principal to process the payment. 

  
Thank you. 

  

 
  

  
  

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save Save Save Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  

From: sharon@ow.sg [mailto:sharon@ow.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 7 November, 2019 6:00 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; 'angela.tan'; 'Lily Loi OW'; adeline@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: 

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 

  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Vic, 
Please let us have your proposed offer without further delay. 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
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Sharon Ten (Ms.) 

Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 

purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

  

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>  

Sent: Saturday, September 7, 2019 12:06 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; angela.tan@ow.sg 

Cc: Lily.loi@ow.sg; adeline@ow.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg> 

Subject: Re: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: 

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 

  
Without Prejudice 

Dear Vic, 
Any update from your principal? 
Kindly let us have your offer to close the case. 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 

  

Sharon Ten (Ms.) 

Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 

DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 

  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 

purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 

immediately after which. 

On 16-Aug-19 10:21 AM, Sharon wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Vic, 
Our client don't have video footage.  
Based on the scene photos, our client already in front of your insured so my client has the right of 
way. 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 

  

Sharon Ten (Ms.) 

Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department 

DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011 
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www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute 

or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and 

delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

On 10-Aug-19 3:58 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Angela, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive 

evidence yet to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy 

of our insured's accident report for your perusal. 

  

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying 

further with our OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do 

not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard further from us. 

  

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your 

claim.  

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the 
intended recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a 
violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-
mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies 
thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any 
copies thereof. Thank you. 
  

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 9:51 AM 

To: angela.tan@ow.sg 

Cc: Lily.loi@ow.sg; 'Sharon Ten'; adeline@ow.sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: 

TP#864 // Your ref: to be advise 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Please note that: - 

 

LKK ref Officer in charge   

CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 Vic  

   

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: angela.tan@ow.sg <angela.tan@ow.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 10:39 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Lily.loi@ow.sg; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; adeline@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: 

TP#864 // Your ref: to be advise 

  

Our Ref           : SKJ11K / TP#864 

Your Ref          : S9105CD 

  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Officer-In-Charge, 
We refer to the above mentioned accident. 
We are claiming as below: 

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST)                       S$17,387.50 

- Loss of Use                                                   S$1,500.00 (S$300.00 x 5 Days) 

- GIA / LTA Search Fees                                S$2.00 

  

Grand Total                                                   S$18,889.50 

                                                                       ==========     
Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement. 
Thank you.  
  

--  

Angela Tan (Ms.) 

Motor Claims Assistant 

T: +65 6481 1522  | F: 6481 1011 

  

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you 

must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.  
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after 

which. 
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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 10 August, 2019 4:03 PM

To: clive@scott.name

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: S 9105CD_ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 9105CD AND SKJ 11K ALONG 

AEDMORE PARK CONDO BASEMENT 2 CAR PARK ON 07.07.2019

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

10 AUGUST 2019 

                                 

CLIVE GORDON SCOTT                                                                                   By Post & By Email                    

2 MARINA BOULEVARD 

#65-01 

SINGAPORE 018987 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

OUR REF              : CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 

YOUR REF            : S 9105CD 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 9105CD AND SKJ 11K ALONG AEDMORE PARK CONDO BASEMENT 2 CAR PARK ON 

07.07.2019 

 

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 

insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  

 

We have received a Property Damage Claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SKJ 11K 

against your motor insurance policy. 

 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given 

us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 

negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 

 

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) may be affected as a result of the claim against 

your policy. 

 

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under 

the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) 

arising from this incident, at your own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at AIG’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive 

and further document may be required: 

 

• Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any) 

• Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 
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• Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 

• Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any) 

• Video footage of accident (if any) 

• Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any) 

• If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us 

informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim 

 

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 

and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AIG’s prior knowledge and 

consent.  

 

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 

policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  

 

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep you informed of the final 

indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   

 

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com. 

 

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

Type text here



10 AUGUST 2019 
 
 
 
   
CLIVE GORDON SCOTT      By Post & By Email           
2 MARINA BOULEVARD 
#65-01 
SINGAPORE 018987 
 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
OUR REF : CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 
YOUR REF : S 9105CD 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S 9105CD AND SKJ 11K ALONG AEDMORE PARK CONDO 
BASEMENT 2 CAR PARK ON 07.07.2019 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster 
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third 
party claim against your policy.  
 
We have received a Property Damage Claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on 
behalf of the owner of SKJ 11K against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 
 
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) may be affected as 
a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according 
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your 
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your 
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.   
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the 
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not 
provided at AIG’s reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further 
document may be required: 
 

• Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence 
and status (if any) 

• Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 

• Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 

• Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any) 



• Video footage of accident (if any) 

• Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any) 

• If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third 
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the 
status of the claim 
 

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with 
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or 
settlement without AIG’s prior knowledge and consent.  
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any 
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised 
driver may have committed.  
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep 
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us 
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.  
 
Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more 
effectively. 
 
 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Vic Alpeh 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 2096 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 

clive@scott.name   
             (Email) 
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Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKJ11K (7938849935SG)
[S9105CD]

TP
VIRGOZ OILS AND FATS PTE LTD

Jul 7 2019 5:00PM
[CLIVE GORDON SCOTT]

Optima Werkz Pte Ltd

From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 09/01/2020 14:41 PM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$9145.75) - SKJ11K - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Yan

Approved:9145.75:Cost of repair: $17,387.50 LOU: $900.00 ($180.00 x 5 days) @50% LTA / GIA: $2.00 Total:
$9,145.75
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