Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 9:51 AM
To: angela.tan@ow.sg
Cc: Lily.loi@ow.sg; 'Sharon Ten'; adeline@ow.sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref:
TP#864 // Your ref: to be advise
Attachments: SKJ11K LOD.pdf
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/AIG19012698/Khb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: angela.tan@ow.sg <angela.tan@ow.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 10:39 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Lily.loi@ow.sg; 'Sharon Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; adeline@ow.sg

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ11K & S9105CD ON 07/07/2019 // Our ref: TP#864 // Your ref: to be
advise

Our Ref : SKJ11K / TP#864

Your Ref : S9105CD

Without Prejudice

Dear Officer-In-Charge,

We refer to the above mentioned accident.
We are claiming as below:

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST) S$17,387.50
- Loss of Use S$1,500.00 (S$300.00 x 5 Days)
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- GIA / LTA Search Fees S$2.00

Grand Total S$18,889.50

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your speedy settlement.

Thank you.

Angela Tan (Ms.)
Motor Claims Assistant
T:+65 6481 1522 | F: 6481 1011
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