Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 11:41 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Reports (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: For comments: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKP 218A Ref:
CLMOMVC000003689

Attachments: SKP218A.pdf

Hi Veron,

Thanks for the input.

We are having difficulty explaining to insured. The vehicle damage is very very minor, just some slight scratches
which can be seen as per attached. The repair cost is excessively high, $8K over.

Please do let u know the basis.

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, October 25, 2019 5:54 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKP 218A Ref: CLMOMVC000003689

Dear Kelvyna,

According to surveyor, it is related to the accident. Once the tailgate replaced, it is necessary to replaced the
rear windscreen, rear windscreen formed part of tailgate assembly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 4:46 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKP 218A Ref: CLMOMYVYC000003689

Dear Kelvyna,



Will check and revert.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 4:38 PM

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKP 218A Ref: CLMOMVYC000003689

Dear all,

Need advice. The damage to the third party is seemingly minor, however we noted that there is a rear windscreen
replacement? Is this related to the accident?

Thanks
Kelvyna
68046059

From: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2019 3:26 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [External] Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SKP 218A Ref: CLMOMVYC000003689

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Survey Report of SKP 218A.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
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