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Ehiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July 2019 7:42 PM

To: Manivel Priyadarshini; SUR

Cc: Admin A; assignments; Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: India reEMCT18050204/001/MP-Accident Involving SHD4855H & SKH8792Y on
08.05.18

Attachments: SKH8792Y PARF.pdf

Cear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Cur respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi SUR team,

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Eest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Manivel Privadarshini <manivel@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 3:37 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: India ref:MCT18050204/001/MP-Accident Involving SHD4855H & SKH8792Y on 08.05.18

Dear Sir,
Please assist to provide us the economical repair value & salvage value for the TP vehicle SKH8792Y (D.0.A-08.05.18)

Thank You
3est Regards’s

Priya Wanivel
Motor Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd

Tel : 63476100, Ext-284
Email : manivel@iii.com.sg

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any
use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as
information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability
for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of
Internet transmission or any modification.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Oﬁner 1D Tvbé: -

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

M anufécturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registfatiun Date:
TranﬂerCounﬁ
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 May 2013

'BusineSs-
3246M

SKHB792Y

Yes

17 May 2018
MITSUBISHI

LANCER EX 1.6 A/T
Black )
2012

4A92AY0051
JMYSRCY1ACU000663
86.0kW (115 bhp)
$16,673.00

25 Jan 2013

25 Jan 2013

1

$16,673.00 04'133 {
Yes

24 Jan 2023
$11,671.00

24 Jan 2023
A- Car (1600cc & below)
- 00cc & b
$66,889.00
© $31,340.00
$43,011.00
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