
1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 4:12 PM

To: Lilian Chia

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING JFM 39 & SCM 262G ON 10/07/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Sir/Mdm,   

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA 

(subject to BOLA guideline settlement)  and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 

client’s vehicle.  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 

days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051 

 

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate 

settlement. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Lilian Chia <sanfumotor0243@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 4:10 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING JFM 39 & SCM 262G ON 10/07/2019 

 

Dear Asher, 

 

maybe you can see the video...� 

 

On Thu, Jul 25, 2019 at 4:05 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
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  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Your Ref: JFM 39 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19012665/Geb3 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING JFM 39 & SCM 262G ON 10/07/2019 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Our insured driver reported that your client rear ended our 

insured vehicle. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal. 

  

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI we will 

revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you 

heard further from us. 

  

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to 

look into the matter. 

  

We shall revert upon hearing from you. 

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

 

 

 

--  

Thank You 
 

Lilian Chia  | Direct line +65 9061 3299 

SANFU MOTOR PTE LTD                                                               

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-43, Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
Tel: (65) 6744 7753    I    Fax: (65) 6744 6010   I    Co. Reg. No. 200612487G 

Business Hours: Mon–Fri:  9am to 7pm  I  Sat: 9am to 6pm  I  Sun & Public Holidays Closed 

 
 

 


