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S1UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408938 TEL : (051 62503561 FAX : (0651 f2564M5
Yourref:  DI2004644MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI19012650/Kvi3 Date : 22/7/2019
The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear SirfMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SLR 7558A

We thank for your instruction on 16/7/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
19/7/2019  at the premises of M/s ~ OPTIMA WERKZ PTELTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5%4,521.31
Revised Estimate Amount :5$3,590.18
"Check"” Items Amount : §%651.13
Market Value : 55

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



Ms‘ Fi rstCa pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coRes bo. 1950000060 GST Reg, Mo, M2 00016763

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax [B5)6222 3547
Claien & Motor Undenwaiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: {65) 6507 3848 Fax: [B5) 6507 3849
wiwn msfirstrapital. com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 16-07-2019 Our Ref No. D18004644MFSH

Accident Date 13-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party

Insured Vehicle SHA4838Z Third Party Vehicle. SLR7558A

Survey Location 9A SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE &

Contact Person. SHARON TEN (MS.)

Contact No. 84811522/ 0 Fax No. 64811011

Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TQ BE AGREED:
inted

Appointe LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person A Fax No. 63416315

Contact Number, MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {(based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor A, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

1 R s




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2019 10:06 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: ‘Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004644MFSH/1-5LR 7558A
Attachments: SLR 7558A PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLR 7558A
Date of survey: 19/7/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2015 3:16 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004644MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle is not in workshop and repairer will arrange.

Best Regards

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2015 3:13 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D15004644M FSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: © WWwW.avg.com



" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: sharon@ow.sg

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2019 3:48 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; angela.tan@ow.sg; lily.loi@ow.sg; haoling.chong@ow.sg;
hockkong.ong@ow.sg

Subject: RE: FINALISE / TP CLAIMS - SLR7558A BMW 216D DOA: 13/07/2019

Attachments: 26092019152540.pdf

Dear Kenneth,
We accept repair cost at Lump Sum $1,800.00.

Thank you.

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

OPT/MALERHZ ereuvo.

Haad offics: B Hung Chong Road Singapara 152143 Telk (+B5) B472 1313 Fax: [+65) 6472 2anN2
firanch: B4 Serangoon Norh Ave 6 Singapore BSAB00  Tek: (+05) 0404 8910 Fax: (+05) G481 107
Branch: 462 Tagors iIndustrial Ave SIngapore TE7E23 Tel: (+B5) A2 GEGE Fax: [+BE) B4AE2 9223

wwwowsg | www, licebook com/OptimaWerkz
Privilesed Confidential infrmation may be contained i this message. 11 you are not the intended recipient, you must nol copy. distribute or usc il for any

parpicse, nor diselose its contems to amy other person. Please notify the sender if vou reeerve this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately
wller which

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2019 11:04 AM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: angela.tan@ow.sg; Lily Loi OW <lily.loi@ow.sg>; haoling.chong@ow.sg; hockkong.ong@ow.sg
Subject: Re: FINALISE / TP CLAIMS - SLR7558A BMW 216D DOA: 13/07/2019
Dear Kenneth,

Sorry.....Should be Lump Sum repair.

S/P - $2,740.18

L - $850.00

Total- $3,590.18 - 20%

Lump Sum - $2,850.00 & 3 days

Please check & confirm.

Thank you.

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011



- OPT/AN ASERHKZ sroun.
Head office: B Kung Cheng Road Singapore 159143 Tel; (+65) GATE 1313 Fax: [+65] 6478 2118
firanch: A Serangoon Narth Ave § Singapore 6545600  Tek (+GB) 6484 98910 Fax: {o5) DAl 1077
Branciy 4B2 Tagore Industrial Ave Singapore 787823 Tol (+66) 6452 GEGA Fax! [+B6) G462 8223

wwwow.se | waww, Frechook com/OptimaWerk:

Privileaed Confidential information may be contained in s message. I vou are ot the intended recipient. yiu must notcopy, distribuste or wse il for any
purpose. nor disclose its contents Lo iy otheer person Mease notifv the sender il vou recerve his email in error. and delete the email and its coment immediately
after which

On 26/09/2019 8:36 AM, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) wrote:

Sharon, where is your B4 paint photos?

From: Sharon [mailto:sharon@ow.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 25 September, 2019 10:10 AM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR: angela.tan@ow.sg; Lily Loi OW; haoling.chong@ow.sg; hockkong.ong@ow.sg
Subject: FINALISE / TP CLAIMS - SLR7558A BMW 216D DOA: 13/07/2019

Dear Kenneth,
Our calculation as per below:

S/P - $2,740.18

L - $850.00
Part by Part - $3,590.18 & 3 days

Please check & confirm.

Enclosed the after paint photos for your reference.

Thank you.

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
DID: (+65) 5481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

OPT/MALERHKZ erewn

Hzad office 6 Kung Chong Road Singaporae 160143 Tel («06] G472 1312 Fax: (-656] 6472 212
franc i B Serangoon Morth Ave 8 Singapore 6846800 Tel (+05) 6404 9919 Fax: (+65) 6481 10N
wranc i 452 Tagore industrial Ave Singapore 787823 Tel: (+65) 6452 GHEE Fax: (+65) B452 8223

www.ow.5g | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Frivileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message, If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute
or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person.Please notify the sender if you recelve this email in errar, and
delate the email and its content immediately after which.
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» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Yehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis MNo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Jul 2019

PARFICOF Rehate Framiire

Singapore NRIC
SOBOF

SLR7S58A

Yes

15 Jul 2019

B.MW.

216D M SPORT GRAND TOURER
Grey

2017
356359967B37C15A
WBAZE3I20705H46376
B85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$44,299.00

28 Aug 2017

28 Aug 2017

0

$46,819.00

Yes
27 Aug 2027
$35,114.00

27 fug 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$42,801.00

$34,240.00

$69,354.00

MITPS VI NE. GOV, SQANVIFACUOMNENGgUINe KEDAIECYHUDICOETONELSTEQINPUL S F UL 1 IUN_ILEFUIUSULE |

(FN]



OPT/MAERKZ

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

0 roptmdwerks: @ Joptimawerkz

WA DWW B0

" SINGAPORE
Date: 15.07.2019 Third Party Insurer: MS FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No: SLR7558A Third Party Veh No: SHA48382
Model: BMW 216D M SPORT - 2017 Date of Accident: 13.07.2019
Chassis: WBA2E320905H46376
Reg.Year: 2017
ESTIMATE
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT AMOUNT S$
1 |REAR BUMPER /70l PE c/dy $1,850.00 |
2 |REAR BUMPER CLIP 12 $7.80 e, 49360 |[—
3 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SEMSOR P:.--\ 5685.40 X
4 |REAR BUMPER LOWER 2,5-20 €/} 594080 | —
SUB TOTAL $3,569.80
LESS 5% -$178.49
PARTS TOTAL $3,391.31
LABOUR CHARGES: 25""/
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE, REPLACE, REPAIR, READJUST REAR ACCIDENT $350.00
AREAS & ETC
?f,r
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $600.00
AT REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR & ETC $60.00 “
TO CHECK WIRING & TO DIAGNOSIS REAR REVERSE SENSOR & ETC $120.00 Jo
LABOUR TOTAL $1,130.00
ONG TOTAL $4,521.31

/ﬁf% gﬁ/’)’d/ﬂr

i £ clay,

W2 X

=ead office @ranch

& Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143
Tl (+65) 6472 1393 Fax: (+&5) 6472 117

Bramch
S Serangoon Morth Ave § Singapare 554500 551 Upper Thomson Road Singapare 574415 OI,,:

Tol: (+65) 6484 3915 Fax: [«4%) 0481 1017

Tk [+65] 6453 6868  Fax [#65) 6452 %223 1



OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Co. Reg. No. EO0TS124585W

[} /Cptimavwerk:

OPT/MATERHKZ

/S SINGAPORE

WO D S5

@ roptirnawen s

Date: 15.07.2019 Third Party Insurer: M5 FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No: SLR7558A Third Party Veh No: SHA4838Z
Model: BMW 216D M SPORT - 2017 Date of Accident: ~ 13.07.2019
Chassis: WEBAZE320905H46376
Reg.Year: 2017
ESTIMATE
NO. DESCRIPTION ary UNIT 55 AMOUNT 55
1 |REARBUMPER . e/dpy 5185000 |
2 |REAR BUMPER CLIP 12 $7.80 e, $93.60 |—
3 |REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 3685.40 | 2
4 |REAR BUMPER LOWER €/ 594080 | —
SUB TOTAL 3356980040 Y
LESS 5% 5178.49]" %433
PARTS TOTAL $3,391.31)57 Y0 ||

LABOUR CHARGES: 25‘:'/
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE, REPLACE, REPAIR, READJUST REAR ACCIDENT 5350.00
AREAS & ETC
“for

LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $600.00
AT REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR & ETC ¢60.00 “—
TO CHECK WIRING & TO DIAGNOSIS REAR REVERSE SENSOR & ETC $120.00 Jod

LABOUR TOTAL s113000 '

&
ONG TOTAL 54,521.31
P T (S Aoy ,//Wém;.g_/

- f BN

_.F. v

. a—r
o3 510

Fetay,

Hitad office

& Kumg Chong Rosd Sngapare 159143
Tek (65} 6472 1313 Fax: (+45) 6472 2012

mranch

SA Sersngoon Mt e § Singapsie S5A500
Tel: {#65) 6484 9905 Fan [+&%5) 6487 107TY

Eranch

57 Uppsd Thomeon Rosd Singapore 574415
Tel (+65) G457 GEGA Fax: [+45) 6453 9223
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
54 Ubi Ave 1 #04-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607158R G5T Reg. Mo 19-9507198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH9012650/Kvi3n2
o ot Irs HOUSESINGAPORE 063877 D ACRANS N‘H““W"‘N""M
Code: FCI2
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 48387 Veh. Inspected SLR 75584
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004644MFSH Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 16/07/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 216D [A) c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. WBAZE320005H46376 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 33066 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IM ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R18 MICHELIN B mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R18 MICHELIN B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 MICHELIN B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 MICHELIN 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTIOMN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/07/2018 Inspection Date 18/07/2019
Survey held at OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
9A SERANGOON NORTH AVE §
SINGAPORE 554500
5a, Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/’_! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199B07198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 7558A
; : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
D ion of Part Condition
5i5) secuEt : Workshop (8))| __($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED / 1.850.00 1,080.97
CRACKED
12| REAR BUMPER CLIP @37.80 MECESSARY 93.60 93.60
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR SERVICEABLE 685.40 .
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER CRACKED 940,80 315.20
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -178.49 -74.49
3,391.31 1,415.28
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO 350.00 250.00
REMOVE,REPLACE,REFPAIR,READJUST REAR ACCIDENT
AREAS & ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT 600.00 480.00
& FURNISHING MATERIALS AT REAR ACCIDENT AREAS
& ETC.
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE 60.00 60.00
SENSOR & ETC.
TO CHECK WIRING & TO DIAGNOSIS REAR REVERSE 120.00 60.00
SENSOR & ETC.
1,130.00 850.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,521.31 2,265.28
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19012650/Kvf3n2

Az

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser




