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GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

N kbt Bukit Asepuc 4, H15-25 Preonwer @ haki Hukit Sngapore 418875

7 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4
¥ 05.25 PREMIER (@ KAKI BIKIT
Singapore 415875

ZVwsol 235 6% 15th July 2019

AP Ara

Aceident date 15th July 2019 Viver
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SpMH9115Y TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID 1.8A

Amount

sn ay |tems Uiprice

i T Rear Boot Lid 51.250.00 X%

2 1 boot'id LH logo W& $4% 00 »

3 1 Rea woot lid emble logo §74.10~"

4 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock l”"‘" s28310C .

5 1 Rear boot lid inner rubber $236 10X

6 1 boot lid side reflector g ~~ $285.00 $570.00 ¥

7 1 Rear Boot Lid Number Plate AL~ $50 00

B 2 Rear Boot Lid Number Plate Lamp r $13510 $270.20%

9 | Rear Boot Lid inner Trim board N §425 00%-

10 | Rear tai-amp botid it/ Gurish  cantd ' $ 458 '

11 4  Rear il lamp clips , N-fas— $8.50 $34.00

12 1 Rear Bumper e fd Kﬂ -

13 2 Rear Bumper side roflector P& A $115.00 00X

14 1 Rear Bumper Reinforcement Bt adl

15 2 Rear Bumper Side Bracket M- $55.60 $111207

16 5 Rea Bumper reverse sensor Do d- Wf}ﬂ)

17 7 Rear Bumper Bracket f¥re $68.40 $136 80

18 §  Rear bumper clips  TVAs $6.50 $52:00 -0

19 1 rear bumper lower cover Dl"v-d $385 .00

20 {  Rear end panel : $582 007

24 1 Rear End Panel Top Gamish D¢{-3 $258.00 ¥

22 ! Rear spare tire lock  Alr{ Mé $526 10 X
Subtotal - $8.316.60

Eage 304

232%-3p S Wl
4622
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Sheet!
labour charges
To Check Wiring System
Tufl Kote
To Remove & refix cushion
Ta Remove & refix rear windscreen
Gum
To Remove & refix reverse Sensor
Panel beating
Spray painting
LKK Aulo Consultants henca notify

the Repairer of Ihe following:
* To resurvey cefumiulat epryy n..w-!wq
» To Ssplay somages 2me) Ao 7] | ey
® P2 prces o0 Subyem o eos IeEation
* Thind party mvey /o0 @ -\t 3wt Srgudien” b
* No llsgal mesitestens| & afowss
* Suoclementisy dee 1) mogt te FEuramy e gnd
B Sityect i final anoroval fram inyrares TRy

Acknnwlecged by fe;gres
Sigratuee.
Dty

“nge 504

“ﬁ" 20
5120 o0 A"

§1 Co
sz:l(a'(
$5000 X
hn,,d‘.'fo
s8gp0C € )
s 700

Sikisonad < $2.170.00

%0

Total - 33 02,



> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Dwuner 1D Type
Owner ID

Viehicks No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicls Model

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year
Engine Na

Chassis Na

Maximum Power Output
Open Market Value:
Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid

PARF Eligibiiity
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Eapiry Date
COE Category

COE Period(Years)
QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amaunt
Total Rebate Amount

The information contained herein is correct asat 17 Jul 2019

Company
59K

SMHF115Y

Yirg

17 Jul 2019
TOYOTA
PRIUSHYBRID 185 A
Blue

2016
ZZRR951202
IVWS0B0D35945
#0.0 kW [120 bhg)
$26,732.00

14 Feb 2019

14 Feb 2019

]

$1942500

Yes
13 Feb 2029
$14 548.00

13 Feb 2029

E - Dpen - all except motorcycle
10

$32.909.00

$£25 740,00

£40,328.00

OK




Me2018
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Service Request Details

Claim

S9MOITZE

Reference
None #

Lass Date
July 13. 2019

Report Date
Jul 13, 2019 1:54:00 PM

Request Date
July 14, 2019

Due Date
July 23, 2019

Vendar Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Claim Portal

LR ALIT

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #&
SMH9115Y

ANTS BTE LTD(TP) =

p. Chris
T.244p™
V. Iy

&V

biln
gl

hitpsivp smariclaims axa.com.sg/claim-poralhtmifindex-vendor-sarvice-requesis. himii/service-requesia/?servicaRequastNumbar=127082

12



Tre2019: Claim Portal

KK ALUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD TP = Meni

IMIDOC)

PRIUS HYBRID-1.85 (A)

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

EUGENE SHI YOUJUN
NO 87 UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST, 486181. Singapore

EVECHONG_23@HOTMAILCOM

Claim Handler

TEO Kitty
6568804602
kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Message: Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes

hitps:/ivp.smariciaims.axa com.sgiclaim-panalintmlfindex-vendar-service-requests himlésarvice-raguesis/?TsernvicaRequestNumber=127082



Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 924 AM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey
Cc KUMAR Shailendra

Subject: SMH9115Y & SGE1968S doa 15/7/19
Attachments; SMH 9115Y - GIA report (SAS2635301).pdf
Categories: Raghav

Dear Sir/ Mdm .

Enclosed is our clients GIA report .

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survev our clients vehicle:SMH9115Y . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan
Green Forest Automobile Pre Lid

Hp:92712214




Vic (LKKAuto)

h

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir/ Mdm ,

Enclosed is the DV .

chan pick yuen <chrs_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sunday, 15 March, 2020 1:10 PM

Vic (LKKAuUto)

SMH9115Y / Ref; SOMOLTZE

SMH 9115Y - DV1 (signed).pdf.pdf

Please let us have your payment soon. Thanks

Get Outlook for i0S




ana2020 Cilaim Partal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD [TP] = Menu

& Re:<MANDATE IA>

Type
@ Question

Message
APPROVE

Regily

hitps divp smariclalims axa com.sg/claim-portalhimifindex-vendor-service-requests himi#/service-requesisiview-message/PserviceRequesiNumbe... 11




51

Sl mE ®  Peln Company Raghtration Mo 199607 1888

£1 U AVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) h2563501 FAX : 1065) 62560015

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 10/03/2020
Sury X
Date of loss 15-Jul-19
Date of appointment 17-Jul-19
Date of survey 16-Jul-19
Location of survey GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SMH 9115Y
Make and Model TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID 1.BS A
Date of registralinn 14-Feb-19
Excess
Market Value (est) 590,000.00
Parf Rebate [est) $40,300.00
Nett Loss (est) $49,700.00

Repair details:

[initial Estimate IE 10,486.60 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 1,946.23
Check items (estimate) 5 -

Labour 5 1.440.00
Total s 3,386.23
Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 2,700.00

[Number of days for repair | 5 DAYS |




1§ 74 74

S mam  Pelw Company Registration Mo, 19960T108R

S LI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408910 TEL : (065) 62563581 FANX : (45) 62584015

Remarks:

We have not authorized repairs. It was reported that Insured
vehicle rear-ended TP vehicle. TP LOD in.

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed Repair Cost 2,889.00 |w/gst

Loss of Use 560.00 |580 x 7 days

Loss of Rental - |no. of days

Loss of Income no. of days

GIA Search Fees

Others [Medical Bills)

R R R R R R LV

Proposed Total 3,449.00

*#*TBL - To Be Confirmed




Vic lLKI(Autn! T —

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Thursday, 27 February, 2020 9:28 AM

To: chan pick yuen; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement  Your ref : SMHI115Y Our ref : SOMOLTZE MC/KT
s+ | KK REF: CCA/ASM19012625/Ahb3

Attachments: loa INVOICE.pdf: SMH 9115Y - GIA report (SAS2635301) pdf

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe @hotmall.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February, 2020 12:26 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht®@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMH9115Y Our ref : SSMO1TZE MC/KT
Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please advise OIC & claim no .

Enclosed is the invoice , LOA ,GIA .
As request following :

1. RC S 2889 ( 52700 +7% GST - AS AGREED )
2. loss of use $700 ( $100 X 7 days- our client's car 1800CC under rental company - 5 Days
recommend - 1 days waiting PRS + 1 days weekend )

@ 100% ( DIRECT FROM BEHIND )
TOTAL $3589

Please let us have your settlement soon. . Thanks



Best Regards
Chris Chan
Green Forest Automobile Pte Lid

Hp:92712214

From: chan pick yuen
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 10:31 AM
To: DHAKAL Raghav <raghav.dhakal @axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMH9115Y Our ref : SSMO1TZE MC/KT
Dear Sir / Mdm ,
LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd.

please let us have your reply soon. Thanks

Get Qutlook for iOS

From: DHAKAL Raghav <raghav.dhakal@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 10:15:52 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: Acknowledgement Your ref : SMH9115Y Our ref : SOSMO1TZE MC/KT

“WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir,

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:
1. Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Chris Ang LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
2. Stan See Chee Seng LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
3. T. Thiyagarajan LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
4. Simon Ho/ Mohammed Rasul LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

2




5. Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
6. _Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
7. Victor Png VP Appraisal Pte Ltd

8. Edward Cho/ Cedric Ng Infiniti Appraisal Services

9. Lawrence Ng/ Jimmy Lee Priority Services

10. AXA In house surveyors AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost
of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate
quotation in order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any Injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of
action, save as to costs and expenses,

*Please note that contents of this email should not be construed as any admission of liability on the part of our
insured and/ or insurers. We hereby maintain full reservation of rights and all defences available to us.

Regards,
Raghav Dhakal

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris chanbebe@hotmall.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2019 9:24 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motar Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: KUMAR Shailendra <shailendra kumar@axa.com.sg>
Subject: SMHO115Y & S5GE19685 doa 15/7/18

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our clients GIA report .

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our clients vehicle:SMH9115Y . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

(ireen Forest Automobile Pte Ltd
Hp:92712214

——Disclaimer—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee, If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
recelved this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

% kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25 Premier @ Raki Bukit Singapore 418875

INVOICE

SYLLYS AUTO PTELTD Date; 26" FEBRUARY 20

8 Kakl Bukit Avenue 4
#05-25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Accident date:13™ JULY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SMH8115Y TOYOTA PRIUS 1.84

C Descriptions — AMOUNT
§£2.700.00

Lump Sum repair cost as rq:gmmundid by
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Emvor - Mr Adrian Ling

S/DLRS: TWO THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED EIGHTY NINE ONLY

Page 513



y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

=i 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607186-R

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Rol:  CCAISM10012625/ABNSG2

SR - owe: sz | [N
ATTN:KITTY Code: ASM
—— = . PR

Insured Veh.  SGE 19685 "u'ah. Inlpil:t&d SMH 9115Y

Policy No. GA241571 Coverage ($) 0.00

Claim No. SOMO1TZE Excess ($) 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 16/07/2019

Make & Model TOYOTAPRIUS c.C 1787

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 208

Chassis No. ZVWS08035865 Colour BLUE

Odometer 28570 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER lhdlﬁc;anrl STANDARD ALLOY RIM

R/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 TOYD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 TOYOD & mm

THE 'UEH!I:LE SUSTAINED DAMAB‘ES ATTHE REM?. FDRTION

DAM#GES SEE DETAILS.

Ar.t:lrdint Date 130772019
Survey held at GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4
#05-25 F'FIEMIER @ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPOHE 4153’?5

MTHE INSFEGTIDN WAS CDNDUCTED ON h".l"ﬂ"IHDUT PFIEJUDIGE"‘ Bﬁ.SIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR




Sds BnE B

L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

§1 Libi Ave 1 #D1-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No..1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMH 9115Y
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,250.00
LABOUR
1|BOOT LID LH LOGO (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 4500 4500
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLE LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY _ 74.10 7410
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY . 28310
1|REAR BOOT LID INMER RUBBER (COMSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY + 238.10
2|800T LID SIDE REFLECTOR @5285.00 (CONSISTENT) |NOT NECESSARY 570.00
1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
2|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE LAMP @$135.10 NOT NECESSARY 270.20 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY - 425,00 -
1|REAR BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED < 458.00 458.00
4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIPS @3%8.50 (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY “ 34.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 1.077.00 586.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @%115.00 NOT NECESSARY 230.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BUMPER REINFOROCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT - 521.00 381.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET @%$55.60 (CONSISTENT) |NECESSARY 11120 111.20
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKET @568 40 (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 136.80 -
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @3%6.50 (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 52.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 385.00 385.00
1|REAR END PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 582.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 258.00 258.00
1|REAR SPARE TIRE LOCK (COMSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 536.10 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -582.08
7.584.60 1,746 22
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} (CONSISTENT) |DAMAGED -~ 350.00 200.00
350.00 200.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18012625/Aha3q2




' 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.2 0f 2
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 60.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO REMOVE & REFIX CUSHION 120.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
GUM NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 100.00 50.00
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 800.00 600.00
BOOT LID AND REAR END PANEL
SPRAY PAINTING 800.00 700.00
217000 1,440.00

GRAND TOTAL 10,104.60 3,386.22

%y

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appralser
DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD PARTIES:- This Repor ks mads salely for the uss snd bansfi of the Clisnt named on the irent pags of this Aepon.




Vic {LI(I(Autn!

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail com>
Sent: Friday, 27 March, 2020 12:23 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMH9115Y / Ref: SOMO1TZE

Attachments: dv.png: LOA INVOICE pdf

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 2:57 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMHI9115Y / Ref: SSMO1TZE

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer further to the below email.

We had further checked and of the view that the Date of accident should be on 13/07/2019 and not 15/07/2019 as
per your client as our Insured had reported the accident on the same day as per his GIA report.

As such, kindly assist to chop and sign the amended DV and also forward to us together with the amended LOD,
ATA and Repair invoice with Accident date on 13/07/2019.

“Blease note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer ore made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or an the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclased in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer mode In respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultonts Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | emaoil: vicalpeh@@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408033)

F LAY s

e e

SLSRER == Sove the Earth Print only when necessary’

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Lise or disiribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohiblled, and may be a violation of law. If you believe Ihat you recsived this e-mail in error. please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached itams. Please dalete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sendar thal you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you
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