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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 1:50 PM
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: 6211130022SG-003

Hi Bernard, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
Insured have reported the accident on 10/09/2019 GIA report can be found in the merimen. 
 
We will inform that third party repairer to redirect the claim to insured or the valet driver directly. 
 
In view on the undertaking by the valet driver we will process to submit our w/p report and close off the matter at 
our end. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 11:44 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 6211130022SG-003 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
If the undertaking letter is signed by the valet driver, the claim should be directed to the driver instead of us. 
 
Furthermore, insured has yet to file any GIA report since DOA on 11/7/2019. We have no ground to handle the 
claim. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
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Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 17 May 2021 15:46 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 6211130022SG-003 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Bernard, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly assist and advise on the above matter. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 5:43 PM 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 6211130022SG-003 
 
Hi Bernard, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
According to insured undertaking letter Is sign my the valet driver. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>  
Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 4:35 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 6211130022SG-003 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
The undertaking letter is signed by the valet driver? 
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Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
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Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 30 August 2020 12:07 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 6211130022SG-003 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Bernard, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
We still trying to get hold of the valet company as insured have requested the valet company to undertake the case. 
 
However till date we are still not able to get in touch of anyone from valet company. 
 
Kindly advise. 
 

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 11:49 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 6211130022SG-003  
  
Hi Asher, 
  
The subject matter refers. 
  
Kindly assist to provide update/ last correspondence with TP’s repairer on the claim. 
There is no need to notify TP if there is no development. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Bernard Ler 
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AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 2:03 PM
To: Ace Autolution
Subject: RE: SGV1154J BREAKDOWN
Attachments: LETTER OF UNDERTAKING.PDF; OI SKETCH PLAN.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Insured have inform that the person that resposible for the mention accident should be the valet driver that was 
driving that day. 
 
Valet driver have sign the understake letter from AIG to understake the matter. 
 
Kindly rediect the claim the valet driver. 
 
We will process to close off the matter at our end. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 5:46 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SGV1154J BREAKDOWN 
 
Dear Sir / Madam , 
 
For the breakdown of this vehicle SGV1154J as below : 
 
Cost of Repair : $3100.00  
Rental Fee : $1680.00 x 12 days 
Towing Fee : $50.00 
LTA search : $7.45 
 
Total amount : $4837.45 
 
Thank you . 
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Regards , 
Anna 
ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD 
13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 , 
#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE 
SINGAPORE 417807  
Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134 
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