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S UBEAVE 1, 80225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINCAPORE 408930 TEL 651 62563561 FAN LS H23RANLE

Yourref:  D19004600MFSH

Our ref: CS/FC119012559/AvE3 Date : 13/8/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. GBB 8608K
We thank you for your instruction on 16/7/2019
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

16/7/2019  at the premises of M/s LIANG HEE MOTOR
and have the following Lo report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount 1 5$$12,552.00

Revised Estimate Amount + 834,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 155

MNett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

. f
rear portion -

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRLAN LING WAI FING
B.Eng.MSGE.MIHTE,AMSAEqﬂ-,M.MATN
Licensed Appraiser



Ms @ FirstCapital

B Rafibes Quay #21-00 Singapore Q48580
Tek (656222 2311 Fax: [B5)6222 3547

M3 First Capital Ingurdnoe Limited coreg Mo 2950000060 5T Aeg Mo M2 00016759

Claims & Metor Undewaiting Depe 36 Robinson Road £16-01 City House Singapore 068377

Tet (65] 6507 3048 Fax: (5) 6507 3849
wiww. matirsteanital com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 15-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004600MFSH
Accident Date 12-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB3567G Third Party Vehicle. GBBEBE0EK

Survey Location

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-62

Contact Person. DAVID

Contact No. 67474416/ 97527252 Fax No. 67472935
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

LIANG HEE MOTOR

Cc : Workshop WORKSHOP Attention. NIL
. JUSEQUITY LAW .

Cc : TP Solicitor CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge HENRY KAO

k A
1*5._ A
IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required

[ssan




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 12:19 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Ce: 'Henry Kao Cai Jig'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004600M FSH/1, GBB BE0BK
Attachments: GBBE 8608K PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBB 8608K
Date of survey: 16/7/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-2561 | email ;sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2019 12:11 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004600MFSH/1, GBB 8608K

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBB 8608K on 16/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408233)

From: CWS Maotor Claims [rnaiIto:cwsmotr::rcIaims@msfirstcapitai.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 2:04 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motar Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004600MF5H/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CW5 for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



- Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 20719 12:11 FM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004600MFSH/1, GBB B608K

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBB 8608K on 16/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 2:04 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao <HenryKao@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004600MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owrer 1D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
tanufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jul 2019

PARFICOFE Rahata Fnoning

Company
3117

GERBA0BK
Mo

17 Jul 2019
PEUGECT

PARTMER 1.6 VAN (LWE] EXTN

Grey

2009
10JBCBOOSBS20
WFATFFHXC 71244170
$21,373.00

25 Jun 2010

25 Jun 2010

 §

$1,06%.00

Mo

$0.00

24 Jun 2020

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$30,189.00

$2.826.00

$2.826.00

EnqUIrEReDatey FUDICEEToreUBregINpUL/FUNG | IUN_ILSFUSUAULYT

11
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KK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey beforelafier spray painting
« To display damaged partls] during resurvey
« Parts prices are eybsprt 1o confirmation
» Third party survey B ona “iaiithout Frejudice” bi2ss
 No fllegai modificanonis} allowed
= Supplementary Memis] mice! be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval froim rraurante COmpany

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;_j‘.. ;; - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapors 408933
/—_—. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. No: 199607156R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
M3 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI9012559/Avf3n2
#15.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 088877 o e ””m"“"""mm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 3567G Veh. Inspected GBEB BEOBK
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004600MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From HENRY KADQ Assign Date 16/07/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model PEUGEOT PARTNER c.C 1560
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. VF3TFOHXC9J244170 Colour GREY
Odometer 386532 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 TOYO 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[195/65 R15 TOYO B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 TOYO & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 TOYO 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/07/2019 Inspection Date 16/07/2019
Survey held at LIANG HEE MOTOR WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-62 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

sb. Estimate Days of Repair

JEETII'I.-'IATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:t of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBB 8608K
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | FSLmae {:}} ﬁi}"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP @3%48.00 NOT NECESSARY 98.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 580.00 580.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @$65.00 MNECESSARY 130.00 130.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 520,00 520.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE GARMISH @$280.00 TORM 560.00 560.00
1|REAR END PAMEL QUTER TO REPAIR SEE 595.00 -
LABOUR
2| TAILLAMP @$280.00 CRACKED 560.00 560.00
1|REAR LH DOOR DENTED 1,320.00 1,320.00
1|REAR LH DOOR LOCK JAMMED 294 .00 29400
1|REAR LH DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE cuT 249.00 249.00
1|REAR LH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 54.00 -
1|PEUGEQT WORDING NECESSARY 123.00 123.00
1|REAR RH DOOR DENTED 1,285.00 1.295.00
1|REAR RH DOOR LOCK JAMMED 294.00 294 00
1|REAR RH DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE CcuT 249,00 248,00
1|PARTNER WORDING NECESSARY 895.00 95.00
1|REAR EXHALUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 795.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 35.00 -
1|SPARE TYRE HOLDER BRACKET BENT 298.00 298.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -659.70
8,172.00 5,937.30
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 30.00 30.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE HOLDER (SN} DEFORMED 30.00 30.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) HNOT NECESSARY G0.00
1|REAR LH DOOR GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
T1|REAR LH DOOR ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 120.00 80.00
1|REAR RH DOOR GLASS SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00

Report Ref No, CS/FCI19012559/Avi3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page MNo.:2 of 2

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

r Ad d
aty Description of Parts Condition WE::LT:;‘; ?;}} Ou ts{"‘“
1|5 PAX STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
1|7T0KMH STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 10.00 10,00
640.00 460.00
LABOUR

PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,400.00 700.00

EMND PAMEL QUTER,
SPRAY PAINTING, 1,200.00 600.00
WIRING, 50.00 30.00
TO UNDERSEAL. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY. 150.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER REAR LH AND RH DOOR FITTINGS. 300.00 120.00
TO REMOVE REAR LH AND RH DOOR GLASSES, 240,00 120.00
TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIPE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 :
3,740.00 1.670.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,552.00 8,067.30
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,000,00

MARKET VALUE: $7,000.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $2,800.00=NETT VALUE: $4,200.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19012559/Avf3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Repart is made solely for the uss and bonafit of the Clisnt named on the frong page of this Ropor,




