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Insured;

Main Claimant: IAN TAN IT-RONG, 10: 583151078

Vehicle Reg, No.: _S_I__R_QES_-I}'R o | Date of Loss:
Claim Type: TP/ ENMIEDEGEEB?EDE Palicy/Cover Note No.:
vehicle Reg. No. {Insured}: SMMS5108T Palicy Mo. (Claimant]:

) Excess:
|| Repairer:

| Handling Insurer:
| Claimant's lnsurer;
| Adjuster:

- B

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
There ara no mail far this case.

D —

D Crate Priarity  Type Tashk Group Subject Handler Assigned By
No resulls.
|

Premium Automobiles Pta Ltd (UBI) 55 Ubl Road 1, 408699 Ubi -
_China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6388 6111 .., [Handled by Elaine Cheong]
Auto & General Insurance {Singapora) Pte. Limited. (HQ) - Tel: 6540 2180

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 25/07/2019] |

|
E
| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view Al | SearchTasks |  CreateMew Task

Completed On

[Created by insurer]

|12/07/2019 21:00-:59 .
 DMPCSN3049401900
|P10077338R00
|5$500.00

Tel: 67689828/9827/9911
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- Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com:

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 3:01 PM

To: Claims Dept; assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SNM19D203287/CHEONGML - FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLR4354R AND YOUR

INSURED SMM5108T ON 12/7/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLR4354R
Our Ref: SNM19D203287C02/8(EC)

Dear Tony,
We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.

Liability is clear and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based on findings from
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, with supporting documents.

Aside to M/s LKK Auto,
Please assist to arrange for the survey.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motar Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079908

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 B530

Fax: 6224 7478 | 8224 7175

Email: elaine cheong@@sg. cntaiping.com
Website www. sg.cntaiping.com

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July, 2019 1:03 PM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong
<elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: SNM19D203287/CHEONGML - FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLR 4354 R AND YOUR INSURED SMMS108T
ON 12/7/2019

Dear Elaine.
Kindly advise who should we arrange survey with?

Thank you.



Best Regards.
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 19990227 1'W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699

p. ~635 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg W. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938
TR k] f

RV o]

p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi.Q8

Welcome to the Bt Dirrie'i'_nﬁii::}g':._
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From: Claims [maiitﬂ:-;Ia1rns:-:_a:premiumaum.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 11:48 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'; 'Elaine Cheong’; 'Alfred Toh'; 'Chee So Chow'

Cc: 'Claims'

Subject: RE: SNM19D203287/CHEONGML - FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLR 4354 R AND YOUR INSURED SMM5108T
ON 12/7/2019

Dear all,

Attached is the estimate for your kind reference.

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sp.cntaiping.com>

sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 2:13 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Alfred Toh

<alfred toh@se cntaiping.com>; Chee 5o Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: SNM19D203287/CHEONGML - FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLR 4354 R AND YOUR INSURED SMMS108T ON
12/7/2019

Dear Elaine,
Please conduct PRS for SLR4354R.

Officer in charge - Elaine Cheong 63896530.

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Z




DID: (65) 63896156 | F: (65) 62247175

| W: www sa cntaiping.com | FB: www. facebook comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat: +T-4 4 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is infended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential infarmation. Any
ynaithonzed disGIosUre, use ar dizsemination of this message, either in whole o parlial, is profubited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sander immedialely. Flease delete the e-mail and any copias of it theraafter

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sgl

Sent: Saturday, July 13, 2019 1:05 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: claims@premiumauio.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLR 4354 R AND YOUR INSURED SMM5108T ON 12/7/2019

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case. We propose for 100% direct settlement in our
clients favour.

We herein attached the GlA report for your reference.

we will forward you the estimate once is available.

please let us know who should we looking for arrange survey.
We have arrange survey with owner an 18/7/2015@10am.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 65768 0911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.s w. www.audi.com.s

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281_A1exandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

ast companion.

Find out more

Email Disclaimer
ELL T
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: weron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 9:13 AM

To: Carrine Leong; SUR

Cc 'Chang Chee Sing';jiayee.g.rap@premiumau‘m.cnm.sg

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLR4354R - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 19 JUL 13
Dear Carrine.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm repair cost of $4420.60 before GST @ 3 days of repairs.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Con='tants Pte Lid

pPhone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Carrine Loong ~carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2019 3:23 PM

To: Veron Chen (LK Aute) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=

Subject: FW: FINAL REVISION - SLRA354R - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 19 JUL 19

From: Carrine Leong [ ;.i_lm;:,arrine.ieang@nremlumautu.cmm.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 September, 2019 2:21 PM

To: 'Veron Chen' <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; ‘Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)' <adrianling@lkkauto.com=
Cc: 'Chang Chee Sing' <t laims@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'jiaveeyap@premiumautn.mm.sg‘
<jiayee.yap . ' ILQ.COMm.SE>

Subject: FW: AL CVISION - SLRA354R - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 19JUL19

Hi Adrian av !’

Revised estin
Please confirin re|

Your early «

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong,
Claims Adminis

Premium Auto
55 Libi Road 1

1 photographs is attached.

Lir cost of $4420.60 @ 3 days of repairs.

well appreciated.

Luel (keg Mo 1me227IW]



p. +65 6388 2322 d. 4
‘a, carrine.leong M oren
Audi Showroo!

a—

589925 f. +65 6841 1183

rnauto.com.sg W, www.audi.com.sg
ntre 281 Alexandra Road Singaporeé 159938 p. +65 6836 2223 -

Email Disclaimer
This amail, lmclud
If you hawve rece
Please do not Copy

From: Boo son ya!
Sent: Thursd - 22
To: Adrian L <~
<carring.leor

<claims@pre:

Subject: FIll, LV

Hi Adrian an

Revised estie

Please conl g

Your early ¢! st

Best regards -

. confidential and may alsa be privileged
ify 15 Immediately by reply pmall and then delete this message from your SySTer.
curpose, or disclose its contents of any attachment 10 any other person, Thank you

[ -.ﬂg:hnuiﬂhmw@gmail.ccm]
agust, 2019 2:42 PM
ng@lkkauto.com>; cs-@ @lkkauto. com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Carrine Leong
imauto.com.sg>; jiayee.ya remiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
to,com.SE=
11 - SLR4354R - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 19JUL19

| nhotographs is attached.
- cost of $4420.60 @ 3 days of repairs.

“+ well appreciated.
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the detals of the accaden to speed ug the daims process

2 This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior the Authorised Driver

3 Informatian provided must be as iruthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companses 1o
repudiate policy liability

4. The issus and acceptanca of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy lighfty on the part ol the insurance companses

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

f, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Maragement Centre estanished Dy e General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon apphicaton by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you heretry consant to the archiving of this report 2 the centre and to copies of the repor being made avalasie
aforesasd

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
Date Of Report 1370772019 08:29
Date Of Accident 1200742018 21:50
Exact Location OF Accident ALONG CTE(SLE) MEAR BRADDEL EXIT
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Mumber SLR4354R
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Cwner 1AM TAN IT-RONG
MRIC Mo 58315107
Email Address KIXIAN@GMAIL COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-94550798
Alternative Phone Mo OFFICE-24550798
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer AUDI
Maodel A3 CABRIOLET 1.4 TFS

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al

time of accident PRIVATE USE

Are ynu_maiming und_&r your own insurance policy NO

for repair fo your vehicle?

If No, Pleasze state action lo be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Calegory FPRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company AUTO & GENERAL INSURANGCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LIMITED
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number P10077338R00

Ceover Note Mumber

Driver

Name of Driver IAN TAN IT-RONG
MRIC No S5B3151078

Date Of Birth 26/05/1983

Ceoupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 17/12/2003

Driving Experience 15 YEARS AND 6 MOMNTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-84550798
Fax Mumber

Contact Number OFFICE-94550798
EMail Address XIXKIAN@GMAIL .COM

Page 1 of 16



33 PUNGGOL FIELD
#09-16

Postcode B28817
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWMER

Address

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TQO REAR
Weathar Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

MNumber of vehicles (including own vehicle) 2

involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or properly damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person{z) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Drver) 2

Fasasngel 1 NAME: . SAMANTHA XU

GENDER: : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the acciden! reported to the police? NO
If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? MO
If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

OM 12/7/2019 AT AROUND 2150 HRS, | WAS TRAVELLING ON THE EXTREME RIGHT LANE OF CTE(SLE). AS THERE WAS
A TRAFFIC JAM, | CAME TO A STOP. | THEN FELT THAT THE REAR OF MY CAR WAS HIT BY THE VEHICLE BEHIND ME

Attachment(s)

Are accidenl photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera? WO
VWas there any audio recorded? WO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number SMMS108T
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HONDA
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Calegory PRIVATE CAR
Mame of Driver CHAN YIN KAl
NRIC/Passport Number S7000086E
Contact Mumber 96860986

Address

Postocode
Insurance Company Name

BLK 81 TIONG POH ROAD
#02-49

160081

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

Page 2 of 16



Mature OFf Damage
Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)
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BUdg’ et Certificate of Insurance
DI‘.I’ECt Comprehensive Car Palicy

insurance policy Number: P10077338R0D

Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks And Compensation) Act {Chapter 189) (Republic of Singapore), Motor Wehicles {Third-Party
Risks And Compensation) Rules, 1996 Edition {Republic of Singapore), Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia), Metor Wehicles
{Third-Party Risks) Rules, 1959 (Malaysia) or any Amendment, Act or Acts passed in substitution thereof,

Certificate Number P10077338R00 (Comprehensive / Authorised Driver Plan)

|_1] Vehicle Registration Number : SLR4354R
Chassis Number 3 WALUZZZEW2I1005419
2) Effective Date [ Time of Commencement 15/08/2018 (00:00)
of Insurance for the Purpose of the Act
3) Date / Time of Expiry of Insurance 1 14/08/2019 (23:59)
4) Excess (i) Policy : S£ 600.00
(ii} Windscreen : S% 100.00
5) Policyholder : Tan lan It-Rong

6) Persons or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive*
Brivers named as a Main / Named Driver in this Certificate of Insurance and any other person provided he is driving on
the Policyholder's arder or with the Policyholder's permission. Househaold members of the Main Driver not named in this
Certificate of Insurance will not be coverad.

Provided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive the
Mator Vehicle or has been so permitted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law or by any reason of any
enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motor Vehicle. And provided further that the Motor Vehicle is
registered under the Road Traffic Act and its registration under the Road Traffic Act has not been cancelled at the time
of accident or loss. Please refer to the Product Disclosure Document for full terms and conditions.

Main Driver / Date of Birth . Ian Tan It-Rong (26/05/1983)
Named Driver{s) / Date of Birth : Samantha Xu Jia Ling (19/11/1984)

7) Limitation as to use*
Use enly for social, domestic and pleasure purposes. The Policy does not cover use for hire or reward, tuition or driving
tests, racing, pace-making, reliability trials, speed-testing or the carriage of goods other than samples in connection with
any trade or business or use for any purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.

= | imitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicles {Third-Party Risks and Compensation ) Act (Chapter
189) and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia), are not to be included under these headings.

8} Finance Company : Malayan Banking Berhad

1/ We hereby certify that the pelicy to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the provisions of the Motor
vehicles {Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part I\ of the Road Transport Act, 1587 (Malaysia) or
any Amendment, Act or Acts passed in substitution thereof,

Issued in Singapore an Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited
12/07/2018 Trading as Budget Direct Insurance
Simon Birch

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. J01626103G), trading as Budget Direct Insurance
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01, Singapore Shopping Centre, Singapore 239924 Tel: 6221 2111 budgetdirect.com.sg
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Premium Automobiles

55 |Jbi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Email: Mora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate +  Accident Repairs
Workshop - UbiRoadl

Contact No :  B3AR6 2323

Fax No - 68411183
Reference - PASTR/DBSS/2019/NS
Date . 16-Jul-19

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your insured vehicle is : SMM5108T

China Talping Insurance (SG) Pte Ltd
105 Cecil Street

#19-00 The Octagon

Singapore 069534

Attn: Ms Angie - Motor Claims Dept/Windscreen
Tel: 6389 6541 - Fax: 6224 7175

Owner's Name :  Mr.Tan It-Reng lan
Address * 33 Punggol Field
#09-16
Singapore 828817
Telephone :  (HP)94550798
Type of Claim ¢ Third Party Claims
Policy No. :  P10O077338ROO
Vehicle No : SLR4354R
Model Code = A3 Cabriolet 1.4 TFSI
Model / Year 1 Aug-l17
Engine No :  CZC736164
Chassis Mo T WAUZZZEVZ2]1005419
Mileage :
Date In H
Liability .
Excess Cost L
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 12-Jul-19

Place of Accident :  Along CTE(SLE) Near Braddel Exit



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6B411183

Telefax
Estimate
Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
i To remove and transfer rear parking aid. Check SN 8000 o7

function.

To dismantle and renew rear bumper assy. Re- P
2 organise rear crash management components. s l,ﬂf}nycﬁn
Reinstall all parts removed.

3 Torespray rear bumper. 5 gw A &5
4 To carry out diagnostic check S/IN 5 192.00 .

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES T 2,422.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel: 63662323 Fax:56841 1183

Telefax

SLR Hasu R
Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn NoJ SLT 6469 U

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1  REAR BUMPER COVER WL({ s  1,793.00 —
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS EM s 5 175.00 €
3 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION LH / RH 3 30.00 +
4  LOCKING MECHANISM ¢ 4= S 53.00 +
5 REAR BUMPERSPOILER  ¢f 5 216,00 v~ ¢
6  REINFORCEMENT BEAM AR 5 522.00 4+ (S
7  REARBUMPERBRACKETLH Y- , S 25.00
8  REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH 5 26.00 4
9  REAR SENSOR PARKING AID ' s 462.00*
10  SEALRING f o 5 8.00 ~
11 REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LH/RH | 5 76.00 ~,
12 SUNDRIES T Noc S 800.00 ':x”' A0
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,186.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGE $ 2,422.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,608.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : flemarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 4086599

Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

LKK Auto Consultants hence notity
the Repairer of INE

« To resurvey belora/after spray paining

« To display damaged part{s) during resurvey
» Parts prices are §

Telefax or s
= Third r,ar'-,- BUTVEY
» Mo illegal modification(s) i ailowet
» Supplamentar
ia subject lo final

Name : ﬂdﬁm Lvt_:] Acknowiedged by Repairer

Surveyed Date - 19 .r9 E’J (1. Signature:

Authorised Date e

Excess Cost

Liability -

Remarks . fatlonsed

Please Note «  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate +  Accident Repairs
Workshop ¢ UbiRpad1

Contact No + 6366 2323

Fax No A 6841 1183
Reference . PATPIOB59/2019/NS
Date + A6-Jul-19

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your insured vehicle is : SMM5108 T

China Taiping Insurance (SG) Pte Ltd
105 Cecll Street

#19-00 The Octagon

Singapore 069534

Attn: Ms Angie - Motor Claims Dept/Windscreen
Tel: 6389 6541 - Fax: 6224 7175

Owner's Name +  Mr. Tan It-Rong lan
Address = 33 Punggol Field
#09-16
Singapore 82B817
Telephone +  (HP) 84550798
Type of Claim *  Third Party Claims
Policy No. :  P10077338R0O0
Vehicle No - SLRA4354R
Model Code - A3 Cabriolet 1.4 TFSI
Model | Year i Aug-17
Engine No . CZC 736164
Chassis No ¢ WAUZZZAaV211005418
Mileage :
Date In :
Liability g s
Excess Cost : -
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo [/ Allan Wu
Accident Date : 12-Jul-19

Place of Accident . Along CTE(SLE) Near Braddel Exit



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Read 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6341 1183

Telefax
SLR U3
Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SET 64890
Estimated Surveyor's
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
; Toremove and transfer rear parking aid. Check &N 8000 8 S0
function.
To dismantle and renew rear bumper assy. Re-
2 organise rear crash management components. 1,060.00 § 700.00
Reinstall all parts removed.
3 To respray rear bumper. 80000 § 700.00
4 To carry out diagnostic check SN 192.00 § 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 242200 § 1,872.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408693
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
sLR udski

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn NoJ SET6469 U
Damage Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SiNett Remarks
1 REAR BUMPER COVER 3 1,793.00 $ 1,793.00
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS B 175.00
3 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION LH/RH 2% 30.00
4 LOCKING MECHANISM 2 3 53.00
5 REAR BUMPER SPOILER 3 216.00 § 216.00
B REINFORCEMENT BEAM % 52200 § 522.00
7 REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH 3 25.00
8 REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH -] 26.00
9  REAR SENSOR PARKING AID 5 462.00
10 SEAL RING 5 8.00
11 REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LH/RH $ 76.00
12 SUNDRIES 3 80000 § 17.60
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,186.00 § 2,548.60
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGE $ 2,422.00 $ 1,872.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,608.00 § 4,420.60

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Mot approved
Spare parts are Special Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregNo:129607198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@l.kkauto.mm:assignmenls@1kkautn.cum

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI19012550/AVF3N2

Date: 02/10/2019
EF! M
Handling China Taiping Insurance i
b (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Policy No: DMPCSN3049401200
Claimant Insured
VehldaNg: DroER Vehlcke gz P MBIGRT
Date of Loss:  12/07/2019 tep . mp Claim  5NM19D203287C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLR4354R
Make & Model: AUDI A3, 1.4 SEDAN TFSI COD S-TRONIC (A)  Engine No: CZCT36164
Reg. Date: 15/08/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: WALUZZZ8YV211005419
Colour: While Odometer: 40866 km
Engine Capacity: 1385 cc
Marke:-t Value/Mew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55R16
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depll
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 4,1856.00 2,548.60 1,637 .40 38,12
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.422.00 1,872.00 550.00 221
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S%) 6,608.00 4,420.60 2,187.40 33.10
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 482.56 309.44 153.12 33.10
Nett Amount (S$%) 7.070.56 4,730.04 2,340.52 33.10
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16/07/2019
Date Inspected: 19/07/2018 Inspected At: Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This repor represents our findings &l the time and place of inspection stated heren. Such inspectian has been camed out 10 the best of our
knawledge and ability but any other fabilly under any ather circumstances is hereby exprassly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/ claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 2/ 0/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS =
Reference '
Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 02 Oct 2019)

| Parts: 143 ALDI A2 1.4 SEDAN TFSI COD S-TROMIC (A} (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairars {Price-denominated Standard List)

\Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLR4354R)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

_ numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *, !

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNe. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 “‘REAR BUMPER COVER Deformed 1,793.00FS *1,793.00 FS
2 1 *REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS Mot Necassary 175.00F5 *-FS
3 2 *REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION LH/RH Mot Mecessary 30.00FS *F3
4 2 *LOCKING MECHANISM Mot Necessary 53.00F5 “.F§
5 1 *REAR BUMPER SPOILER Cut 216.00F5  *216.00F3
6 1 *REINFORCEMENT BEAM Bent 522 00FS *522.00F5
7 1 *REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH Mot Necessary 25.00FS *FS
8 1 *REAR BUMPER BRACKET RH Mot Necessary 26.00F3 “~FS
=] 1 *REAR SENSOR PARKING AID Mot Necessary 462 .00F3 “-FS
0 1 *SEAL RING Mot Mecessary 8.00FS “F5
11 2 *REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LH/RH Mot Necessary 76.00F5 *FS
12 1 *SUNDRIES Mecessary BOD.OOFS “47.60FS

F=Franchise parl. S=Spchett.

Total Parts (S5) 4,186.00 2,548.60

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. i

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 2/10/201 9
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR PARKING New 280.00 280.00
AID.CHECK FUNCTION
2 TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW REAR BUMPER ASSY.RE- New 1,050.00 700.00

ORGANISE REAR CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED

3 TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER New 800.00 700.00
4 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK New 182.00 192.00

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 2,422.00 1,872.00
r Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. j

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merime n.com/claims/index.cfm 2fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 2/1 02019



