HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
Tel: (65) 6661 9688 Fax: (65) 6661 9699 Email: info@huahong.com.sg

Estimate Repair List
QUOT201907-000035

25 July 2019
HHTPCLAIMS19-123

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET, #04-00 / #05-00

IOB BUILDING
SINGAPORE 049711

Attn: Motor Claims Department
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX3925T & SH9484K ON 10/07/2019 ALONG RANGE ROAD BESIDE

SCAPE TRAFFIC JUNCTION AT ABOUT 1015 HOURS g 76 64
Insured :  HUAHONG PTE LTD /) i )
Vehicle Registration No. 2 SLX3925T
Vehicle Make 3 HONDA L T 4 2 9
Vehicle Model :  SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTO 6
Vehicle Chassis No. . GP71109398 , 2 76 4
Policy No. . 5087272209-02
Date of Accident : 10/07/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/IN Quantity Description Unit Price 8§  Amount S$
1 1  Front Bumper 7 (ﬂ/ $ 1,050.20 /
2 10 Front Bumper Clip ~ /g8 $ 3.90 $ 39.00 77
3 Z | Front Bumper Retainer (LH/RH) £ 7 I3 s 15608 3120 [S007
4 1 Front Griller Chrome (Lower) X A/N $ 22070 X
5 1 Front Reinfor q 49 297.00 X
cement X NN [ $
—~ 7970 $ 1638.10
Less 20% $  327.62
¥ 76-64 $ 131048
6 1 Front No. plate NETT $ 35.00 X
To dismantle & change Front bumper, Front Reinforcement, Knocking & pull $  600.00 J7g
straight Front chassis Frame and all area affected by accident
To perform wire checking $ 20.00/
To spray Front bumper, Front Reinforcement, Front Reinforcement and Front $ 600.00}1/
chassis frame [/ 2 ﬂ
. q 99 a e
J\fé’“’ ( LK’() J /7//% ity $ 2,565.48
3 (Jw‘j ( 7%GST §  179.58
L V4 Total § _ 2,745.06
fe Y Al
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
U‘TO Repairer of the following:
A CED » To resuvey bfoelatier soray
NV, L/ \ ;’-‘?,-,-' o * To display damaged pari(s) MP:WM

* Parts prices are subject to confirmation
« Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
* No illegal modification(s) is allowed

Authorised by Claims Dept * Supplementary item(s) must be resurv
is subject to final approval from lrmnv::o“ Cd~wuvy
Co. Reg. No. 200900309M |  huahong.comig Ackpowtedgast ty fgpeler 200900309M
Signature: Phge 1 of 1

Date:




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, December 02, 2019 5:26 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation for SLX3925T

Hi Steve

Confirmed COR $1296.64.

Let me know the OIC in charge so | can forward my LOD over, thanks.

Thanks & Regards
AshLeg Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

(R
fllin MG

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 6:27 PM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: Finalisation for SLX3925T

Dear Ashley,

Kindly follow up.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, November 06, 2019 7:05 PM
To: Ashley Tan

Subject: Finalisation for SLX3925T

Dear Ashley,



Kindly refer our finalize $1296.64 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Ashley Tan [mailto:ashley@huahong.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, November 06, 2019 4:24 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Finalisation for SLX3925T

Dear Steve

Please refer to photos attached and confirm finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
AshLeg Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg
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