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LCRF FTELTD

CARROS CENTER
60 JALAN LAM HUAT #0401 5(737869)
Main +65 62524991 (]

Ms AIG Singapore
Date 21/6/2019
Attn : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

ESTIMATE
VEMICLE NO. : SLK 7745M
CHASSIS NO - GP71043767
MAKE / MODEL : Honda Shuttle Hybnid 1.5 Auto
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 10/07/2019
YOUR INSURED VEMICLE NUMBER : SLKB B315T
MILEAGE * 223734 km

nm.fmm QrY UNITPRICE  LIST PRICE

1 Reartailgate 1% S185000  S1ES0.00 [7977
7 Reartaigatelock . T 1P¢ $ss000  sssao0 /907
3 Rear tallagte lock catch X e $158.00 $158.00%

13 Rear talgate Honda emblem X 1PC $81.30 $81.30 X

14 Rear taiigate Hydrid embiem ¢ z{‘ IPC 58840 58840 S0
15 Rear tailgate shuttle emblam ~ 19C 568 .40 saaa0 T{~
16 Rearbumper -~ [l 1PC 5135000  s13sa00 /007
23 Rear bumper R tow cover X 1IPC $68.00 $68.00 ¥

24 Rear bumper RH side retainer X IPC $12800 $128.00%

25 Resr bumper L side retainer . (If ¢ sueo0 _ suse 07

; ustroTALSS: — saesot0 U707
20.00% DISCOUNT SS: _ 389802 _ - )7,

$3,552.08 J I‘, ‘g
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Reverso ,"
censor 1 SET $260.00
Windscreen seatant ) SET s12000 4
Body Sealant 1 SET s300.00 J7
Bumper clips 1 SET 512000 J0
End panei 1o garnish clips L SET 8000 J
Special Nate Towsl 55— 588000 ]/
LABOUR CHARGES
To labour cahrge for rmoving rear taligate out 1o facilitate repairs and 560000 Sog
replacement of damaged parts
To respray rear bumper and rear taligate $800.00 400
To remowe and install resr tailgate glass s12000 3~
To apply rustproffing and treatment on replacement of parts sis000 J7
To ransfer milgate mecnanism __53_09;2_1,0
LABOUR TOTALSS:  §1,700.00 ’g"g
TOTAL S§: $6.172.08
7% GST $432.05
GRAND TOTALSS. _ 55,604 13
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Tt chi @ 1K com
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LCRF PTELTD
CARROS CENTER
60 JALAN LAM HUAT #04-01 §(737859)
Main +65 62524991

M1 AlG Singapore

Date 21/6/2019

Attn ; MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

ESTIMATE

VEHICLE NO. - SLK 7745M

CHASSIS NO : GP71043767

MAKE / MODEL : Honda Shuttie Hybeid 1.5 Aute
DATE OF ACCIDENT | 10/07/2018

YOUR INSURED VEHICLE MUMBER : SLXE 84157
MILEAGE . 223734 kmy

Ml!!.?m QY  UMITPRICE  LIST PRICE
! Reartallgate IrC 51,850.00 $1,850.00
2 peartailgatetock - [T 1PC 555000  $550.00
3 Senesahagietensatah— A3 58— 5358850~
L3 fmartaigate Honds-emiiem We—Str30—saran-
14 Rear taligate Hybrid emblem 7 ””:g 1°C $88.40 $82.40
15 Rear taligate shuttle emblam 1PC $88.40 $88.40
16 Rearbumper .- [fIf} IPC S135000  $1.350.00
B Saar-busipoc-RH Low-coves—K PS5 66— 36006~
25 Rear bumpar LH side retainer 7 0‘ IPC 511&:00 _ _’__;_ "
- LST TOTALSS: ~ $4,490.10
20.00% DISCOUNT sS:
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SPECIAL NETT

Reverss sensor 1587 $260.00 2”
Windscreen sealant 18ET s12000 40
Body Sealant 1SET $30000 19
e il o i prony U
o garn 1SET S80.00 / e
Special Nett Total $5:  "$830.00 — -
LABOUR cHARGES V
Ta labour for $600.00 29
ah::‘ muv::nmwhtewuomnaumnmd 5
tommvmrbumrwnrwhu 5800.00 yod
To remave and install rear tailgate glass $120.00 ’/
Tnmwmmmmmmmmum Sis000 J7
To transfer tallgate mechanism s Jo __—
LABOUR TOTALSS: ™ $1300.00 (R v
TOTALSS: &
™ 657 54;:: <
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Steve Chen SI.I(I( Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong®lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 8:50 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Final Bill SLK7745M

Dear sir

Ok confirmed lump sum $2850.00/4days

Regards

S.T.Sim (62524991)
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04- D1Carros Centre

Singapore 737869
ﬁ] 2o

On Tue, Jul 30. 2019 at 8:38 AM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen/@lkkauto com> wrote:

Dear Mr Sim,

We have come out with the finalize $2850 (L/S, before GST), 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,



