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- Notification Of Accident For Our Insured Veh SJV4330L

- From: Fan, Winnle-LW

To:

Cc

Sent:  7/12/2019 9:01:44 AM

Attachments: %) 5138810 (TA Search pd(T) 543301 SAS Repart.pdi

Hi LEK,

q.‘%"'(”“@lﬂﬂ"\

Kindly assist to survey, file is already created in Merimen | i { | n

Workshop detall: Fﬁ{ﬂf\ N Eucﬁgn
EVELYN NG (HP 9695 5547) Mw P
NGS TRADING

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Pk 2a

#02-01 AMK AutoPoint

Singapore 568047

Winnie Fan

AIG

Claims Service Associale

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific insurance Pte. Lid

7B Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore p7g120

winnie-w.fan@aig.com | www.3igsg

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Tha information in this ema [ang any attachments) & confidential If you s nof the itanded recipenl, you Inust nol Lae of disseminahe the
information I you have recedvet this smail in armor please mmadiataly natily ing by "Raply” command and permarently dilets (he anginal and any
capies or printouts thereol Athough his pmail aid oy GiTachmends ane Batieved jo be free of any vires or e gedact fhat might alfect any
comipifer systam o wihich if 12 roceved and opened. i is He resgonabiity of the Mol i eneun that il ia virus fres and No regponsibilily &

acopplod by AlG fov sny loss or dhmage Grising m @y Wiy frowen i1 UsR

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this email (and any aitachments) is confidential. if you are not the intanded recipient, you must nol use or
disseminate the infarmation, If you have recalved this emall in error, please immadiately notity me by “Reply” command and
parmanently delete the original and any coples of printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free
of any virus or other dafect that might affect any computer system into which it is recelved and opened, it is the rasponsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no rasponsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiarias or
affiliates ether jontly o saverally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Asher 5nﬂ [LI[KAutu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 1031 AM

To: EVELYNNGSTRADINGEGMAILCOM

Subject: Accident Invalving SJV 4330L & SLK 3881D on 05/07/2019
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident Invelving SIV 4330L & 5LK 3881D on 05/07/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settiement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Beit Regoras,

Asher Sng | Cosa Handler

LKK Aute Comsultanis Ple Lid

phons: 6841-6051 | emod: gshenng@lkkauto com | fox: 6741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industriol Pork, Ul Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5{408733)



Asher Sns (LKKAuto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 11:03 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 3881D (Ol) AND SJV 4330L (TP) ON 05/07/2019
Follow Up Flag: Fallow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher,

You may have mandate up to $3,327.45 subject to supporting docs.
Thank you

Best regards

Loh Chee Heng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pta. Ltd

AIG Bullding, 78 Shentan Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tal +(65) 6419 1881

Chee-Hang. L oh@aig.com | www.8ig.5q

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visir to learn more.

Follow us:

INFORTANT NOTICE

T aforrration o fius sereanl (and any attachmenis) @ confidantial. if you are nar the wilended recorent. you must not use or SSSeTVIEIe e

formsaticonn. I youw haee receivied e amad in error, phease immediately notly ma by “RAenly”™ covrimarnrkd anhg permanently gedate the orcnnl arxy S

UL uitouds (heveot, Although fhe emal and any attactmonts are belheved o De fres of ATy Vi offhaer aefect ihar gt alfect sy compunm
ppmlam e whch 1 e recoived and openod, I 8 the responsibilly of the recmenl 1o anawro Ral © & eirss ree ang Ao resporeduiily B sccembed by AIG

Tar iy K8s MiEgE Brsing &1 any way from s usa

From: Asher Sng [LEKAuUto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com])

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 10:47 AM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 3881D (O1) AND SJV 4330L (TP) ON 05/07/2018,

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Your Ref: 4810B656215G




Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 38810 (O1) AND SJV 4330L (TP) ON 05/07/2019.

Mandate summary and relevant document submitted in merimen,

For your approval please,

Thank You.

Bt Regords

Asher Sng | Cose Hondler

LEE Autlo Consultants Ple Lid

phongs: 841-4051 | emall: geherng@ikkoulo com | foe 4741-2108
Bk 531, Paya Uk Industngl Pori. Ut Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this emall and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising In any way from its use.



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 3:34 PM

To: Evelyn Ng; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: LOD Feor Our Insured Veh 5JV4330L *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG19012364/Kea3

Attachments: SLK3881D LTA Search.pdf; SJV4330L SAS Report.pdf; SIV4330L Cl.pdf; SIV4330L DRIVER
CONTRACT pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

From: Evelyn Ng <ngstrading94 @ gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 July, 2019 2:56 PM

To: Admin A <agdmin-a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: LOD For Our Insured Veh SIV4330L

Dear Sir/Madam

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJV4330L & SLK3881D
ALONG SEGAR RD

We understand that you are the insurer of SLK3881D vehicle.

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle STV4330L have been completed repairs to my/our satisfaction by
M/s NGS TRADING. I/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:-

1. Cost of Repair S$ 2900.00

2. LTA Search S§ 745

3. Rental- 6davs@$70.00 S$ 420.00(Include Sunday & Survey)
TOTAL S$ 3327.45

A copy each of the following supporting documents is attached:-

a) Authorise to Act

b) Our bill M/s NGS Trading
¢) Cen of insurance

d) SJV4330L SAS Report

e) SLK3881D LTA Search fee
f) Driver Contract

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank vou.



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 10:28 AM

To: JNYBS00@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 38810 AND SJV 4330L ON 05/07/2019
Our Refl; CC4/AIG19012364/Keal

23 JULY 2019

NG TIONG HENG

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 3881D AND SJV 4330L ON 05/07/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @lkkauto.com

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



I/We, _Grace On Wheels Automobile Pte Ltd (“ihe third party claimant”), owner of_SJV4330L
(vehicle no.) hereby authorize _ NGS Trading  ( “the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my
claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no._SJV4330L
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 05/07/2019 (date) along Segar

Rd (location) involving vehicle no/s SLK3IRBID (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop 2 NGS Trading ™.
| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle's concemned.

Dated this ) (day)of | (month)20 19 (year).

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop™(with chop)
{with chop if applicable}



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, NGS TRADING (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have reached an agreement with
the appointed surveyvor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE
LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $82,900.00 (Repair Cost), 55420.00
(Loss of Use/Rentad), $$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. $]V 4330L that was damaged pursuant

to the accident which occurred on 05/07/2019 (date) along SEGAR RD (location) involving vehicle
no/s SLK 38810,

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 12/07/2019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GRACE ON WHEELS AUTOMOBILE
PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no, SJV 4330L make the claim as set out in the
above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that
we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimam”
after the above said agreement Jodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental andfor loss of use pursuant to the damage to ]V
43301 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prejudice and without admission of liahility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

v¥

Dated this (day) of ___Aug (month) 2019 _(year)
"’*{:\H‘\
(KK || ESC ,

Signed by appeinted surveyor Signed by “the workshop" (with chop)



NGS TRADING

Bk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind, Pk 23 #02-0] AMK AutoPoint Singapore 568047
Tel: 64815727 Fax: 4815772  Email: evelynmgstrading's pmuil com

Reg Mo.51 1063001
INVOICE
| AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD | s B
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT Veh No 1 SIV4330L HD STREAM
78 SHENTON WAY Mileage
#07-16 AIG BUILDING Your Ref 1 QT-09329/SIV4330L
SINGAPORE 079120 Our Ref
Date : 26-07-2019
TEL : 6419 3000 FAX : Page < 1of1
Description Amount
S$
ACCIDENT ON 05/07/19@21:00HRS ALONG SEGAR RD
[NVOLVING 5Jv4330L & SLE3BEBL1D
CLAIMS AGAINST SLK3BELD
LLIMP SUM REPAIR 2,900.00
SURVEY BY : LKK KENNETH
SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED ONLY Net Total 2,900.00

HNotes :
1Al should be crossed and made ble to
NGS TRADING e

2. Goods sold are nefther returnable nor refundabile.

Authorised Signature



Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapara 575701

GST Registration No. © M4-0008529-2

Recaipt No. © ITNET-00000-190711-001885
Pravious Receipl Mo.

uﬂ:m ransaction Reference
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLK3881D
As at 05 Jul 2018/21:00:00

Print DateTime
Aecaipt DataTime

Tax Involce/Recaipt

Insurance Ca: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - SLK3IEE1D
Enquiry Fea
20180711144850724 188

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paig By
HOOO0000000 1986
Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amount
Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

provider / fin

Please ensure that all payments 1o the Autho

T.00

T.00
7.00

Credit Card: Viza

-settied by the

0.48

0.49
0.48

11 Jul 2019/ 14:50:09
11 Jul 2018 / 14:50:02

7.48

T.48
T7.48
0.04
T.45

745
T45
Q.00
T.45
0.00

payment sen
and re is considered void and Iate fee



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
~Che__Notied Bt Submitted  |Adj Assigned | Ad) Rpn Al Submitted | Ins Authed Status — ]
11 Jul 2019 12 Jul 2019 -
Main | 16:27 15:14 u;m.u | “m Survay
Edk Ad) Rat I Cancel Cade |‘ |

Claim Detnils

| [Created by insurer]

NG TIONG HENG, ID. SI578494D, Tal: +A583226338
GRACE ON WHEELS AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD, Co. Rleg. No.: 201833077C

_T65/07/2018 09:00 - 55
Siva3soL Date of Loss: | 1113 Months and @ Days Fram LTA Reg Dats (Man 1r)]

Palicy/Cover | 2100456261 (Comprehensive)
TP / 481086562156 Mote No.: |Coverage: 30/12/2018 - 20/12/3019

3 Policy No,
SLKIBA1D (Cla )- S105872512

t .| Edcess:

| NGS TRADING (HQ) Hik 10 Ang Mo Rio Industnal Park 28 #02-01 AME Autopoint, S68047 Ang Mo Kio - Tel; 64815727

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Loh, Chee-Heng] Chee-Heng Loh@alkg com

| NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

[Adjuster. LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled oy KENMETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 23/07/2019]
| Driver/Custn
| dhan HO TEMG JONG (53 / Fermale) ,  NRIC: SI7E60791,  Ted: +6590055153 Emails Jny&E500@gmail.com
| (Tnsured)
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mail |

There ore no mail for this case.
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There are no document checklists configured, |

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|whlﬂt No: SLK3881D (Insd veh) Model: HONDA STREAM 1.8 L (A)
SJIV4330L (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |05/07/2019
Global Sum Settiement [: | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 5,600.04
Final Repair Cost 5 2.900.00
Loss of Use - 420.00 6.00 days at $70.00 per day
Rental (if any) s 0.00 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee 5 745
Othars: -1 0.00
5
Final Settlement Sum ] 3,327.45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 ¥YES [ X] NO (Kindly ndicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No.

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (%) (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled anly for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |NGS TRADING s 3,327.45
2) 3
3 B
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 02 Sep
2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg no10ssor1ear)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax 6844-BB05 Email; sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkaute.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG19012364/KEA3O2
Date: 02/09/2019
REFEREN
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.  Palicy No: 2100496261
e R St Insured Vehicle No ;:  SLK3881D
Cale of Loss: 051072019 MNatura of Claim: TP Claim No: 48108B856215G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJv4330L
Make & Model: HONDA STREAM, 1.8 L (A) Engine No: R18A13801127
Reg Date: 2B8/01/2010 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No JHMRMNEBE0DSS5201133
Colour: Matallic Grey Cdometar. 126115 km
Engina Capacily: 1799 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (5%); Market Value/New Car Price
MDITI F I AT TH F Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabls); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceabla), Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condiion;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 205/65 R15
Front Left Side MNexen 5 mm Rear Lafi Side: Nexen 6 mm
Front Right Side: Nexen 5mm Rear Right Side: Nexen & mm
The abave valuss represent the remaining yre reads dopth
COSTOF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 3.880.04 2,556.20 1.323.84 34.12
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.720.00 1.180.00 540.00 31.40
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 5,600.04 3,736.20 1,863.84 33.28
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,900.00
Nett Amount (S5) 5,600.04 2,900.00 2,700.04 48.21
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x $§70.00/day) (5§) 420.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) T7.45
Nett Liabliity (S5) 3,327.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 12/07/2018

Date Inspected: 12/07/2019 Inspected AL

Estimated Perlod ol Repair 4.0 days

NGS TRADING (HQ)
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24 #02-
01 AMK Autopaini

Singapore 568047
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong i

NOTE This report represents our fodings of ie fime and place of ingpeciion stited herein. Such ingpaction hoa been carmied ouf fo the bost of our
Anowiledge and abibly but any ofhar habiily under any cther crcumstances is heredy exprassly excluded

hitps://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 2/9/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty ParlNo. Particulars Cendition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *HEADLAMP RH Broken T48.TOFL *T48.TOFL
2 1 *FRT FENDER RH Bent 519.30FL *619.30FL
3 1 *FRT FENDER LINING RH Distorted 105.70FL *“105.7TOFL
4 1 *FRT BUMPER Buckled B35.60FL *B35.60FL
5 1 *FRT HEADLAMP RETAINER RH Cracked 43.00FL *43.00FL
B 1 *SIDE RETAINER RH Cracked 2B.70FL *28.TOFL
7 | *RAD GRILLE BASE Serviceable 240.60FL *.FL
8 1 *RAD GRILLE CHROME Serviceable 280.B0FL -FL
8 1 “REINFORCEMENT Repair 219.00FL *-FL
m 1 “SUPPORT PANEL Repair 496, 00FL *-FL
1t 1 *BONNET Benl TE8.00FL *T68.00 FL
12 1 *FENDER MARK RH Necessary 52 50FL *52.50FL
13 1 *BUMPER LOWER COVER RH Serviceable B8 40FL *FL
14 1 *SPORTS RIM Dented 480.00FS *200.00FS
15 10 *FENDER SHIELD CLIPS Necessary 35.00F5 *35.00FS

F=Franchige part. 5=Spolefl L=Listiemiss

Sub Total (55) 4,721.30 3,136.50

- List Itam Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (55) B41.26 580.30

Total Parts (S§) 3,880.04 2,556.20

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscollansous tems selecied.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS WITH ALL NECESSARY New 1,000.00 £00.00

COMPONENT,RESHAPED/REALIGN DENTED
PANEL .REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS.REFIT INTO POSITION

2 SPRAY PAINTING MNew 800.00 600.00
CHECK WIRING /LIGHT PROPER FUNCTION New 40,00 20.00

4 ALIGNMENT New 80.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost (S%) 1,720.00 1.180.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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