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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 10:56 AM
To: Siak Tong Sim; Kelly Shi; Yvonne Ng
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019
Attachments: AIG DV.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Mr. Sim, 
 
We attach herewith a copy of the amended DV for the sum of ($4,812.90). 
 
Please send us your amended invoice and amended LOD for our further action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 10:51 AM 
To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Yvonne Ng 
<yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Mr. Sim, 
 
As spoken, the breakdown of your repair invoice should be as follows: 

  
 

                                           Cost of Repair  $   4,047.57 

                                                     GST 7% $     283.33 
                                                            Total $  4,330.90 

 
As such, the amended LOD should be as follows: 
 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $   4,330.90 

2. Loss of Use(6 days x $80) $     480.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $        2.00 
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                                                            Total $  4,812.90 
  

 
 
Please send us your repair invoice and the LOD. 
 
We will seek mandate from AIG and revert on this. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 10:19 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Yvonne Ng 
<yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 
 
Dear sir 
 
Thanks & Best Regards 
S.T.Sim 
Manager  
Accident Reporting Center 
60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 

 
 
 
 
On Mon, Mar 16, 2020 at 10:16 AM Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear sir 
Without Prejudice 
Attached Invoice for your reference. 
Please amend total settlement to $4.812.91 instead of $4,812.89. 
Please let us have your DV soon 
 
Thanks & Best Regards 
S.T.Sim 
Manager  
Accident Reporting Center 
60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
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On Mon, Mar 16, 2020 at 9:39 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Mr. Sim, 

  

The subtotal in the repair invoice does not tally with our surveyor’s recommendation for $4,047.57. 

  

Please amend your invoice and e-mail us the same. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 11:22 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 

  

Dear sir 

Attached signed DV for your action 
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Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

 

  

  

  

On Mon, Mar 9, 2020 at 6:25 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
  
Dear Mr. Sim, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have amended the DV and we attach herewith a fresh copy for your further action. 

Sorry for the inconvenience caused.  

Please e-mail us (LKK) a copy of the DV for our further action. 

Thank you. 
  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 9:01 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 

  

Dear sir 

Attached revised Tax invoice for SLK1085Z for your action 
 

Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Date: Fri, Mar 6, 2020 at 4:47 PM 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 
To: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>, Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

  

Yvonne 

For your reference 
 

Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

 

  

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Thu, Mar 5, 2020 at 4:25 PM 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 
To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>, Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>, Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Mr. Sim, 
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Please amend your tax invoice and remove item (19) and (20) as it should only have the cost of Repair amount only. 

  

  

  

We will proceed to do the necessary upon receipt of your amended invoice. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 3:53 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 

  

Dear sir 
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Attached signed DV for your action 
 

Regards 

S.T.Sim   (65-97422188) 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

 

  

  

  

On Thu, Mar 5, 2020 at 3:26 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please e-mail us (LKK) a copy of the DV for our further action. 

  
Thank you. 
  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 4:17 PM 
To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 

  

Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Thank you for the acceptance. 
  

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action. 

  
Thank you. 
  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 10:11 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Cc: Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 
  
Dear sir 
Without Prejudice 
We accept your proposed settlement of $4,812.89 dated on 21/01/2020 
Please let us have your DV soon 
 
Regards 
S.T.Sim   (65-97422188) 
Manager  
Accident Reporting Center 
60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 

 
  
  
  
On Tue, Jan 21, 2020 at 9:47 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

 Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $   4,330.89 

2. Loss of Use(6 days x $80) $     480.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $        2.00 
                                                            Total $  4,812.89 

 Please confirm acceptance. 
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"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 5:21 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kelly Shi <kelly.shi@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ALONG ON 08/07/2019 

  

Dear sir 

Attached LOD/Invoice SLK1085Z for your approval and early settlement 
 

Regards 

S.T.Sim   (62524991) 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04- 01Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 
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On Thu, Aug 15, 2019 at 5:13 PM Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear sir 

Ok and will sent you the LOD/ Invoice soon 
 

Regards 

S.T.Sim   (62524991) 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04- 01Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

 

  

  

  

On Thu, Aug 15, 2019 at 3:17 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19012357/Ekb3 

Your Ref: SLK1085Z 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

                                                    

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG1572Z [AIG] & SLK1085Z ON 08/07/2019 

  
We refer to the above matter. 
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Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is 
clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for 
the above mentioned case. 
  
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of 
repair to your client’s vehicle. 
  
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the 
accident. 
  
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our 
surveyor. 
  
Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed 
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


