Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 August, 2019 7:32 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z ON 10/07/2019

Attachments: LOD & ATA & RELEASE VOUCHER Nissan Lation SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z.pdf
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 5:40 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z ON 10/07/2019

Date : 31/07/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SCF 3228 Z

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
Final Cost repair Bill To NISSAN LATIO SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z on 10/07/2019.

To Supply :-



Total Lumpsum As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves : $ 3,550.00
GST 7% $ 248.50
$ 3,798.50

Date : 31/07/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SCF 3228 Z

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z ON 10/07/2019
We have been authorised by Mr. LIM YEE LI ERINA , the owner of vehicle claim against the party

/ parties responsible for the damages arising from number SJU 1120 B, to the above mentioned

accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle numbe ( SCF 3228 Z) at the material time
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of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, ( Mr. LIM YEE LI ERINA ).

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management
of your insured’s vehicle number (SCF 3228 7)), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have

been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair S 3,798.50
(2) Loss of use X 6days S 480.00
(3) PIR 2days $  160.00
(4) LTA Search Fee S 7.45

S 4,445.95

A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(a) Final repair bill
(b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)
(c) LTA Search

On Thu, 11 Jul 2019 at 16:53, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote:

#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701

TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591

E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 11/07/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SCF 3228 Z

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJU 1120 B & SCF 3228 Z ON 10/07/2019

We are writing on behalf of Mr. LIM YEE LI ERINA the registered owner
of SJU 1120 B which was involved on the above mentioned accident between SCF 3228 Z.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number SCF 3228 Z was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.



As aresult of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your
insured vehicle number SCF 3228 Z. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair
costs and other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s v ehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING
Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as
to avoid further losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of SJU 1120 for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and
the bill will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

Ms KIM
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



