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! / U Auta

- Conswitans
s BE = Pra Ltd Company Registration No. 198607138R

31 UBEAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UL INDLSTRIAL PARR, SING APORE J08933 TEL : (B651 62543561 FAX : (0651 62564315

Yourref: D190045336MFSH

Our ref; CS/FC119012344/Avd3 Date - 29/8/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SJY 7479G
We thank you for your instruction on 12/7/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
12/7/2019  at the premises of M/s SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$22,689.80

Revised Estimate Amount : §54,500.00 (LUMP SUM}
"Check" Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

L.TA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATA
Licensad Appraiser



MS. Firstcapita I M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg bo 1950001000 C5T Heg Ne H2-0001E76.9

6 Raffies Quay UZ1-00 Singapone 48580
Tel (65} 6222 2311 Fan (B5) baZe 3547

Claims: & Moter Underariting Dept: 35 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Faw (55 6307 3849
wiwnel mstirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

10-07-2018 Our Ref No. D19004536MFSH
08-07-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAZ2846M Third Party Vehicle. SJY7478G

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-33 & #02-29KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SIRINA SOON
67461515/ 92236288 Fax No. 67485015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

UN
SUCCESS ITED PTE Attention. NIL
LTD
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 2:19 PM

To: '‘CWS Motor Claims'

Cc ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1, SIY T7479G
Attachments: SJY 7479G PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJY 7479G
Date of survey: 12/7/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 9 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 9:22 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1, 51Y 7479G

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJY 7479H on 12/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 12:38 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: CWS5 Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 11:35 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVEL This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; Www.avg.caom



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 9:22 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Karen Tan'; SUR

Suhjeﬁt: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMNT - D19004536MFSH/, SIY 74795
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJY 7479H on 12/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhbl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 12:38 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkayto.com | fax: 5256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent; Friday, 12 July 2019 11:35 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motar Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com. sg>; Karen Tan <ka rentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004536MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
3 WWW.aVE.com
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Bidded Car Plate Number for sale

Looking for auspicious numbers?
Browse our list of hottest bidded car plate numbers for sale.

Post an Advertisement
Sel it yourselfl Advertise it at just

. 1
i $58 until it's SOLD! anty gonthy %ﬂ‘:-r
@ Post an Ad B Advertiser Login 0 ways of Seting 7 j SrarAd ﬂi}

r.("( HIN LUNG ALTO 30 years

Ha Bee oo
One Stop Car Hub o

Finance, Insurance, Workshop
New and Used Cars ‘

Browse by Categoey

S-Max Army Aoy Ay Ay Ay Ay Avallabde

[T] Ford S-Max 2.34 Trend $29,800 $10,170 fyr 21-Agr-2011 2,261 oc 120,188 ke MY Available

Specious Family Sized 7 Seaters MPY, No Repairs Needed, Immaculate Condition, 909 Loan O The Car Price Is Avallable Hera. Trade In
Available, Buy Qualty Cars With Peace OF Mird, Don't Miss It. Call Us Mow To Test Drive Today, Flexible Loan Arrangements.

Tai Huat Aumamobile

D Ford 5-Max 2.0A Ecoboost 5$35,800 410,540 fyr 29-Jul-2011 1,595 o E0,000 kem MPY Availabla
Titanium

Lowest Price & Mileage In This Category! Cant Find Anywhere Elsel Dan't Mies This Opportunity To Own A Spacious Executive 7 Seater
MPY AL The Best Price! Very Good Conditian With Genuine Low Mileage! High Trace In And Bank Loan/In House Loan Welcome! Buy Wit...

|:| Ford 5-Max 2,04 Titanium 555800 411,100 fyr 2G-May-2013 1,999 cc B8, 000 km MPY Available

100% Loan Avallable! Don't Miss 1L One Owner With Low Mieage, Spacious And Versatile 7 Seater MPY With Knockdown Rear Seats,
High Trace In Avallable! Please Call Or Visit Us Now For Further Detalls,

Pure Motors Pte Lid

[] Ford S-Max 2.0A Ecoboost $52,800 §9,750 fyr I0-Jun-2014 1,509 e 50,852 km My Available
Titanium

Rare 1 Owner! Fully Agent Maintained, 1 Year Warranty, Spacious 7 Seater MPV At Lowest Depreciation! Excelient Condition! 100%

Criginal Low Mileage! Accident Free, High Trade In And Bank Loan/In House Loan Available, STA Evaluation ‘Welcome, Extended Waman...

& Car Buyng ¢ d;i Car Selting » ’,0 i Ownarship + TYREPAC ,&; ’ .
. ¥ By Tyres Onkne @
E‘ Car Aftermarket m O Thie Mowe # 1 Lifestyle ¥ Latest Specil Ofers fom Tyispact |

E' Ford S-Max 2.04 Ecoboost §61 800 49,750 fyr OF-Ausg-2014 1,599 ot 87,000 km MRy Available
Titanium

Coma View To Believe! Don't Miss This Opportunity Ta Own A Spacious Executive 7 Seater MPY At The Best Price! Very Good Condition
With Low Miieage! High Trade In And Bank Loan/In House Loan Weleome!

7] Ford S-Max 2,04 Titanium $72,800 10,880 fyr 15-Jan-2015 1,999 oc 46,000 km leal Available
Graded B by ST
7 Searer SUV With Knockdown Rear Seats. Spacicus [nteriee Cabin, Cheapest In Mariet. Selling At & Low Depreciation OF Only P e

$11.3%/Year! Extrermely Low Milzage Clocking 46,0006m Up To Date. High LoanfInsurance/Trade In Done Here, Fast Approvals, 1 Week,

Tradeit. Cam P12 Lod

Save this search oriteria, to get emall alerts whenever a mateh is found. tl Save Search




> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwner 10; 1212B

Wehicle Ma.: SI¥TATIG

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 15Jul 2019

Vehicle Make: FORD

Wehicle Model: S-MAX TREMD SDR
Primary Colour: Crange
Manufacturing Year: 20079

Engine No.: QA2TEES

Chassis No.: WROSKMGBWSYAZTE84
Maximum Power Output 118.0 kW (158 bhp)
Open Market Value: $24,229.00

Original Registration Date: 29 5ep 2010

First Registration Date: 29 5ep 2010
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $24,229.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 28 Sep 2020

PARF Rebate Amount: $13,325.00

COE Expiry Date: 28 Sep 2020

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Pericd(Years): 10

QP Paid: $42.701.00

COE Rebate Amount: $5,140.00

Total Rebate Amount $18,485.00

The information contained hereln is correct as at 15 Jul 2019

OK



Page 1/2

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit Autohub. Singapore 417921 .
Tel No. : 67461515/ 67471787 Fax No. : 67485015

Website : www.successunited.com.sg

Buss. Reg. No. : GST No. 2004025706

guﬂESRELrﬁt;D:r?gi{inaaLmsurance Limited | Estimate : TP19-090
#16-01 City House Voran Date : 09/07/2019
Singapore DBBETT Vehicle Num. : 3JY7479G
ey . WakeModel : Ford S-Max-2002
Altention ; Wotor. Claim Depariment Chassis/Eng# | WFOSXXGBWSIA29684/0A20684
Contact ; 65073848 Fax No. : 65073840 Accident Date : 08/07/2019
Claim No. : = k
Reference :
Palicy Mo. :
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5§
LIST ITEMS :
1. 1pe Bonnet Deued 1,580.00"
2. 2pecs Bonnet Hinge LR~ °F 28500 570.00
3 1pc Bonnet Mechanism Lock A~ ¢ 345.00°
4. 2pcs Headlamp Assy IR Fyl o bt 950.00 1.900:00 7 5.
5. 1pc Headlamp Bracket RH ¢+ -" < 1?3.U-Df
6. 1pc Frt Bumper Assy - Vsl ™ d &5 1%50{![5
7.  15pcs Frt Bumper Clips 7« - 15.10 26.50 -
8. 1pc Frt Bumper Side Holder RH  »~ 5B.00-
g 1pc Frt Foglamp RH ¢l | 375.00:
10. 1pc Frt Foglamp Gamish RH v15° = 120.00-
1. 1pc Frt Lower Air Grille ¢ " 273.00—"
12. 1pc Frt Grille Assy peA-c 315.00
13. 1pc Frt Bumper Inner Sponge  * =t . 38500 .
14, 1 Ec Frt BumEer Reinfcrgemgent Benk- 78< B&ﬂ‘ll?% e
15, 1pc Frt Bumper Center Bracket "1 - 255.00%
16. 1pc Frt Bumper Weatherstrip -~ 210.00 +
17. 1pec Radiator Support Panel (wéc = Ao < 1386700 -
18. 1pc Radiator Assy - Mo 1,560.00
19. 1pc Radiator Top Hose 7 192.00+
20, 1pc Radiator Lower Hose & — 245 00+
21. Tpec Radiator Spare Tank /i =~ 160.00
22, 1pc Radiator Auxillary Fan Assy & *- 1,710,007
23, 1pc Engine Under Cover Assy (o' 523.00-"
24, 2pes Bumper Bracket LR~ »7 1 87.00 174.00-%
25. 1pc Driver Side Leg Airbag AL ’ gl 2.571.00
26. 1pc Airbag Sensor-, . bed [ Ay A BEE .00
27. 1pc Airbag ECU | /A7 1,085.00 =
28 1pc Airbag Console RH A 7 | g 1,350.00 e
29. 2pcs Frt Seatbelt L/IR Ao viALe [0l 0 955.00 1,910.00
List TotalS$ : 23,343 .50
20.00% Discount 5% 466870
1B.674.80

CONTINUE / ...



SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit Autohub. Singapore 417921

Tel No. : 67461515/ 67471787 Fax No. : 67485015
Website : www.successunited.com.sg

Buss. Reg. No. : GST No. 200402570G

Page 2/ 2

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Estimate : TP19-090
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House Date : 09/07/2019
Singapore 068877 Vehicle Num. ; SJY74790
Atiention : Motor Claim Depart t Make/Model : Ford S-Max-2009
ention : Motor Liaim Deparimen Chassis/Eng# | WFOSXXGBWSOA29684/0A20684
Contact - 65073848 Fax Mo. : 65073849 Accident Date : 0B/07/2019
Claim No.
Reference
Policy No. :
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 55
SPECIALNETTITEMS: | Led o
1. 1set Frt No. Plate wiFrame 177" € 55.00 -
Special Nett Total S5 . 55.00
LABOUR .
To remove, rearrange electrical wirings, check lighting 6000 S
;I'ﬂ remove, reinstal aircon parts. vacum, refill gas. 20000 | &
'To remove, replace airbags, dashboard fascia, goer.n-ﬁ 3o
seatbelts & reset airbags ECU. ="
: 50 -
To remove, repair and replaced damaged bodyparts, - 1,800:00 7« v
realign bodyworks & where consistent to the accident i
To putty and respray painting on affected area. 1,50000 "
Labour Total 5§ : 3,960.00
.-"'L1II Vs L_----]
i “-""/:' / g
I e W b /
L | 09 Doy
‘ /
. Total 53 22 689.80
/f i - -
AL 2 J | :"1 I_‘.'J ~
SUCCESS UNITED PTELFDued by mesar [
' o w8 A5 (Wett Vol )

.1'1_'-? el



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607T198R G3T Reg. No. 19-8607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURAMNCE LTD Ref : CS/IFCIM9012344/Avd3n2
e romneonsord osoneaessrr oot o200 | [HIIHHEIEIIN
Coda: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 2846M Veh. Inspected SJY 7479G
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19004536MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 12107/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FORD S-MAX c.c 2261
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WFOSXXGBWS9A29684 Colour RED
Odometer 171461 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 FALKEM 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 FALKEM & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 FALKEMN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 21560 R16 FALKEMN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/07/2019 Inspection Date 12/07/2019
Eunruy held at SUCCESS UNITED PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417821
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 9 Working Days




7
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7L

Reg Mo 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-0807168-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJY 7479G

51 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933

Page No.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {g]} )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|BONNET DEMNTED 1,580.00 1,580.00
2|BONMET HINGE LR @%285.00 MOT NECESSARY 570.00 -
1|BOMNET MECHANISM LOCK MNOT NECESSARY 345.00 -
2| HEADLAMP ASSY LR @$950.00 OIS CRACKED 1,800.00 950.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET RH CRACKED 173.00 173.00
1|FRT BUMPER ASSY DISTORTED 1,880.00 849.00
15|FRT BUMPER CLIPS @§15.10 MECESSARY 226.50 30.00
1|FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
1|FRT FORLAMP RH CRACKED 375.00 375.00
1|FRT FORLAMP GARNISH RH DISTORTED 120.00 120.00
1|FRT LOWER AIR GRILLE CRACKED 273.00 273.00
1|FRT GRILLE ASSY DEFORMED 315,00 315.00
1|FRT BUMPER INMER SPONGE CRACKED 385.00 385.00
1{FRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BEMNT 980.00 485,00
1|FRT BUMPER CENTER BRACKET MOT NECESSARY 255.00 5
1|FRT BUMPER WEATHERSTRIP MOT HECESSARY 210.00 -
1|RADIATOR SUPPORT PANEL CRACKED 1.380.00 B05.00
1|RADIATOR ASSY NOT NECESSARY 1.560.00 -
1|RADIATOR TOP HOSE NOT NECESSARY 1682.00 -
1|RADIATOR LOWER HOSE NOT NECESSARY 245.00 -
1|RADIATOR SPARE TANK NOT NECESSARY 160.00 -
1|RADIATOR AUXILLARY FAN ASSY MOT NECESSARY 1,710.00 -
1|ENGINE UNDER COVER ASSY CRACKED 523.00 523.00
2|BUMPER BRACKET L/IR @$87.00 NOT NECESSARY 174.00 .
1|DRIVER SIDE LEG AIRBAG ACTIWATED 2,571.00 2,571.00
1|AIRBAG SENSOR ACTIVATED 858.00 BSE.00
1|AIRBAG ECU ACTIVATED 1,085.00 1,065.00
1|AIRBAG CONSOLE RH MNOT NECESSARY 1,350.00 -
2|FRT SEATBELT L'R @5955.00 ACTIVATED 1.910.00 1,910.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19012344/Avd3n2




f VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al DA = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirlal Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R G3T Reg. Mo, 19-8607 198-R Page Mo.2 of 2
e Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -4,668.70 -2.665.00
18.674.80 10,660.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRT NO PLATE W/FRAME (SN) DISTORTED 55.00 55.00
55.00 5500
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRINGS CHECK 60.00 30.00
LIGHTING.
TO REMOVE, REINSTAL AIRCON PARTS. VACUM, REFILL 200.00 120.00
GAS,
TO REMOVE REPLACE AIRBAGS,DASHBOARD 400.00 350.00
FASCIA SEATBELTS & RESET AIRBAGS ECL.
TO REMOVE, REPAIR AND REPLACED DAMAGED 1.800.00 1.000.00
BODYPARTS,REALIGN BODYWORKS & WHERE
COMSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY PAINTING OM AFFECTED 1,500.00 BOO.00
AREA.
3.960.00 2,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 22.689.80 13,015.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19012344/Avd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $23,000.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $18,500.00=NETT VALUE: %$4,500.00
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DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benefit of the Chent namad on the front page of this Report.




