Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 October 2019 10:40 AM

To: ‘Tan, Bennie-WZ'; Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: TP / 4260998266SG - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9835L & SLE 4405X

[AIG] ON 06/07/2019 ALONG/AT ELIAS TERRACE

Hi Bennie,
We refer to the email below.
Please to be inform that our surveyor did inspected third party vehicle on the 12/07/2019.

However repairer did not submit any estimate and claimant have privately settle the case with insured without involving
us.

In view on above we will submit our Damage Assessment report to you soon.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 September 2019 2:38 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ (Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com) <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: YOUR REF: TP / 4260998266SG - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9835L & SLE 4405X [AIG] ON 06/07/2019
ALONG/AT ELIAS TERRACE

Dear Mr. Bennie Tan,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly be informed that the third party has settled the matter
with Insured driver via private settlement.

As such, we will proceed to cancel the case as we have not done any survey.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
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