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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D63} 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19004510MFSH Date: 12 July 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19012281/Kqd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __GBB 9864E .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/07/2019 at the premises of M/s WEI LEE MOTOR. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S%  5.130.09
Revised Estimate Amount 8% 3.821.36
“Check”™ Items Amount :S§ -
Market Value : S8 -
LTA Reimbursement Value ol -
Nett Value :S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser



Ms@FirstCapital

M35 First Capital Insurance Limited Lo heg bo 1950001060 GFF Reg Mo, ME-00006T6-9
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (65) G222 311 Faxc (B3] 6222 3547

Clgims & Motor Underwiting Dept: 36 Flobinsan Road #16-01 City House Singagore 068877
Tek (65) 5507 3848 Fax (65} 6507 3849
wovw. ms firstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

08-07-2019 Our Ref No. D15004510MFSH
08-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHE558M Third Party Vehicle. GEBS864E

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32
KAREN SEAH

64569830/ 0 Fax No. 64580128

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

VWEI LEE MOTOR WORKS Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for sunvey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 10:15 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004510MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI19012281Kqd3.pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of GBB 9864E.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkaoto.com | fax: b256-47315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 9:35 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004510MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 5:25 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenlLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004510MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power QOutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
047D

GBB9864E

Mo

21 Aug 2019

NISSAN

NV200 1.5L MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 6DR
White

2010
K9KF276D098113
JN1YBAM20UD003275
$22,941.00

22 Dec 2010

22 Dec 2010

2

$1,148.00

No

$0.00

21 Dec 2020

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$30,511.00

$4,068.00

$4,068.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Aug 2019
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01 -32,
SINGAPORE 575644, _
TEL: 6456 9830 = FAX: 6458 0128 = EMAIL: weileemotorworks@gmail.com
Business Regn Mo: 268436/00J

10,July 2019

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

S 068877

Attn: Motor claim dept-3™ party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SH8558M

p _}I“f_ }j_.rjlru_.
'_#;] .J;I

L4

amFSH

Z/é'% 8 7
J%

Accident involving vehicle no:GBBI864E/SHE558M Vs 7

DOA: 08/07/2019 AT Tampines Ave 9 twds Ave 7 oy’ @ﬂft

Dear officer incharge

Re: Estimate cost of repair for vehicle no: GBB9BBAE

To supply--

| Description Qty Amount

| Rear door,th 1 (2001 Af 1,40490 N
Taillamp,Lh 1 Pe. 23650 N X
Rear door hinge @86.60 2 #T 17320 N X
Rear door,RH |1 A 96090 N —
MV200 emblem 1 Ae, 7550 N ——
Nissian logo 1 68.00 N 0
Rear bumper 1 2t B, 48110 N+
Parts 3,400.10 N

Mett parts less 10% 340.01

3,060.09
S

Reverse sensor {“?/ Jese 22000 2 Cofm

Company sticker 250.00 deor.

To remove damaged parts and attachments.

Repair/reshape damaged panel/dented areas.

Replace/align all parts into position. 850.00 ¢Sc(

To spray paint. 750.00 '{“,ﬂ(

5,120.09
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 575644, .
TEL: 6456 9830 » FAX: 6458 0128 » EMAIL: weileemotorworks@gmail.com
Business Regn No: 269436/00J

10, July 2019 'ﬂ L
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

S 06E877

Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SHE558M
Accident involving vehicle no:GBBIBGJE/SHE558M
DOA: 08/07/2019 AT Tampines Ave 9 twds Ave 7

Dear officer incharge
Re: Estimate cost of repair for vehicle no: GBE98G4E

To supply--

Description Qty Amount I
Rear door,th fz&"-'fﬁ 1 7 1,40490 N
Taillamp,Lh 1 P 23650 N X
Rear door hinge @86.60 2 A 17320 N X
Rear door,RH 1 & 96090 N
NV200 emblem 1 Me,  T550 N o+
Nissian logao 1 68.00 N :
Rear bumper 1 Rt pB, 48110 N o—
Parts 340010 N
Nett parts less 10% 340,01

3,060.09
I
Reverse sensor Jfa?/ f"’a‘f 22000 £ Codris
Company sticker e 250.00 dos._
To remove damaged parts and attachments.
Repair/reshape damaged panel/dented areas,
Replace/align all parts into position. J 85000 Iy
To spray paint. e 750.00 fzc;-.rg{
o~ UMY TR s
. 5,130.09
-, i
B \
[ ~, .y F ,_‘. :
L m N W\ . .:



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 35617 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 198607196R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19012281/Kgd3n2
ﬁsﬁcﬂﬁgﬁ? EggEDsmGAPoRE 068877 SRS SRS M””"ll'lm”l”" |H
Code: FCi2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 8558M Veh. Inspected GBE D8B4E
Peolicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18004510MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 10/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV200 (M) c.c 1461
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. JN1YBAMZ20UO0O0D3275 Colour WHITE
Odometer 270909 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOoOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |173/70 R14 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [175/70R14 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 17570 R14 BRIDGESTOME 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTIOM.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/07/2019 Inspection Date 140772019
Survey held at WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644,
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES COMNSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONMDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GEBB 9864E
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty e Workshop (§)| (5
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR,LH (N) BENT 1,404.90 1,281.10
1| TAILLAMP LH (N} SERVICEABLE 236.50 o
2|REAR DOOR HINGE @586.60 (N) TO REPAIR SEE 173.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR,RH (M) BENT 950.90 960,90
1|MV200 EMBLEM (N) MECESSARY 75.50 75.50
1|NISSAN LOGO (N) MNECESSARY 6800 68.00
1|REAR BUMPER (N} DENTED/ 481.10 481.10
BUCKLED
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -340.01 -2B6.66
3,060,089 2 579.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED / 220.00 200.00
SCRATCHED
1|COMPANY STICKER (SN) NMECESSARY 250.00 B0.00
470.00 280.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS AND A50.00 450.00
ATTACHMENTS.REPAIR/RESHAPE DAMAGED
PAMEL/DENTED AREAS REPLACE/ALIGN ALL PARTS
INTO POSITION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
DOOR HINGE.
TO SPRAY PAINT, 750.00 400.00
1,600.00 850.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,130.09 3,700.94
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,950.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19012281/Kqd3an2
MARKET VALUE: $51,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMEURSEMENT VALUE: $4,068.00=NETT VALUE: $46,932.00

o

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made sobsly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




