Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 June 2020 4:28 PM
To: tony tong

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: [B15: GBD 2857L - Finalize

Hi Tony,

Ok. Confirmed COR $6500 before GST @ 8 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

R : tony tong <tonytong@singnet.com.sg>
RIEmF[A]: 2020 4F 6 F1 4 H 15:26

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
F/B: RE: GBD 2857L - Finalize

Hi Guo Qiang,

Please revised Finalise COR to $6,500 & @8 working days.

Regards,
Tony

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 June 2020 5:23 PM

To: tony tong <tonytong@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: [F]%: GBD 2857L - Finalize

Hi Tony,

Finalize COR $6250 before GST @ 8 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

R tony tong <tonytong@singnet.com.sg>
RIXETIE]: 2020 4F 6 A 1 H 14:20




etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
F/B: RE: GBD 2857L - Finalize

Attach copy of estimate & cost.
Email finalise back to me.

Regards
Tony tong

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 29 May 2020 5:23 PM

To: tonytong@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: GBD 2857L - Finalize

Hi,
Please provide parts price for finalize, thanks.

Regards,
Guo Qiang



