Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July, 2019 6:18 PM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee

Cc: Richmond Ho; CS A Team; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref:

18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

SKETCH PLAN

Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 3:13 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Richmond Ho

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M
Importance: High

Hi
Please refer to above attachment and check if possible for direct settlement

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217

W E A R N E 5 www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com
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