Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 September, 2019 4:19 PM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee

Cc: Richmond Ho; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref:

18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Derek,

We refer further to our below email.

We were informed that our Insured and your client had agreed to settle mutually.
Kindly confirm if your side will withdraw the TP claim against our Insured.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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RERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 9:39 AM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee

Cc: Richmond Ho; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Derek,
We refer to your below email.

Our Insured had strongly insisted that based on the video footage provided, your client after passing by a stationary
vehicle did not keep to the leftmost lane, but instead, when at the bend, swerved to the right then back to the left



and stopped. Our Insured insisted that even though your client stopped, the rear right portion of the vehicle had been
protruding in our Insured’s path of way.

Our Insured is prepared to settle your client’s claim on a 50/50 basis.
For your confirmation please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 6:53 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Richmond Ho; Admin A

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Importance: High

Hi
Any update

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217
WEARNES

www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 4:01 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
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General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3
Importance: High

Hi
Any update

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217
WEARNES

www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee

Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 1:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Importance: High

FYA

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217

www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com
WEARNES

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 1:10 PM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee <derek.oh@wearnes.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3




Without Prejudice

Dear Derek,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are in the midst of clearing our Insured as there was a dispute.
Meanwhile, we would like to request for longer version of the footage after the impact if available.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 7:04 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Richmond Ho; Admin A

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Importance: High

Hi
Any update

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217

W E .‘54. FE N E 5 www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 8:59 AM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee <derek.oh@wearnes.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Derek,
Received with thanks.

We will get back for an update.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 8:49 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Richmond Ho; Admin A

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Importance: High

FYA

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217
WEARNES www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com




This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 8:45 AM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee <derek.oh@wearnes.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Derek,
We refer to the above matter and to our email dated 10/07/2019.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate
either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 July, 2019 6:42 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Richmond Ho; CS A Team; Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

Importance: High

Hi



Any update on liability clearance, thanks

Best Regards,

Derek Oh

V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935
D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217

W E A R N E 5 www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 6:18 PM

To: Derek Oh Siong Wee <derek.oh@wearnes.com>

Cc: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/022048 [External
General] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC19012246/ha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.



SKETCH PLAN
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Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Derek Oh Siong Wee [mailto:derek.oh@wearnes.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 3:13 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Richmond Ho

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SMF7322P AND SGM5019M
Importance: High

Hi
Please refer to above attachment and check if possible for direct settlement

Best Regards,

Derek Oh



V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4895 M (65) 9818 7217
W E A FE N E 5 www.wearnes.com  derek.oh@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com




