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SERVE YOU MOTOR SERVICE

BLOCK 5033 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-265, SINGAPORE 569536
TEL. NO: 64810555 / FAX NO. 64831654

INS: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPANY: EDS HOLDING PTE LTD

Registration no. + YM 3746 Y / MITSUBISHI FK617TMSIRDEC

Date of accident: 22.05.2019

Date : 10-Jul-19 Quotation No. : CM190514

[S/N] Oty | ltem |  Amount |

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
| 1 Front tyre LH side S, $270.00 X
2 1 Front tyre rim LH side /o $680.00 4
Total: $950.00

LABOUR & MISC CHARGES
I To straighten and panel beating on front LH sides for accident damaged / fd@" $380.00

portion.
2 To putty, re-spray painting affected areas. Z 4:*{ $480.00
3 To remove and refit front LH tvre to facilitate repairs A $60.00 4
TOTAL $920.00
Total Parts and Labour Cost of Repair $1,870.00

A Tl s,

gu M ny Mo =
& ?ﬁ;{»

%
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - YM3IT46Y vs SKETIT (Of) on D.O.A: ZHOSZ010

Froms e, Yineul

T "mEg g s o Ademir A |Rarmin-a ) ks com)

= Enrg, Anoy-2Y, Chen, Lea-Ying, Abs Kaasim, Meor Marmss Asian Syarseding. Chan. Yehe Sk, Lim Sty Yang Mithoosngt Aasheseanjssibmr, Sutyaemaniom Dwyianm, Tarmg, Yafuh
Sank  TREDIE LTS PM

Amachmenty %% v 1186 A smarch (2208030l T Y8 3748 v 0 revort s2z0mnm el 1 2704y 981 Q0510 pet

Hi,

Plense refir to the enclosed requen from Serve You Mator Service P el
Claim nn * 499066 TISGINE

Cuse Owner  * Norsish Bie Md Noor -{ b
11 you have any queries concerns, pleass let u know v U'I.-{‘
Kimatly axvint i axsign Kewneth Kong o Singple Soint Evpeet as requesiod

Thanks & Regards, ¢ I/

Hitr Yin Rl (Vv )

AlIG

Cham Adumimi il Sngaooee FNOL Clamms Cperaiions = Ao
Do repdlge oo | e i 39

From: elainesyms@gmailcom [mailtoelainesymesgmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2019 4:00 PH

Tot Hor, Yial

Cer elanasymsfgmall.com

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKB7934T AND YMI746Y ON 22/05/7019

Hi ¥in Rul
Thank you for the email

We choose:
Kenneth Kong, LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid,

Elsine Chia
Serve Yon Mator Service

From: Hae, Yinrul

Sent: Tue, 9 Jul 2019 07:39:55 -0000

To: claincsyms@Eigmail com _

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying. Abu Kassim, Noor Maness, Azlan, Syszaindina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Asshweenjeetiaur,
Subramaniam, Divyashnei, Tong, Wahxin

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHITLE SKB7934T AND YM3T46Y ON 221152019

Without Prevudics

Your Reference YMITAEY

O Reference D049 TISE003
Diear SirMadam,

We refer to your Motice of Accident of even date.

Wi intend (o conduct 3 pre-repair survey of the damage 1o your cliest'w'your cuslostier's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshep. We propose v use one of the mowr
surveyors panad in the attached list ta condact the joint pre-repair survey & & single joint expert

MName of Surveyar Company Name

AlG In Hoose Surveyor AIG Asin Pacific Insumncs Pre Lad
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services

Teffrey Ong Leng Kint Priorly Sers s

Timmy Lee Priority Services

EC Loot Autemobile Inspection Services Pue Lid
Tang Rah heen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusters Pte Lid

N You Han Formieam Adjusters Pie Lid

Soon HanXin (Gary) Formizam Acdjusters P Lid

Chew Bo Xiong Formizam Adjusters Pz Lid

Chus Soo Teck (Benjamin) Formieam Adjusters Ple Lid
Kalvin Ang LEK Auto Consultznts Ple Lid

Xing Crwo Chang LEK Awo Consultanes Pre Lud




| Marcus Chus LKK Auto Consulients Pie Lid
+ | Mohamid Tauflich LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lad
Ling LEK Auw Consulunts Fic Lid
Mokammed Rasal LEK Auto Conmultams Pre Lid
Kenneth Kang LK Autn Consultants Pre Lid

Phesse let us know withm two (2) working days whether you agree 10 the appamtment of any of these motor surveyors as @ single jnat expert. Yoo may select onn of mare of the
listed maotor surveyors. We will hear the cost of the pre-repals survey carried out by the single joint evpert

Tharka & Regards,

Huar Fin Bl (Viwlane)

AIG

Cinim Agusie 1, Sngapors FNOL. Clami Oposanion - Ao
Erppteilyn o | mee sig g

From: Elsine Chis [maillto: elsinesyma@gmail.com|]

Sent: Tussday, July 09, 2019 3:29 PM

To: AlG 5GP, Claims-Survey; Hor, Yinnl

Subject: [EXTEANAL] e PRI letter for Our Bel: YM 3746 Y Your Ref: SKB 7934 T (claim nurmber to be advised) - DOA: 22052019

This message s from an cxternal sender; be cautious with liks and attachments.
Hi Sir/ Mdm
Re: PRI letter for Our Ref: YM 3746 Y / Your Reft SKHE 7934 T (claim number to be sdvised) - DOA: 22.05.2019

Hereby attach our PRI letter for the above claim matter.
Mease armunge with your surveyor o survey YM 3748 Y ol our workshop.

Thank you
Elaine Chia

Serve You Motor Service

Bk gy Ang M Kin Tnd Park 2

#ul-2h5 (5] S

H/P: yzig 1188 Teli S48 0458 / el sbas

Fima- Bl g rhsq

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email {and any sttachments) i3 confidentinl, If you sre not the imended recipient, you mus not use or disseminate the mformation. If you
have received this emall in eror, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete e original and any coples or printouts thereof.
Although this email and any attachments are belioved 1o be froe of any virus or ather defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and
opened, it Is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it s virus free snd no responsibility bs accepted by American International Group, Ine. or its subsidiarics
or alfiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOITIOE:

Thao mformation in this emusd (and ary stechments) s confidental. if you are ol the inmrded ecipeed, yoo muet fot use or deseminaie ®e infemation. § you hove received this smail in eror, plesss
imeradiabaly nolify ma by "Reply”™ command and permanently delnte the onginal snd sy coples o priniouts iherecl, Although e emall and any sftachmenis are belisved io be iree of any virue or
et dafect ihal mighl affect any compuler myslem o which L is recereed and cpened, | s D esponsibilily of the ecpieni 19 ensurs hal il iL vina Pes 80d na issponaibdly s sceepied by Ameacen
Imemational Group, ne o B subsdipnes or aifistes eiiter Ry or sevarady, for ey oEn oF GOMBQe ariseng i &0y sy om S use
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> Back to OneMotoring

* Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cnamer 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicke No.:

Vehicie to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date
Wehicle Make

Vehicle Modal:

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chasals Na:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transter Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Efigibiiity

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

COE Category:

COE Period(Years)

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Pliase note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for 3 5-year period. subject to the statutory lifespan [if applicable] of the

vehicle

The information contained herein is correct 2 ot 09 Jul 2019

BARFICMF Ratmls Frm

OK

Camparmy
FEHAG

YMIT48Y

Mo

09 Jul 2019
MITSUBISHI
FR&17TMWSJRDEC
White

2006
4016786203
FE&1TMB10167

$37278.00

23 Jun 2004
23 Jun 2006
2

§$1.B44 00

Nao
$0.00

22 Jun 2021

C - Goods Viehicle & Bus

5
§2232600
£3 71900
$6.719.00

Vinepia Nl'"-“a“-ﬁ'-"'ulr"“m-mmWllm-ﬂmIHMWIWHrmy VA b= UL |



SERVE YOU MOTOR SERVICE
BLOCK 5033 ANG MO KIO IND. PARK 2 #01-265
SINGAPORE 569536
TEL. NO: 64815652 FAX: 64831654
REG. NO, 224630/00L
E-MAIL: elainesyms@gmail.com

Our Ref: YM 3746 Y Your Ref: SKB 7934 T
Date: 09-JUL-2019

M/s : AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES NO YM 3746 Y / SKB 7934 T

ACCIDENT DATE: 22/05/2019 Along BEDOK NORTH STREET 3

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING
DAYS

We have been authorized by the registered owner of Vehicle No. (YM 3746 Y )
which was involved in the above mentioned accident.

We understand that Vehicle No. (SKB 7934 T) was insured by you.
Please arrange with your surveyor to conduct a pre-repair inspection (without the estimatad

cost of repair) on vehicle bearing registration No. (YM 3746 Y ) at our workshop.

If we do not hear from you within 2 working days from the date of this notice, we shall proceed
to appoint the independent assessor to survey and repair the sald vehicle, and also caim for
any additional loss of use arising from the date of this notification being Issued to you.

Yours faithfully,

Elaine Chia (H/P: 92393188)
SERVE YOU MOTOR SERVICE

LL

N
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owvner 10x

Vehicle Details

Vehicke Mo

Vehicle to be Exported
Intended Dereghitration Date
Wehicke Make

WVenicke Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine No.

Chassis No.

Maxlmum Power Cutout:
Open Market Vilue

Origiral Reghstration Date
Firsl Registration Dute:
Transler Count:

Actual ARF Paid

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Eapiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Crate:

COE Category:

COE Period! Years)

POQP Pald.

COE Rebats Amount:

Total Rebate Amount
Message

BADEITME Buiumis B e

Comparry
FHEAG

YR T48Y

Mo

09 Jul 2019
MITSUBISHI
Fr&1TMSIRDEC
White

2008
&D16986203
FEKS17MB101467

$37278.00
23 Jun 200&
23 Jun 2004
2

$185400

Mo

000

2 un 3021

C+ Goods Vehicke &Bu
-

$2232600

$8.719.00

$8.719.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for 3 5-vear period, subject to the statutory lifespan (If apolicablal of the

wehicle,
The information contained herein is correct as a1 09 Jul 2019

OK

TVVRBIT FrWT ) L Y R WY I | L BTSRRI TR P LI LM LTI L R R A T A ViR _ b= i



1JR2020 Adjuster Immediale Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd carege1sesorisss)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
. Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com:assignments@ikkauto.com

Ta * AlG Asla Pacific Insuranca Pta. Ltd.

Attr : MdNoor, Norsigh

Your Raf 004890667356

Cur Ref . CC4/AIG19012223/KKAS

Date 11 Oct 2019 *WITHOUT PREJUDICE™

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB7934T & YM3746Y ON 22/05/2019
Refer 1o the above accident.

The accident ocourred when both vehicles were marging al the merging lanas.We opine that BOLA 18 is applicable. We
have clarfied with the Ol on the nature of the accidant and he/she s aware that his/her NCD would be affectad.

On behalf of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid., we have successfully | not successfully carried oul TP Express
Settlement batween your insured (vehicle no. SKBT934T) and third party claimant (vehicle no. YM3T748Y).

Summary of offer made to workshop Serve You Motor Service | as follows

Claimed Revisad

Cost of Repairs § 44000 § 440.00
Loss of Use (2 days x $200) § 400,00 360,00 (2 days x $180)

Total 5 840,00 800,00

50% 420,00 400,00

LTA Seerch $ 740 § 7.48

Total S 42748 § 407 48

Amount of claim at Liability S0% -] 407 48

Enclose herewith the relevant supporting documents for your parusal

For your approval please.
Regards,

Khanchna Pothura)
LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

hitps://singapore. menmen.com/claimsfindex cfm Musebox=SVCdocAfuseaction=dsp_viewersman&noimgviewsr=18Rype=28docid=4B7377368pr .. 111



Khanchna !LI{I{ Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 4:04 PM

To: Elaine Chia

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Accept offer for our ref YM 3746 ¥ documents - DOA: 22.05.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG19012223/Kkal

Attachments: AIG DV pdf

Without Prejudice

[sove as fo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer o the above matter,

Thank you for the acceptance.

We attoch herewith a copy of the DV for your further action,
Thank you.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence an the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

» Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeq, «

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna @ lkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Elaine Chia <elainesyms{@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 2:01 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: Accept offer for our ref: YM 3746 Y documents - DOA: 22.05.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIGI19012223/Kka3

Thank you

Elaine Chia



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 4:16 PM

To: Elaine Chia

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: Status for our ref. YM 3746 Y documents - DOA: 22.05.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG19012223/Kka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose seftlement on a 50% liability basis for global sum of $407.00(all in).
Please confim acceplance,

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is nat bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Wishing vou a happy and a prosperous New Y ear!™

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaa lkkauo.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Libi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

From: Elaine Chia <elainesyms/agmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 2:20 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnai@|lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSngialkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a/@lkkauto.com=>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-di@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Status for our ref: YM 3746 Y documents - DOA: 22.05.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG19012223/Kka3

Hi Khanchna
Re: Status for our ref: YM 3746 Y documents - DOA: 22,05.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G19012223/Kka3

As spoken, we are aware that you have sent a reminder to AIG insurance for the offer.

I



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Md Noar, Norsiah <Naorsiah MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 4:11 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Mandate Request - Accident between YM 3746Y & SKB 79347 (AIG) on 22/05/2019

Dear Khanchna,
Please proceed as recommendation.

Thank you

Kind regards
Morsiah

Noarsianh Md Noor
AlG

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

! BTANT NOTICE

[¥]=

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ilkkauto.com)|

Sent: Wednesday, January 8, 2020 1:04 PM
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Mandate Request - Accident between YM 3746Y & SKB 79347 (AIG) on 22/05/2019

This message is from an external sender: be cautiou

AlG REF: TP / 004990667356

e



) Dﬁ.;r Ms. Narsiah,

Third party is chasing for offer.

summary mandate |A uploaded in Merimen.
For your approval please.

Thank you.

"Wishing you a happy and a prosperous New Year!"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 4:44 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Mandate Request - Accident between YM 3746Y & SKB 79347 (AIG) on 22/05/2019

AIG REF: TP / 004990667356

Dear Ms. Norsiah,

Summary mandate |A uploaded in Merimen.

All the relevant documents had been uploaded in Merimen.
For your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




Mernimen

e-Claims

Page 1 of ]

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Hotified Est Sudyrrutied £ Assigrmd Adj Rpt | Ad) Subrmitied Lins Aiith'ed Stabus
|01 20 2019 ig p— $$440,00 | s$440.00 """""m o for e
£t g | e i x| Eot termates | | view 2 | cancel case |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: INEM YED, 1D: 573256294
Main &
Clatmant: EDS HOLDING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No: 2012295646
Vahicle Reg . | 2240542019 00100 - 59
[ YMITA6Y Date of Loss: {154 Manths and 29 Days From LTA Aeg Date [Man ¥r)

- Policy/Cover | (Comprehensive)
Claim Type: |TP / 004990667356 Mote No.: Coverage: 28/D6/2018 - I7/06/2019
Wehicle Reg.
[ SKE7934T ::zr.“m":h- DIBMCVO000 1 34{TPFT)
{Irsured): j

Excess:

Repairer: Serve You Motor Service (HQ) BLOCK 5033 ANG MO K10 INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 #01-265, 569536 Ang Mo Kio - Tel: 64815652
?;ﬂ:‘ ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 ... [Handiad by MdMoor, Norsinh] Norsith MdNoar@aig.com
g:‘um“‘:‘:'"‘ India International Insurance Pe Lid (HQ] - Tel §3476100
Adjuster LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-1561 .. [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 16/07/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mail |
e AIG_SG (10/07/2019): Request To Upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—

Due Date Priority  Typae
No resufts.

Wigw Al [ Sunmnml Craats New Tasx I commi
Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

Task Group Subject  Handler
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Claim Documents

*¥M3746Y (00499066735G)
[SKB7934T]
™

EDS HOLDING PTE LTD
May 22 2019 12:00AM
[IXEN YEO]

Serve You Motor Service

Page | of 2

Video (1perpage [v]| M
Na | Finslired On ALG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. ($G) Thumbnall | Print
, Video - Accident

1 mw“ 1251 FramOd - Reg. Koo SERMIAT, C ¥eu Terk Beng (Vang Deehesg] . Land MOV
Letters / Comespondences 1 par «] &
ta | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Prirt
1 |(Draft) Third Party Expreas Settlement - Paymant Breakdown I Edit
Assessment Reports 1 pes H__Q %]
No | Fimalized On | LKK Auts Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Prine
1 |11/10/1% 11:40 | Adjuster Immediate Advice [ BT
Photos/Images Iperpage [~]| B
Ho | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
U |11/10/12 11:28 | General View @ arc | A
2 |11n00911:28 General View D | oedFG E_
3 |1110/1911:28 | General View 0| weaws | &
4 |11/10/1511:28 | General View @A | waaws | B
5 |13/10/19 1128 | General View 0| weaws | &
& [11/10/1911:28 | General View Q| iws | A
7 |11/10/1911:38 | Geners] View @ | edws | B
5 [11/10/19 1128 | General View Q| weerc | A
8 [11/101911:28 | General View Q| wers | A
10 |11/10/18 13128 | General View @ wewc | A
11 [11/10/19 11:28 | General View 0| waaws | A
12 |11/1019 11:28 | General View Q| wewrs | A
13 |1/10/19 11:28 General View 0| sdws | A
Documentation 1 per page E %]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (M) Thiembnall | Print
1 |10/07/1% 17:10 | LTA search O [ osaror

i 10/07719 17:10 NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP Load FOF

3 |10/07/15 17:30 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

4 10/07/19 18:15 ACKMOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 09.07.2019 ‘ Load POF

5 [10/07/1% 18:35 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 09.07.2019 Load POF

& 11/07/19 15:51 TP ESTIMATE MARKED Load PDF

7 |#6/08/19 11:06 | EMAIL TO OF Load POF

B |11710/19 10:4% | TP SIGNED LOD & ATA. Load PDF

o [13/01/2011:02 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

10 | 13/D1/20 11:02 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

11 [13/00/2011:02 | Releass Veoucher Load POF

17 |13/01/7011:02 | LTA SEARCH Load POF

13 | 13/01/20 11:02 LoD Losd POF

No_| Finalized Om AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (56) Thumbmail | Print
1 |10/07/19 08:34 | O GIA REPORT Losad PDF

Documents Checklist

'mm‘m CHECKLIST

fesel | Save | mil
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I'I'I'rl.-rl are no document checklists configured. l

Qur Chocklist Remarks - LEKK Pie Ltd (HQ)
Fa)
W

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Hgtn Bwaras Bee el Wi EEE yOu Show 1 D ofer oertes
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| vehicle No: SKB7924T (Insd veh) Model: ITSUBISHI
YM3746Y (TP veh) K617TMSJRDEC 7.5 D (M)
| Date of Accident: |22/05/2019
Global Sum Settiement | - | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate - 1,670.00
Final Repair Cost 5 407.00
Loss ol Use - 2.00 days at $180.00 per day
Rental (if any) ] days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 5
Others §
-
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) 3 407.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registerad? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
loelow)

A) For Non GIA Reqlstered Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) Faor GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)

* Assessed Liabilily to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

11 | Serve You Motor Service 1 407 .00
2) . §
3) .5
4) - 8
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN ar
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporiing documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation te Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 13/1/2020
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo 1898071888

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapare 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Fila No: CC4/AIG18012223/KKA302

Date: 13/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : YM3T46Y Insured Vehicle No : SKB7934T
Date of Loss: 22/05/2019 Mature of Clalm: TP Claim No: 004580867356
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: YM3ITAEY
Make & Model! MITSUBISHI FKB1TMSJRDEC, 75D (M) Engine No: 6016986203
Reg Date; 23/082008 (Man. Year: 2006) Chassis No: FKB1TMB10167
Colour White Odometar 384372 km
Engine Capacity 7545 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: B.25 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 8.25R16 (D)
Front Lefi Side: Aeolus 8 mm Rear Left Side: Aeolus 98 mm
Front Right Side: Aeolus 8 mm Rear Right Side: Aeolus 88 mm
The above vlies regrasent [ Femanmng Ny Foacs oepen
|(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Differsnce  Diff %/
Parts 850.00 0.00 950.00 100.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 820.00 440.00 480.00 52.17
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 0.00
Towing D.00 Doo 0.00
Nett Amount (S§) 1,870.00 440.00 1,430.00 T6.47
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x 55180.00/day) (S%) 380.00
(S8) 800.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S8) 400.00
+ DociSearch Fee (5§) 749
Nett Liability (S§) 407.49
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 407.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 0a/m7/2019
Date Inspecled 10/07/2018 Inspected At Serve You Motor Service (HQ)
BLOCK 5033 ANG MO KIO
INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 #01-265
Singapore 569536
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Khanchna Pothura)

https://singapore. merimen.conv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 13/1/2020
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NOTE: This repor representa our findings af the time and piace of mepechion sished harmi Suoch inspection has beon carried ouf fo the best of our
inowiedge and ability but any ofher fabilfy under any otfrr cincumstences is heretby exprossly axcluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 13/1/2020
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairar's Amount

1 1 *FRONT TYRE LH SIDE Serviceable 27T0.00FS *F5
2 1 *FRONT TYRE RIM LH SIDE Serviceable B80.00FS *-F5

F=Franchiss pan S=Spchatt
Total Parts (S§) 850.00 0.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 13/1/2020
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneoun itema selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 TO STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEATING ON FRONT LH MNew 380.00 180.00
SIDES FOR ACCIDENT DAMAGED PORTION
2 TO PUTTY,RE-SPRAY PAINTING AFFECTED AREAS New 480.00 26000
3 TO REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT LH TYRE TO FACILITATE  New 60.00 0.00
REPAIRS
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 920.00 440.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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