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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

33 Kokl Bukit Avemic 4 (South Wing) #02.03 Singapoee 1 933
Tel! (=651 0243 1373 | Fax: i=h5) 6243 1376
Reg No 20]427044N
TO - LONPALC DATE oagr2018
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE - T/P CLAIN
ESTIMATE REPORT
RLnnELar.
VEMICLE DETAILS
VEHICLE NO . SLN1BDEL
MODEL * HONDA VEZEL 15X A
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDENT DETAILS  DATE  06-07-201%
TIME . 18 50HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR | CONTACT = JACK L|
CLAIM DETAIL - PARTS ~ —
5N DESCRIPTION aTy U:I;GELM TD;;-CEUST
1|FRONT uMPER Viste Ted 1 |s rosssols  1gsse0] BEO.
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER KM ste 2 | 85008 rmw &35¢
3|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE T 4! 1t s 200mls  21000|—
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5|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LID ¥ 1 |s  1es30ls ws| =
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11|FRONT FENDER LH T udcled t |s  ramsals  rawsef= 7
12|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING LH #F 4= | | [ ¢ 9420 | 8 s | ¥
13|whEEL ARcH 10 T[4 1 |s  2n00m|s 200D 42
¢ ot N TOTAL PRICE 1 5,064 00
. LESS 20" -1 1,182 .82
{ b SUBTOTALPRICE § 477168

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS



N DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT
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10| WHEEL ARCH CLIPS (SET) i 1 s 0008 2000 |-
e TOTAL 5 210,00
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 3:15 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LEKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKB8213) (O1: LPC - TBA) AND
SLN1806U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC19012192/Akad) on 06/07/2019 [External
Confidential]

Attachments: 12072019151211 pdf

Categories: HMEK

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VP05/022049

Dear Mei Kwan,
Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

The premium for the policy has been settled.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TQEGSJ 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

F-—

The all (¥ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Canfidential data is for use by authonsed external parties anly.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mallto:Melkwan@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 1:28 PM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Cc: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Khanchna (LKK Auto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKB8213) (01 : LPC - TBA) AND SLN1806U (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC19012192/Aka3) on 06/07/2019

WITHOUT PREIUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLN 1806U at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 February 2020 10:33 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLN1806U & SKB8213) on
06/07/2019

Attachments: DV for SLN1806U.pdf; TI209048 for SLN1806U (SMG198281).pdf

Your Ref: SKBE213)
Our Ref: SLN1806U

Dear Khanchna,

Please find attached TAX INVOICE and DISCHARGE VOUCHER for your kind onward action.
Original copy will sent to you by post.

Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Dec 17, 2019 at 10:23 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice
(save as o costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for the acceplance.

We attach herewith a copy of the DV.

Kindly send us (LEK] all the documents below for our necessary action: -
. Original LOD

. Original Final Repair Tax Inveice
’ Original Letter of Authorisation & hardcopy of the DV

Thank you.



Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving the
matter aimicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this

negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atlect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, elther party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | emall: Khanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2019 8:33 AM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLN1806U & SKB8213J on 06/07/2018

Your Ref: SKB8213)

Our Ref: SLN1806U

Dear Khanchna,

We refer to below, we are pleased to accept the offer at $4,955.45.

Please kindly let us have your DV soonest.

Best Regards,



Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTELTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Dec 6, 2019 at 9:16 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
we refer to the above matter,

We propose settlerment as follows:

|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,708.00
2. Loss of Use (4 days x $40) $ 240.00
3. LTA Search Fee % 7.45
Total 5495545

Flease confirm acceplance.

“Kindly nate that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotlation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Knanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution ail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 11:30 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SLN18060U & SKBB213) on 06/07/2019

Your Ref: SKB8213)

Our Ref: SLN1806U

Dear Khanchna,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on 23/08/2019.
We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376



On Fri, Aug 23, 2019 at 10:12 AM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:
Your Ref: SKB8213)

Our Ref: SLN1806U

Dear Khanchna,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376



MG SOLUTIONPTELTD
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-038
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No.: 201427944N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

INSURED: ..o LHEN  XUANG JUN EXFRESS

8 B B S B b SRR B B BB

CAR/ LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: ... SLN (806U o0 vheeoo

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO: .....cccccvrearnmpmsssrsmnsanarias

| / We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle
CLN 1dobu

qu”mmd Nu" BTRRLEAEAERRIRTFEREEE FERR S AT SRR R liiiliiill1!lllllllH-lH-I-+I+H!-lllI-HInlii----i-lnl------—--q-n.n-p-.---pfrgm the mpiim“-
b SOUTION PTELTD ..

MESSTS i

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Invalved on or

ok CE 19 .
aboutthe .................. day of ...ccconiiunennes 20001, have been completed to my / our satisfaction, and that

| / we have no further claim on the abova company in Respect thersof,

0, ¢ et STBNBRIUTEL 1o escs v emsreres smasns oo s er st s
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Bill To:
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

NO.100 BEACH ROAD

MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 Kakl Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapora 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reag. No. 20-142T7344-N)

PROFORMA BILL

Bill No : 1982181

#18-00 SHAW TOWER

SINGAFORE 189702

Date : 23-August-2019

Vehicle Number : SLN 18060

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

aty CLAIM AMOUNT
1 |Tocamed out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 5 4.400.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 4,400.00
7% GST 308.00
TOTAL | § 4,708.00

Tax Invoice will be issue upon amount finalised,

Please note that our above offer and any settlement anising from the above offer are made on a without
prejudice basis with sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceeding. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. No reference shall be made (o this offer or any settlement arising from this offer

in any otheprélatedmatters.
kA

= |

"

Co's stamﬁ & Authbrised Signature




' 4 ” L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
il i mE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #D1-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL' G258 31581 FAX: B258 4315

Rag. No: 189607108R GST Reg. No. 18-8607108-R

L& P

2192/Aka3n2

300 BEACH ROAD . 20.02-2020
|#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 Date: Illlllll.lllllln |I

Tinsured Veh.  sksB213 Veh. Inspected SLN 1806U

Policy No. Z18VP05021144 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/19/19/V/P05/022049 Excess (§) 0.00

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU31229747 Colour - BLACK
Odometer 188140 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R18 MICHELIN 6 rmm

L/H Rear Tyre |21560 R16 MICHELIN & mm

Dase

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED ES AT THE FRONT PDR'HU

08072018

Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 KAK] BUKIT AVE 4

{SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415933

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

= of Rapail
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FRONT BUMPER

FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @%65.80
FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
FRONT BUMPER LOWER LID

FRONT GRILLE

FRONT GRILLE BASE

FRONT GRILLE LOGO

HID HEADLAMP LH

HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET LH
FRONT FENDER LH

FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING LH
WHEEL ARCH LH

LESS 20% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN)

SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP [SN)

SET FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE CLIPS (SN)
FRONT BUMPER CENTRE LOWER LID (SN)
FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP WITH GARNISH (SN)
HEADLAMP CLIPS (SN)

SET FRONT GRILLE CLIP (SN)

SET FRONT LOGO GARNISH CLIPS (SN

SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (SN)
SET WHEEL ARCH CLIFS (SN)

LABOUR

PANEL BEATING.REMOVING AND REPLACING PARTS.

SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA.

DISTORTED

OIS NECESSARY
DEFORMED
BENT
DEFORMED
CRACKED
CRACKED
NECESSARY
CRACKED
CRACKED
BUCKLED

NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED
NECESSARY
NMECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CCE/LPC19012192/Aka3n2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 £01-25 Paya U Indusirial Park. Singapors 408033
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 198607198R GST Reg No. 19-9607188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 1808U

Page Mool 2
1,055.30 880.00
131.80 65.90
210,00 210.00
360.00 360.00
185.30 186.30
433.00 433.00
555.00 268.80
55.00 55.00
1,850.00 1,850.00
65.90 65.80
T48.50 558.70
94,80
210,00 160.00
-1,182.892 -1,020.54
4,771.68 4,082.16
50,00
20.00 20.00
20.00
400.00
320.00 250.00
20,00 10.00
20,00 20.00
20,00
20.00
20,00 20.00
810.00 320.00
1.200.00 500.00
1.000.00| 600.00




¥y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
= Jm 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- - TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315
Reg. No 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-9607188-R Page No.:2 ol 2

MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report i mades solsly for the use and bensi of ihe Cheni named on the rmnl pags o this Repan.




