Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 5:27 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 350P & YK 8756X ON 03/07/2019

Dear Khanchna

Thank you very much.

Best Regards

Suanne Chiu

Claims Asst.Manager
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 6272 3892

Fax: +65 6270 8314

@MOVA

Aulomative Pla Lid

Connect with us on nhﬂ

Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by
reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless otherwise indicated
by an authorized representative independent of this message.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 17:10

To: Suann

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 350P & YK 8756X ON 03/07/2019

YOUR REF: YK 8756X
OUR REF: CC6/A1G19012050/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
The above matter refers.

Please be informed that the third party repairer had forwarded us a copy of the Private settlement form (as attached)
between them and Infinite Frameworks PL.

We will proceed to close case as we have not done survey.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
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