714 LE

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

mWork
rage

Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel : 6844 2475
E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H

ROC number : 201015366H

Repair Performa Invoice

AlG INSURANCE Vehicle number
78 Shenton Way, Make / Model
#07-16 AIG BUILDING Chassis number
Singapore 079120 Accident date
Reference

FBN5178R
YAMAHA/SINPER T150
KMHD841CMJU728424
30 June 2019
KK1907-06

Qty Particulars

Unit Price - SGD $§

PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS

FRONT LH sioE FAIRING ~ OF

FRONT LH INNER GARNISH /  (UT

FRONT LH SIGNAL /~ (¥T

LH FOOTREST ,~ 4R CRH)

LH FOOTREAT BRACKET ,  (Syp bav) 6T
LH PILLION FOOTREST X MV

REAR LH FARINRG >1< At

HANDLE BAR (]
HANDLE BAR Ggp ckH) TN 7
BALANCER ( RH) ~ €T

CLUTCH LEVER X N/

FRONT LH FORK Assy 7~ (T

FRONT RH FORK Assy ~ OT

STEERING HEADCROWM X M/
STEERING STEM UNDERBRACKET ~ {T
STEERING STEM BEARING / MIlC
GEARLEVER ("fimtt) ~ CuT

RUBBER STAND X /At

FORK BRACKET X £PT

HANDLE BAR BrACKET ~~ (T

FRONT HEADLAMP FAIRING  ~CHT
FRONT DM LIGHT (LH) -~ ("7
FRONT DIM LIGHT COVER f Glack) / o1
FRONT FENDER X M

b b

GEAR SHIT SHAFT OIL SEAL ~~ M€
FORK OILSEAL ~ N€C
FORKOIL 7 A€

WING MIRROR ~ (LH) ~ (T
RUBBER STAND cover X M/

ReARBOX /(T
RIM - ﬂr

PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F

Less 10 %
Subtotal
Balance C/F

Subtotal

0,00~ l§S
130.00 .~ 199
150.00— 4§
180.00~ 63
250.00 "
130.00 x
410.00 ¥
350.oo§ i
230.00
170.00.~ 30
130.00
sso.ooi 280
550.00— 7 ¢7
150.00 X°
210.00,~ I1§0
130.00 .~ 30
130.00_~ §9
180.00 >

90.00 N
12000 7 2~ 90
250.00 — /IS
500.00— $§
150.00— (2§
350.00 X

/I

=

1§16

5920.00
592.00

0%

1637440

5328.00

5328.00

5328.00

12.00~"
45.00~ 0
12.00 /
400.00 407
300.00 X
500700 2=°

500-00 J$

1769.00

Balance C/F

7097.00

S



w

4 |SPRAY PAINTING

LABOUR AND MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES

Balance B/F

1 |REPLACE , REALIGN AND ADJUST ABOVE DAMGE PARTS
AND CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM

2 |TO KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS AND BODY BALANCING
TO REMOVE/REFIT, REPLACE FRONT FORK TUDES

Subtotal

Grand total

7097.00

600:00 25°
380.00
180:00 =2
380:00~ 20

1540.00

8637.00

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

« To resurvey before/afier spray painting

» To display damaged par(s) during resurvey

« Parts prices are subject to confirmation

« Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis

» No illegal modification(s) is allowed

» Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
bnmwf:ynlwwdmmmcm

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signature:
Date:
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7 mWork
rage

Pte Ltd

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel : 6844 2475

E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H

ROC number : 201015366H

Repair Performa Invoice

AlIG INSURANCE Vehicle number FBN5178R
78 Shenton Way, Make / Model YAMAHA/SINPER T150
#07-16 AIG BUILDING Chassis number KMHD841CMJIU728424
Singapore 079120 Accident date 30 June 2019
Reference KK1907-06
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD $
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 |EXHAUST COVER ma) 7 (W 180.00 6§/
1 |murrer proTECTOR  ( bi9) .~ (Y] 180.00 (/97
360.00
Less 10 % 36.00
Subtotal 324.00
Balance C/F 324.00
LKK Auto Consultants hence
ﬂnRepairerofmefollowing:my 54
* To resurvey before/after spray painting
» To display damaged part(s) during resurvey —|Th
o Parts prices are subject to confirmation
 Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis [6S-60
* No illegal modification(s) is allowed
* Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: karzworks <karzworks.sg@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 09, 2019 3:25 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: karzworks

Subject: RE: FBN5178R Finalize

Dear Steve,
We confirm COR @$2300 and DOR @4 days.

Regards,

Shu Shan

KARZ WORKS PTE LTD

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-23 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 5938

Fax: 6844 2474

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 7:36 PM
To: Darren; claims@teamworkgarage.com
Subject: FBN5178R Finalize

Dear Darren,
Kindly refer our finalize $2300 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




