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Yourref:  D19004403MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI19011942/AvE3 Date : 29/8/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sit/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SGJ5158K

We thank you for your instruction on 5/7/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
10/7/2019  at the premises of M/s SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5594392
Revised Estimate Amaount : §250.00
"Check" Items Amount : 8%
Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Mett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIATE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



NS @ FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited [ocReg ho 1550000060 G5T Reg ho M2-00016TE-S
& Ralfles Quay $21-00 Singapore 048550
Tel (65)6222 2311 Fax (65| 6222 3547

Clalms & Hoior Uinderwlting Dept: 35 Robdnsan Road #16-01 City House Singapare OBEETT
Tek {65) 6507 3848 Fax (BS) 6507 3848
wwis. mafirsicapital.com.s g

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

05-07-2019 Qur Ref No. D19004403MFSH
23-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDT207J Third Party Vehicle. SGJ 5158K

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-33 & #02-29KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
TEDQ WEE KEONG

67461515/ 86512856 Fax No. 67485015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SUCCESS UNITED PTE
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. MIL

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via WS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature reguired.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 12:07 PM

To: SUR: '"CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004403MFSH/1, SGJ 5158K
Attachments: 5GJ 5158K PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGJ 5158K
Date of survey: 10/7/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408533)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 10:49 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004403MFSH/1, 5GJ 5158k

Dear Sir/fMadam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGJ 5158K on 10/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims Tmaiito:cwgmatorclairns@msﬁrstcaﬂital,cum.sg]

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 3:21 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Jpanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004403MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 10:49 AM

To: SUR; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004403MFSH/1, SGJ 5158K
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGJ 5158K on 10/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 3:21 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital com sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004403MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Work{low System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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[] Honda Civic SIR 4M {COE till $50,000 $7,710 fyr 13-Mar-1996 1,595 cc . Sparts Available
11/2025)

The Legendary Civic OF The 90°, Minimal Electranics, Pure Driver's Car, Only For The Enthusiast! Car Has Been Painstakingly Maintained

And Restored For The Next Owner To Enjoy, Give Us A Call T Discuss Further About This Awesome Ride, High Faper Value, Minimal Ris... i

[[] Honda Civic SIR EK4 (COE till  $52,300 $8,890 fyr 17-Sep-1996 1,595 2 . Sperts available
07/2026)

Spoety EK4 Hatch Facelfted New Gen Model Perfect Chassis.Expensive New Super White Pear Paint.Very Decent Look.DOHC Twin Cam
Engine. Rabullt Interior And Exterior. Immaculsta Condition, All Wear And Tear Items Have Been Replaced.100% Flexibe Loan,We Pravi..

Classic Credit Fre Lid

7] Honda Civic SIR EK4 (COE till 59,800 $8,270 fyr 01-0ct-1555 1,595 cc - Sports Avallable
0%/ 2026)

Standard Stock, COE At $53K, 7 Years And 8 Months To Go. Foens cr oo §

D Honda Civic STR EK4 (COE till $58,800 47,610 fyr 16-Apr-1997 1,595 cc - Sports Availalabe
03/2027)

Original B16AA Engine, EK9 Distributor, EX9 Gearba And LSD (4.47d), DCZR Shifter, Full Type-R Exhaust, EKS Brake Pump, H22 282mm

Front Brakes, Raar EKD Undercamiags With Odyssey 282mem Rear Brakes, EK9 Anti Rol Bar On ASR Subframe, Original Sparco R37S Ste.., EEETD

GET YOUR 1s your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

COE Getting your COE ranewed is easy, fast and affordable, Wa'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
REMEWAL  approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today,
LOAN
[] Honda Civic SIR 4M (COE till $54,800 $6,230 jyr 23-Apr-1958 1,595 & r Sports Available
04/2028)
Fully Moddad EK4. 550 Throttle Body, Midpipe And LTA Legal, Remus Exhaust, Hasport Engine Mount, Orgura Super Single Clutch
(Repadded &nd Serviced In Jan 2018) loe Cream Bell, Original Type R Clutch Master Cylinder, AP Racing Clutch Pump, Ported Type R In..  Pazuusi o |
Monster Mators Pre Ltd
[[] Honda Civie SIR EK4 (COE till $53,800 6,160 fyr 12-Juk-1598 1,595 cc 140,000 km Sports Ayvailable
03/2028)

Super 90 Air Intake, Skunk2 Throttle Body, Carban Fibre KEN A Fiter, DC2 Exhaust, BCEA Suspension Kit, Honda Prelude Brake System,
OF Racing Twin Clutch, Mugen Steering, Enkel Racing Rims, Recarde Radng Seats; Upgrades Were Well Planned Without Neglecting Dal...

Creative Auto

Dl PLESTTD TIXTONT

| Honda Civic SIR 4M {COE till 559,900 $5,500 fyr 23-5ep-1998 1,595 oc 110,794 km Sports Available
Compare[41 © 09,/2018)



Thee Name Says [t Al It 1s The Mast loonic Car That Every Car Enthuslasts Know OF. It Is A Legend And Definitely To Gain A Few Stares
Dicwwn The Road By Car Enthusiast. Car Is Done Up And Ready To Be Browght For A Spin In Track As Well, Well Take Care OF By The Owi...

Prern Ry Mataring

Bricter

E Honda Civic SIR EK4 (COE till $52,959 55,450 fyr I7-Mar-19%9 1,595 e 172,000 km Sports Available
03/2029)

Teo Mary To Describe Within Here, o Check Elsewhere, No Dealers Consignment Arrangemant. One And Onaly In Terms OF Low Mileags,

Nurnber OF Chaners, And Overail, No Car Dealers’ Solicitation Fease Related To Consignment Or Whabever, Unwilling Sell Sa May Nt Let.. focct Swar]

D Honda Civic SIR 4A [COE till $53.800 §5, 500 fyr 20-Ape-1999 1,585 o - Sposts Available
04/2029)

Low Interest Rate, Facelift EK4 Model, In House Financing Available, Buy With A Peace OFf Mind. Well Maintained, Immaculate Condition.

All Trade In Welcome. L on )

GOwhessar Pte Lid

[[] Honda Civic SIR EK4 (Mew 10-  $98.000 £5,790 fyr 23-5ep-1999 1,595 cc - Sparts Available
yr COE)
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> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner [D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Wehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mot

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Drate:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

PP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 04 Jul 2019

Business
23171

SGJS153EK

Ma

04 1t 2019

HONDA

CIVIC SIR &M

Silver

1998

LTALI901%54
JHMEKASS0WE003542

$19,949.00
015ep 1998
01 Sep 1998
3
$27,929.00

Forfeited

$0.00

31 Mar 2028

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$39.274.00

$34,322.00

$34,322.00



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner |D Type: Business
Owrer [D: 23171
071 7 S g T s s PSS U A= i Se e
Vehicle No.: SGJ5158K
ehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Jul 201%
Wehicle Make: HOMNDA
Vehicle Model: CIVIC SIR 4M
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 1998
Engine Mo.; LTA1P01954
Chassis No.: JHMEK4550W5003542
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $19,94%.00
Original Registration Date; 01 5ep 1998
First Registration Date: 01 Sep 1798
Transfer Count; 3
Actual ARF Paid: $27.929.00
8 Y E P N e A R Y O B A s 5 R ORI AR 215 M S AT |
PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: s
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
YTV P RO FE3E7 T8 DT 1) Coio Sttt e oo i Al et ek S3mm et wvs rreizk =i |
COE Expiry Date: 31 Mar 2028
COE Categaory: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
PQP Paid: $39.274.00
COE Rebate Amount: $34.259.00
Total Rebate Amount: $34,259.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Jul 2019

oK



SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit Autohub. Singapore 417921

Tel No. : 67461515/ 67471787 Fax No. : 67485015
Website : www.successunited.com.sg

Buss. Reg. No. : GST No. 200402570G

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Estimate : TP19-087
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House T, Date ; 02/07/2019
Singapore DBRETT Vehicle Num. : SGJ5158K

Make/Model | Honda Civic-1998

Attention ; Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# - JHMEK4550WS003542/LTA1901954

Contact : 65073848 Fax Mo. : 65073849 Accident Date : 23/01/2019
Claim No. @ &Fra o 0440,
Reference .

Policy No. : 5101371523

SIN - Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 53
LISTITEMS:
1. 1pc Frt Bumper e 4 §75.10
2. 1pc Frt Bumper Side Holder RH At +~ ¢ 2980
List TotalSs : 70490
20.00% Discount 55 : 140.98
563.92
LABOUR : 2¢
Labour to change parts and respray painting at ' 380-00
frt bumper. p
Labour Total 5% : 3B80.00
]
Hdn.. (_
KK A > anaultants henc | I r
¥ ' .'I / J’ ﬁ:'l.,'lllj T IJ'|I_J 5'
= I| | : L
a1 » ) 5

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reqg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18011942/Avf3n2
s oetnasorecsssr o oo |[IIINNANIN
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 7207 Veh. Inspected SGJ 5158K
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DA9004403MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 05/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC SIR c.c 1695
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 1998
Chassis No. JHMEK4550WS003542 Colour WHITE
Odometer 163150 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/55R15 Y OKOHAMA, 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/55R15 YORKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55 R15 YORKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/55 R15 Y OKOHAMA 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT Of5 PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
9 General Information
Accident Date  23/01/2019 Inspection Date 10/07/2019
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGJ 5158K

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1of 1

; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE B75.10 -
LABOUR
1|FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH NOT NECESSARY 29.80 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -140.98 -
563,92
LABOUR
LABOUR TO CHANGE PARTS AND RESPRAY PAINTING 380.00 250.00
AT FRT BUMPER.
380.00 250.00
GRAND TOTAL 943.92 250.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS Eﬁﬂ.ﬂﬂf

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011842/Avf3n2
MARKET VALUE: $50,000.00 (EST)-PAPER VALUE: $34,300.00=NETT VALUE: $15,700.00

% /8‘
ADRIAN LING WA PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and bonefit of the Client namod on the front page of this Repori.

- -



