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Campany Regiutration Wo 1996071908

SPUHEAVE 1, 00235 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE 208838 TEL : (065) h2560861 FAN © (&S| A2SMIIE

Your ref:  DI9004294MFSH

Our ref: CS/FC119011937/Avi3 Date : 1/8/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam.,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SKK 14047

We thank you for your instruction on 3/7/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

8/7/2019  acthe premises of M/s KANG CAR REPARIERS PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5§51,732.00

Revised Estimate Amount ¢ §81,100.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” ltlems Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value - 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the

n/s portion - from
Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIATE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Liconsed Appralser



MS. Fir‘stCa pltal S First Capltal insurance Limited oomes b D00mime 41 ey bis We 16 5

5 Ratties Quay 22100 Singapore D48580
Tel (B5] K222 E311 Faic |65) EZ27 3547

Claws i Mussr Wsanewilitng Do 35 Robiman Road ®LE-O1 City House Singspors 0BEAT T

Tl (B5) 6507 3828 Fax |6%5) ES07 3840
wvinl METiCTTERQIa] com.tg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
02-07-2018 Our Ref No
28-08-2019 Claim Type
SHAT928C Third Party Vehicle

1 Kaki| Bukit Avenue 6 #01-96 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
MR. ALEX

91603213/ 91603213 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D19004284MFSH

. Third Party

. SKK14042

. BB416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

HORSEPOWER

WORKSHOP PTE LTD Attention
KSCGP JURIS LLP TP Solicitor Fax No
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. NA

Kindly submil the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is @ computar genarated letter. no signature reguired




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

i ——————— e —— e —

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 10:10 AM

To: SUR; TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Ce: 'Eileen Lee’

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE, SKK
14042

Attachments: SKK 14042 PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Swee Keong,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKK 14042
Date of survey: 8/7/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 3:48 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Cc: 'Elleen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE, SKK 1404Z

Dear Swee Keong,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKK 1404Z on 8/7/2019,

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkavto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 3:10 PM
To: 'Teo Swee Keong' <TeoSweekeong@msfirstcapital.com sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto. com>

Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLes@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE

1



Dear Mr Teo,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle currently not in the workshop and repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkautocom | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo Swee Keong [mailto:T ng@msfirstcapital.com.s
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 2:26 PM
To: ‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE

Dear Sirs

Survey assignment for your handling urgently.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Maotor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robimson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 058877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |
Aveser ot [[EETRRR] INSURANCE GROUP

Persanal Data Protection Act 2012 ["PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sa for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement,

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mafl s confidential. It may aiso be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it s intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of It

If you have received this message In error, please delete the message and all coples from your system and notify the sender iImmediately by
retum e-mail.

From: Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfi al.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:50 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital com.sg>
Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on

28.06.2019
PRI - D19004294MFSH/CTPL
Thanks & Regards

Aini



Mutﬁr Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849 | Company Reg. No. 195000106C

A Mersoer of INSURANCE GROUP
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 (“PDPA");

Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail Is confidentlal. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom It Is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have recelved this message in error, please delete the message and all coples from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: ILPROCESSCENTRE //ICICILOMBARD/HYD <ilprocesscentre @icicilombard.com>

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:44 PM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg [mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: 05 July 2019 10:05

To: MS First Capital; teosweekeong @msfirstcapital.com.sg

Cc: Kang Car (yahoo)

Subject: Fwd: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER
RESENT.

Kindly let us have your surveyors list asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

On Wed Jul 03 2019 16:03:07 GMT+0800 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time)

<kangcar@singnet.com.sg> wrote:
===-——-— Original Message

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sirs,

Our clients' motor vehicle no: SKK1404Z which was damaged as a result of the above
accident, is now lying at our premises/workshop, waiting for repairs to be carried out.

As you are the insurers of motor vehicle SHA7928C, we hereby give you notice to inspect
our clients' damaged motor vehicle at our premises/workshop. If your
representative/surveyor does not inspect our clients' damaged motor vehicle within the next
two(2) days, we shall proceed to look 1o yow/vour insured for the repair costs. This is
without prejudice to our clients' claim for damages, loss of use and incidental loss.

We enclose herewith our estimate cost of repairs and our clients' accident report for your
reference.

Please let us have your list of panel surveyors for our consideration.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity (les) to
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are
not the intended recipient, request you to natify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this
communication to anyone Is strictly prohibited and punishable by law.

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General
Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this emall unless
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”

. Avﬁ This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



Veron Chen !LI{KAutu!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 3:48 PM

To: SUR; TeoSweekeong@msfirstcapital.comsg

Ce: ‘Eileen Lee’

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE, SKK
14042

Dear Swee Keong,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKK 1404Z on 8/7/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 3:10 PM

To: 'Teo Swee Keong' <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EilleenLes@msfirsicapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE

Dear Mr Ten,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle currently not in the workshop and repairer will arrange.

Biest Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gsgignments@ lkkautocom | fax: 6256-4415
Blk 51 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo Swee Keong [mailto:TeoSweeKeang@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 2:26 PM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT OUR REF: D19/4294/EE

1



" Dear Sirs

Survey assignment for your handling urgently.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motar Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID © 6307 1848 | Fax Mo. : 6507 1849 |
A emoer o [[IETIRE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 (PDPA"):
Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com. sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Motice: This e-mail is confidential. It may alsa be legally privileged.

If you are nat the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of IL.

If you have recetved this message In error, please delete the message and all coples from your system and notify the sender immediately by
retum e-mail,

From: Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:50 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweekeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our clients’ vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

PRI - D19004294MFSH/CTPL
Thanks & Regards

Aini
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849 | Company Reg. No. 195000106C

aHemver of [[TEENE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcaplital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-maill,

From: ILPROCESSCENTRE //ICICILOMBARD/HYD <ilprocess icicilom >

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:44 PM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK14042Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019



From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg [mallto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: 05 July 2019 10:05

To: MS First Capital; teosweekeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Ce: Kang Car (yahoo)

Subject: Fwd: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER
RESENT.

Kindly let us have your surveyors list asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

On Wed Jul 03 2019 16:03:07 GMT+0800 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time)

<kangcari@singnet.com.sg> wrote:
weeememeee Original Message

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Our clients’' motor vehicle no: SKK1404Z which was damaged as a result of the above
accident, is now lying at our premises/workshop, waiting for repairs to be carried out.

As you are the insurers of motor vehicle SHA7928C, we hereby give you notice to inspect
our clients' damaged motor vehicle at our premises/workshop. If your
representative/surveyor does not inspect our clients' damaged motor vehicle within the next
two(2) days, we shall proceed to look to you/vour insured for the repair costs. This is
without prejudice to our clients' claim for damages, loss of use and incidental loss.

We enclose herewith our estimate cost of repairs and our clients' accident report for your
reference.

Please let us have your list of panel surveyors for our consideration.

3



Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity {ies) to
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are
not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this
communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law.

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this g-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General
Insurance Company Limited {Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”

. AVG This emall has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com



‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 2:26 PM

To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’

Ce: Eileen Lee; kangcar@singnet.com.sg

Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT QOUR REF: D19/4294/EE
Attachments: EST & GIASKK1404Z pdf; Re: Natice to inspect our clients’ vehicle SKK1404Z -

Accident involving.. (39.4 KB)
Dear Sirs

Survey assignment for your handling urgently.

Thanks and Regards,

5K Teo
Mator Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No, : 6507 3849 |
A Member of INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPAT):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to www. mifirstcapital com. sg for details of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mall Is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. y

if you are not the addressee or to whom it s intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have recetved this message in error, please delete the message and all coples from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return &mail,

From: Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:50 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital com.sg>

Subject: FW: Natice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK14042 - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

PRI - D19004294MFSH/CTPL
Thanks & Regards

Aini
Maotor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849| Company Reg. No. 195000106C

A Mamber of IREETIMY INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www malirstiapital com.sg for details of PDPA Persanal Data Callection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.
1



'If you ‘are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.
. \f you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all coples from yaur system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mall,

From: ILPROCESSCENTRE //ICICILOMBARD/HYD <ilprocesscentre@icicilombard.com>
Sent: Friday, July 5, 2019 12:44 PM
To: Motor_Claims <Motor Claims@msfirstcapital.com. sg>

Subject: FW: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg [mailto:kangcar@singnet com.sg)

Sent: 05 July 2019 10:05
To: MS First Capital; teosweekegng@msfirstcapital.com sg
Cc: Kang Car (yahoo)

Subject: Fwd: Notice to inspect our clients' vehicle SKK1404Z - Accident involving SKK1404Z and SHA7928C on
28.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER
RESENT.

Kindly let us have your surveyors list asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

On Wed Jul 03 2019 16:03:07 GMT+0800 (Malay Peninsula Standard Time)
<Rangcargsingnet com.sg> wrote:
==eeea=— Original Message

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Our clients' motor vehicle no: SKK1404Z which was damaged as a result of the above
accident. is now lying at our premises/workshop, waiting for repairs to be carried out,

2



As you are the insurers of motor vehicle SHA7928C, we hereby give you notice to inspect
our clients' damaged motor vehicle at our premises/workshop. [If your
representative/surveyor does not inspect our clients' damaged motor vehicle within the next
two(2) days, we shall proceed to look to yow'your insured for the repair costs. This is
without prejudice to our clients' claim for damages, loss of use and incidental loss.

We enclose herewith our estimate cost of repairs and our clients' accident report for your
reference.

Please let us have your list of panel surveyors for our consideration.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071

“Please note that this emall, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity (ies) to
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are
not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this emall, including any copies
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this
communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law.

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed In this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General
Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”
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>Back to OneMoturing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

L

Crw Business
Cwy 1507K
.E I Saaaea———— ]
Vet SKK 1404z
Wit Yes
Ints [ 08 Jul 2019
Vel MERCEDES BENZ
Vih AZ00 BLUE EFFICIENCY
Pro Blue
Ma 2013
Emy 270910301446732
Ch WDD17604321081812
Ma 115.0 kW (154 bhpl
Op- £24.512.00
[a] 13 Jun 2013
Eirs 13 Jun 2013

Tra 1
Ac §14.317.00
W L
Pt Yes
P 12 Jun 2023
PA £10404.00
s ]

co 12 Jun 2023

co B« Car [1600ce & balow]
Cx 10
op £67.201.00
o 52643400
Todal Mokt $37.040.00
The inf " Ul 201¥

OK



Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

bbby Bkl Ave s

200 Auctobiay i bkl Bukin Singapore 417EN3

TEL 6747 76dh FAX A74R 5071 Pl Lengeard singret com a2

GST201 3002018

M/S:  MSFIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSE

SINGAPORE 068877
TEL: 65073848

FAX: 650073849

Estimate No:
Date:

Veh Reg No:

ATTN: Motor Clmim Department Make/Model:
Chasis No:
Claim Twpe: Third Party fo oy Reg. Date:
Accident Dare; 2806720149 Your Ref No:
TP Veh Reg No: SHAT928C
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SKK 14047
Quantity  Description
List Price
| | PC FRT DOOR SIDE MIRROR LH &1 vy,
Y§D
9{ . Less 10%
gl &
Labour
2 | vl | TO SPRAY PAINTING
3 | TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE DAMAGED PARTS.

KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT DENTED PORTIONS, AND FOR

L0

CUTTING/'WELDING WORKS.

Add GST @ 7%

Total Amount Pavahble

EST1900207
03 Jul 2019

SKK14047Z

M.BENZ A200 BLUE
EFFICIENCY

WDDI 7604321081812
13/06:2013

SHAT928C

List Price Amount
58 Ss

98000 —

980.00

98.00 §82.00

sQpOl SUS

35/1},90"3%:

85000  850.00
Total S8 1.732.00
121,24

S$ 1.853.24

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY THREE AND CENTS
TWENTY FOUR ONLY

This is only an estimate based on our preliminary inspection and does not cover additional parts, labour time

which may be

™mJar
3w r--r-.rf—-o_..-:lu‘ 2 |
s slimand
] LS wwergeed amd
] = Al abpd«al Trom mleance Company

L{_g i'::d:?.:JL‘J'F‘IF'i{f

required after work has begun.
For hngtnrlhmlmﬂ Pie Lud
I_‘H:‘-- A -
LK -ansdllants hence nolily |:
# w1 of tha I ||l_".'ill1;
. o dltar 4ty DaIMhng AUTHORISED SIGNATURE
1 B el ot -'urm

"’T&j f ..:-f."...--
(+(k

e



Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

| haki Bubit Ave 6, ¥02-06 Auobay @ kak Bukn Smgopore 41 TEE3
TEL 6747 7036 FAX: 6748 5071 Ematl knngoerilsingnet, com 3g
OST2001 3002010

M/S:  MSFIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD Estimate No:  EST1900207
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Date: 03 Jul 2019
SINGAPORE 068877
TEL: 65073848 FAX: 65073849 Veh Reg No: SKKI1404Z
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  M.BENZ A200 BLUE
EFFICIENCY
Chasis No: WDD1760432J081812
Claim Type: Third Party Reg. Date: 13/06/201 3
Accident Date:  28/06/2019 Your RelNo:  SHAT7928C

TP Veh Reg No:  SIIAT928C

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No SKK14047

Quantity  Description List Price Amount
55 S5
List Price
I IPC  FRT DOOR SIDE MIRROR LH 980.00
980,00
Less 10% 08.00 882.00
Labour
2 [ (FRONT) TO SPRAY PAINTING 500,00
3 i TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE DAMAGED PARTS, 350,00

KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT DENTED PORTIONS, AND FOR
CUTTING/'WELDING WORKS.

850.00 850.00

Total 5% 1.732.00
Add GST @ 7% 121.24
Total Amoumt Payable 5% 1,853.24

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY THREE AND CENTS
TWENTY FOUR ONLY

This is only an estimate based on our preliminary inspection and does not cover additicnal parts, labour time
which may be required after work has begun.

For Kang Car Repairers Pte Lid
Lyl

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL 8258 3561 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. Moo 19080T1068R GST Reg Mo, 19-9607168-R

Affillated to Fedaration Intemationale Des Experts En Automabile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Raf CS/FCI18011837/Av{An2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 pate Q02 I“I|III|I|I|HI
Code : FCIZ2
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA Ta2BC Veh. Inspectad SKK 14042
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19004294MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 0s/072018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition |
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ A200 c.c 1585
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WDD1760432J081812 Colour BLUE
Odometer 151307 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. i ‘Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 MICHELIN 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VF_HICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/& BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  28/06/2018 |inspection Date 08/07/2019
Survey held at KAMNG CAR REPAIRERS PTELTD
NO.1 KAK]I BUKIT AVE 6
#02-06 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417BE3
5a. I Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT ﬁ.L:‘THGRISED REPAIRS.
TR  EstmaleDaysofRepair | e

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 'Harl:ing Days




! V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

’m;"_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 5258 3561 FAX: 8258 4315

Reg No 199607198R GST Reg No. 16-8607188-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKK 1404Z

1|FRT DOOR SIDE MIRROR LH cuT 880.00 880.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -88.00 -88.00
882.00 882.00
LABOUR
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 500.00 300.00
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE THE DAMAGED 350.00 200,00
PARTS KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT DENTED PORTIONS, AND
FOR CUTTING/WELDING WORKS,
850.00 500.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,732.00 1,382.00

KL

ADRIAN LING WA] PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Licensed Appraiser
DESCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PANTIES - This Report b msds sobely lor the use sod benadll of the Clisat named on the tront pege of this Bepen.

Bemorn in whobs or in gart. doss se ol his or hes oem ek



