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PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
2472K

YM9933)

No

08 Jul 2019
MITSUBISHI
CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
White

2015
4P10B98367
FEB21EA20111
$30,223.00

26 May 2016
26 May 2016

1

$1,512.00

No

$0.00

25 May 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$18,677.00

$12.847.00

$12,847.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Jul 2019

hitps://vrl It gov.sg/lta/vel/action/enquireRebate By Public Before Dereg Input 7FUNCTION _[D=F0304...

Page | of |

08-Jul-19



Used canter Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

saCarRMAaRT.COM

Mow Cars lised Cars Sall My Car Directory

Page | of 3

Producie Insurance Articles Forum Resoutcesy

TEST DRIVE TODAY!

(O 6250 6696 / 9637 5329

Ivaertisoment
Sall n yoursell® Advertse it o2 just

£58 until it's SOLD!

1€

CRGET

Mordel

Frice

Mitzubusbe Fuso Canter FEB21 458 BOK
Fuel Type: Dwse
s Good A New, Wah Maw

Fuel Type: Dwess|

£53. 800

1A5ERRm Full Agent Service. 1 Cawreer, Full

LI EE O f FERE] 53
Fuel Type: Des=l
Free [nsagance! | Ownar

14 Feet Loy, Class 3 Cen D

E 2 Fum ST il £55 OO
Fuel Type: Dwse
verer |4 Fest Truck With Cars

oy, Ciass 3

The foreeard- thinking ail-slectne Ka Nirg BV with g futusitic

Mita bt Furs it 257 000
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Mt ubiski By nter FEBTH
Fusd Typa: Didss|

Fiet=d With Power Tadboard

f4d B0
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" Nivitha (LKK Auto

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iiicom.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 9:00 AM

To: AbwinM39 - Sharifah; ‘sur@lkkauto.com’; Admin-D {LKKAuto)

Ce: Manivel Priyadarshini

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection - Accident Involving YM9933) & SHA6115M an 02/07/19
Attachments: SAS2628443 pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle YM2933. and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Friya,

*Kindly upload this survey request email lo menmen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

® InDIA
. . INTEH.N.&TIDNH.L
( INsuRANCE
FI NG AFOED
Lerveng (e rejies dnge | 0T

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: AbwinMB3 - Sharifah [mailto:sharifah@abwinm3.com]

Sent: 04 July, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Motor Claim - |Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection - Accident Involving YM9933) & SHAB115M on 02/07/19

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Gabriel,

Please proceed to appoint LKK for the PRI,
Thank you

Sharifah (Ms)

Claims Executive
DID +65 6713 9408 M +65 9848 2243

wABWING; i

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o Inp1a
® @ InTERNATIONAL
( [nsurancE
Pl NG AFODRE |
Srwing P Fagli e [ BET

B4 Cecll Strest; #05 - 108 Building
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

Fomess ARudnhAl  Charifak Tasailbaoharifak@maboeinma crml




Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.
Registration No., 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. I you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



84372018 Masiman a-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :

*¥YME933] (MCT19070058)
[SHASL15M]
™
AEROGAS (5) PTE LTD
Jul 2 3019 3:00PM

i)
Abwin Service Pe Lid

From India International Insurance Pta Ltd (HQ) {II1_SG), sent on 03/09/2019 16:42 PM.
To LMK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$3028.00) - YM2933) - Claim Handler: Priya
Approved:3028.00:LOR maximum $150/-

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - -
There are no documents.

mﬁwm.mm.mmmummmwm;miwiﬂmnmwnld:m.mum.. 12




TrR252018 Insurance Claim

7 ABWIH SERVICE PTE LTD
A KAK] BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE &
HOT-48 PREMIER £ FAKI BLIKIT SINGAPORE 415875
Teki ET136400 Fax 67139416
Email: servicocentrefliabwin com sg  Webaite www abwinmd.com
Company Reg, No- 21 31B685G GST Rog. No: 2011166856

SABWIN 6

Service Ceatre

03-JUL-2019

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET #04-02 10B BUILDING SINGAPORE
045711

SINGAPORE 049711

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 02-Jul-2019 INVOLVING ¥YM9933] & SHA6115M AT BALMORAL ROAD

We are authariced repair workshop for the owner of vehicke, YM9933], which was invalved in the captioned accident with your
insured's vehicle, The vehicle owner has requested and authonised us to assist him/her in presenting his daim against the party
respansible for the damage to the vehicle,

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SHAG115M, we are submitting these claims for vour consideration

on behalf of the owner/driver/daimant.

1. Cost of Rapair £2,568.00
2, 2 days Car Rental x $250.00 $500.00
3. Loss of Use {2 x $180.00) $360.00
4, Survey Fees -
5. LTA Fess -
6. TP/GIA Faes
7. Medical Fees -
B. Others

(E&OE) $3,428.00

We enclased the following documents to support the dlaims:-
Repalt/Excess Bil GWPulu Raport{s)
[ ] surveyor Report [ ] swarre search [] car Rentai s
[ colourea Photographs [ ] mnsurance certificate [ | Othes -

[] power of attormey [ ] Medica i
[ ] witness statement

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement af our client's claim as soon 25 possibia.

Please note that It Is a condition of any settlement reached that It shall be without prejudice to any personal Injury claim (if any) of

the owner/driver/caimant.

Yaurs faithtully,
ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

. &Mﬁ]} "y
SHARIFAH . h

Claim Department
Emall : SuAR (R (L A inm - COW,

hittps:Hhww_rettacioud orglApos_Abwinfinse_groupliras_prind php?insc_id=insc20180000076

n



THER018 Insurance Claim

" "ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

L

* B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2 afl -
#07-48 PREMIER (@ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 415875 : p

Tel: 67139400 Fax 67139415 ﬁ

Emall; servicecantrediabwin com ag  Wabsite. www.atrinmE com
Company Reg. No: 2013186856 GST Reg, No: 2013186856 Servie Cenme

Date : 03-Jul-2019

From : AEROGAZ (S) PTE LTD (Name of Policyholder)

My Vehicle No, : YM9933] Other Vehicles : SHAG115M
Accident Date : 02-Jul-2019 Location : BALMORAL ROAD

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To : INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD (Third Party and/or Third Party Insurer)

authorised ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD to proceed with the repairs to my accident damaged vehicle and to proceed
th 3rd Party Insurance Claims against Third Party and [ or its Insurer an my behalf for property damages, costs, and
expenses, including loss of use, loss of rental, medical fees and legal costs.

To have absolete discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim against third
party (except personal injuries and medical claims),

As ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will be handling the entire 3rd Party Claims, which Includes signing / submission of all
relevant documents and negotiation of my claims on my behalf, kindly forward and make payable all proceeds to my
claims to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

I confirm that the payment of any negotiated settlement with and accepted by ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will serve as
an effectual discharge of my claims against the Third Party and [ or its Insurer for the damage caused.

"'_j_‘_\ '

M P P el .
Policyholder’s Signature / Company's Stamp (If applicable) Withness's Signature
Name : AEROGAZ (S) PTE LTD Name : SHARIFAH
NRIC No. / ROC No. : NRIC No. : =«

AV o
Designation :

hitps: o zettaciond orglApps_ Abwinfinac groupfinse_print_authorization phpPinse_id=insc 201800000749



IHDI.\ INEA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE I'TE LTD l

|HTIWTIEMI. (o Reg Mo TUITORTOTN | GST Heg Ma M2 GO0 TR X

ok | Ceet) Stpect | B0 | PO | #0602 | 000 Huilding | Singapore 0497 11
IN!UMHCE Oithce (B5)6MTE100  Emdll  fesured®ilionmsg
ok S 2l Bax  (BS) 62244174 Wiehsite wiewelii cumm o

e Lde e N

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
|ll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: v wmarisaroosn
Claimant Ref | v

Wedl, ARV SERMVICE PTE LTD {("the workshop®) hereby confirm thal we'l have reachad an agreament

wilh the appointed Surveyor of Indla International Insurance Pis Lid LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid irame

of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 5§ __ 2ssc0 _ (repair cost), 5§ ___sam _ (loss of

usatrental), 58 —— ([search fee) vehicle no. _YMoED that was damaged pursuani 1o the accident which ocoumed

on __Qumroais idate) &t BALMORAL AOAD {location) involuing wehicle ne. _Buas) g (insured
] vehicle). This & pursuant to the mspection conducted on __ cemioos (date) at the workshop®

Wel confirm that we/l arelam authorized by the owner AEROGA (S| FTE LTD {"the third party

claimant”) of vehicle no. yamesaa) o make the clalm as =el out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authorly to seliie
the matter on histher behalf in @ manner that we deam fit Wai enclose hedein the letter of authonty gren by “the third
party claimant®

Wedl further confirm that we!l will indemnify India International Insurance Ple Lid for all damages,. Ioss andior expense thal
they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party clasnmant” afier the above sand agreement loodges a
furthar ciaim against theé formar for any loss and expensas suffered pertaming to cost of repairs andl/or rontal and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage to _vwesny {vehicls no ) as 8 result of the accident

Well confirm that the agreement resched above s in full and final settiement of all claims of “the third party claimant”
pursuant o the accident and that further [hig setliement is reachao on @ without prefudice and without admission of fiaDiity
basis

This agresment is subject 1o the application of Singapore law and Ihe Singapore Couns have exclusive junsdiction aver any
dispule ansing out of the same

Dated this E"‘{ g
(7 N\
CLAIMANT: | [ LKX }) .
Signature \_::»_i,a {-KS
Signed by appointed Surveyor
Name LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
NRIC: 20 13\86 55 NRIC: 189607 198R
Address: b e W'CJT a-\'-E_L\ Address: _51 Libi Avanue 1
wory -4 s LS89 #0125 Paya Ubi Ind. Park S{408933)
Nationality Nationality

Occupation: Occupation




TEE-’?_.F'IH Proforma Invoice

“ ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2

#07-48 PREMIER @ KAK| BUKIT SINGAPORE 415875

Tal 87138400 Fax: 67138415

Email servicecontre@abwin.com sg VWebsite: wwa abwinmd.com
Company Reg. No: 2013188858G  GST Reg. No: 2013186856

BABWINGz

PROFORMA INVOICE: HQPI00013

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
&4 CECIL STREET #04-02 10B BUILDING
SINGAPORE 049711049711

CONTALT : 63476100

VEHICLE NO  : YM9533)

MAKE 1 MITSUBRISHI

MODEL : CANTER FEB21ER4SDEB (CBU)
MILEAGE : DEM

DATE 22-JUL-2019
JOB SHEET NO H HQIS00459
SERVICE ADVISOR : SHARIFAH
JOB START : 2019-07-16 16:57:01
JOB COMPLETED : 2019-07-17 15:50:35
PAGE . 10F 1

NO STOCK CODE DESCRIPTION

QTY UNITPRICE SUM (S5GD)

1 CLAIM COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE YMS3933] (THIRD 1 2,400.00 2,400.00

SERVICE PARTY CLAIM) DOA: 02/07/2019 CLAIM AGAINST
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE / SHAG115M

SGD : TWO THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED AND SIXTY-EIGHT ONLY SUB-TOTAL : 2,400.00

GST-7 % : 168.00

TOTAL : 2,568.00

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

PREPARED BY

hitps:/fev zettacloud org/Apps_Abwindpiny_groupdpiny_print php?piny_idepine20190000013



g A INVOICE
Ronlal, ‘o Wit
ALTOMOSLE RENTAL SEVICE E;ﬁ:f-,"::-u;&ﬂf:f;nmmm Qummmgﬂi' 24/07/2010
BILLING DETAILS TERM
NAME/COMPANY | AEROGAZ (S) PTELTD VEH REG. NO. © ¥MBZ30K

NRIC/ REG ND. | G2953746X%
CONTACT PERSON | LIJUN
CONTACT NO. | +65 6746 9933

EMAIL
—_——————

ATTENTION TO | ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
ADDRESS | NO B. KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4
#07-48 PREMIER @KAKI BUKIT GATE 2

S5/NO DESCRIPTION TYPE QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 MITSUBISHI FEBIBEGSRDEA RENTAL 2,00 250,00 500.00
RENTAL PERIOD FROM 16JULY2019 TO 18JULY2019

TERMS AND CONDITIONS A5 PER RENTAL AGREEMENT
INTEREST RATE OF 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE [MPOSED O OVERDUE ACCOUNTIS SUB TOTAL 500.00
MIAKE CHEQUE PAYABLE TD IF ANY
AURENTAL PTE. LTD.

TOTAL AMOUNT 58 500.00

FOR BANK TRANSFER, KINDLY TRANSFER TO

DBS CURRENT ACCOUNT: 072-006002-4




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Birect Settlemant

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING =
| Case |Natifind Est Submitted | Ad) Assigried | Adj mpt Adf Submitted | Ins Auth‘ed Status
|75 2 2019 ot 5$2.400.00  S$2,400.00 Pending for Survey
fde ey | | o Adi ot | gt Estmates | | view 2ot | ot o]

Refarence Claim Details

Hain

L.l.'.l..l.lﬂ SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

Tnsured: | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Feg Mo -

HMalm ! .

Claman: | AEROGAS (5) PTELTD, Co Rieg No.: 200302472K

Vehicie Beg. ~[o2/07/2019 15:00 - :59

No.: YMgeaal Date of LOsS: | 33 onthg and 6 Days From LTA Aeg Dats (Man ¥r)]
Policy/Cover

Claim Type:  |TP / MCT18070058 Nate No.: MCOMOO1S

Vehicis Reg.

Mo, SHAGL15M fé'ﬂ“'l‘;r 507044BE28-04

{Insured): J
Excees

fepairer: | Abwin Service Pte Ltd (HQ) No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 50748 Premien@Kak Bukit Gate 2, 415875 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 6713 2400

Handig | sndia International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tell 63476100 .. [Handied by Priyal

f:‘lur:::!"i NTUC Incame Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HG) - Tel
Adjuster: | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tl 6256-3561 .. [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 16/07/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view A8 | Compose Case Mail |

11_SG (02/10/201%): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - YH9933] - Claim Handler: Priya
11_56G [26/09/2015); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [S$3028.00) - YM9933) - Claim Handler: Priya
1155 (19/09/2019): Alert - Ad) Mandate Appreved (S53128,00) « YMU933) - Claim Handler: Priys
11_5G (03/09/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$3028.00) - YM9933J - Claim Handier: Priya
111_SG {23/07/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2968.00] - YM9913] - Claim Handier: Priva
1_SG (11/07/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($30.00) - YM92933) - Claim Handler: Priya

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tases | Create New Tase | “"""'"""_”

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handier Assigned By Compiletad On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 11/10/2019
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Claim Documents

*¥M9933] (MCT19070058)
[SHAG115M]
i
AEROGAS (S) PTELTD
Jul 2 2019 3:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Abwin Service Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Hlﬂlﬂﬂﬂml Ulllnldhml Composa New Letter | m
Photos/ Images [ perpage [v] &
No |Melabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1| 39/07/1815:35 | Genaral View | @ | wedirs | B
2 |29/07/1815:39 | Genaral View || edre | A
1 |2%07/1915:32 | Genaral View Losd rG | BA
4 |29/07/191539 | Ganaral View O e | @
5 |29/07/1915:39 | General View 0| wadis | B
6 |29/07/1915:39 | General View Losd G | O |
7 |20/07/1815:39 | Genaral View D | lesdirc | B4
B 2907191539 | General View 0| cadiec | &
5 |29/07/19 1539 | Genaral View O | oaws | @A
10 |29/07/1915:39 | General View 0 waurs |
11 |29/07/18 15:39 | General View 0| wuwwrs | 4
12 |29/07/19 1539 | Genaral View 0| wadwe | F
13 |29/07/19 1538 | General View Load 1pc | &
14 |29/07/19 15:39 | Genaral View 0| ez | B
15 |29/07/19 15:39 | General View 0| wurs | &
16 |29/07/19 15:39 | General View 0| ozawrs | B
17 |29/07/1815:39 | Genaral View 0| Ladiec | @
18 |29/07/19 1530 | General View 0| ladiec | A
15 |29/07/1915:39 | Ganaral View 0| wuirc | &
20 |29/07/1915:39 | Ganeral View 0| waws | B
21 |29/07/18 15:39 | General View )| wadwc | &
22 |29/07/19 15:39 | General View I_I Load 7G| A
21 |29/07/18 1539 | General View 0 | eadrc |
24 |29/07/19 15:39 | Ganeral View 0 | Lead ir =}
25 |2907/1915:39 | Genaral View O | oavc |
26 |29/07/19 15:39 | Ganaral View 0| cadwc | &
27 |29/07/19 1599 | General View i load PG | M
2 [29/07/1915:39 | General View Q| e | &
2% |29/07/19 15:39 | Genaral View 0| e | A
0 |29/07719 15:39 Ganeral View D toedirc | 4
31 |2907/16 15:39 | General View O | waars | A
32 | 29/07/19 15:39 Genaral View i Load G | M
33 |29/07/19 1539 | General View D | lcadirc | A
34 |29/07/1915:39 | Genaral View D | leedpc | B
35 |29/07/1915:39 | Ganeral View 0 s | B
36 | 29/07/19 15:39 | Ganeral View )| oedeG | B4
37 |29/07/19 15:39 Relnspection Phato i Load i | BA
38 |I9m7/19 15:39 Reinspection Fhote D | leadipc | M
3% |2%/07/1% 1539 Reinspection Photo g Load G | WA
40 |29/07/1915:3% | Reinspection Photo 0| esdiec | B
Documentation [1perpage  [V] W&
un%mwm Emmmmmm[m | Thumbmnall | Print
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Photos/ Images [perpage v ®
No | Relsbel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [0%/07/19 14:01 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 05072019 ) | toadFoF

z |05/07/1% 14:03 | TP GIA REPORT _8 Load POF

3 [14/07/1909:28 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF

‘4 139/07/1215:02 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

5 | I902/19 15:02 RENTAL RECEIPT Load PDF

& |29/07/19 15:02  |LOD Load FOF

7 |11/10/19 0946 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF

B |11/1/1909:96 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

HNo | Finalized On India Intarnational Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
t  loapr1008:57 | singapors Accldent Statement | @ | tosdror

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST messt | save | et |

There are no docoment checkhists configered.

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico resnersssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkauto com,assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1118011913/UGB3Q2

Date: 11/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid  Policy No: MCOMODO15
Claimant :
Vehicle No : ¥Maa3ll Insured Vehicle No : SHAB115M
Date of Loss Q20772019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim Mo; MCT18070058
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: ¥M2933)
Make & Model: MITSUBISHI FUSO, 10.7 D FVTOHJADDDES (M) Engine No: 4P10BBB3ET
Reg. Date: 26/05/2018 (Man, Year: 2015) Chassis No: FEB21EAZ0111
Colour: Brown Odometer: 126075 km
Engine Capacity: 2998 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S3$); Market Value/New Car Price
H H
Geaneral Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Fooltbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: Na Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 165/85 R15 (D)
Froni Lefl Side: Bridgestona & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6/6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side; Bridgestone &/8 mm
The above valses represan! (he remarming Iyre resds depi
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjusters  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 2,896.02 223375 862 27 2287
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.080.00 T70.00 1,310.00 62.98
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S8) 4,976.02 3,003.75 1.972.27 30.64
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,400.00
(S5) 4,976.02 2,400.00 257802 5177
+ G5T 7.00/7.00% (55) 348,32 168.00 180.32 5.7
Natt Amount (S$) 5,324.34 2,568.00 2,756.34 5177
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S580.00/day) (5%) 160.00
+ Car Rental (2.0 x 5$150.00/day) (S5) 300.00
Nett Liability (5§) 3,028.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 050772019
Date Inspected: 08/07/2018 Inspected At Abwin Service Pie Lid (HQ)
Mo, B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #07-48
Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875
Estimated Period of Repair. 3.0 days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This repor reprasents our findings al e Hme and piace of ingpection sfated Minmn Sych inspechion has bewn carmed oul Io e best of our
knowiedge and ahiity but any athar kabilly under any oitar circmstances s horhy expressly exciuded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 29 Jul 2019)

|Parts: MIA MITSURISHI FUSO 10.7 D FV7OHJADDOG4 (M) (Model not avallable in database)

|Labour: Repalrer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prini-code for YMB833J)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimale pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last estimate page

|Further Info: llemsvalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FUEL TANK Dented 1816.02F *1,64500FL
2 1 *REAR CABIN SIDE RAILING SAFETY BAR R/H Bent 4B0D.00FS *400.00FS
3 1 *VINYL STICKER FOR AEROGAZ ADVERTISEMENT  Necessary B00.00FS *BOO.DOFS

F=Franchise part, S=SpcHetl L=LisiiemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 2,896.02 2,645.00
- List lem Discount on L Items 0.00/25.00% (S%5) 0.00 41125

Total Parts (S§) 2,896.02  2,233.75

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no niew miscellansous items selocted.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltams
1 TO CONDUCT PANEL BEATING AND STRAIGHTEN New 1,000.00 400.00
PARTS ON DAMAGED AREAS
2 TO DISMANTLE ,REPLACE AND /OR REPAIR FUEL TANK New 280.00 50.00
COMPONENTS
3 TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS New 800.00 320.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 2,080.00 770.00
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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