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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
l

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: TP/MCT19070058 |
Claimant Ref : YmM933J

We/l, __ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (name

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ 2,568.00 (repair cost), S$ 460.00 (loss of
uselrental), S§ _—— _ (search fee), vehicle no. _YMss33J _ that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

on __02/07/2019 (date) at BALMORAL ROAD (location) involving vehicle no. sHA6115M _ (insured
vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on __08/07/2019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner AEROGAS (S) PTE LTD ("the third party
claimant") of vehicle no. ymgg33a, to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle

the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herﬁin the letter of authority given by "the third
party claimant".
We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
] ) ] ) ) \ )
they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss
\
of use pursuant to the damage to _ymgg33J (vehicle no.) as a result of the acTident.
|
Wel/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlemen‘t of all claims of "the third party claimant"
pursuant to the accident and that further this settiement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability
basis. ‘

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the SingaporJ Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arising out of the same.

We/l authorize you to paythetotalamountpf S$_ 3.428.00 to _ ABWIN SERVIGE PTE LTD

Dated this 0 ....... day of ...... N i

CLAIMANT: wmqus:
Signature: Signaiure: KS
d by "the workshop" (with“:hop) Signed by appointed Surveyor

Name: A W Seeuite R1e (91)) Name: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
NRIC: 2013\86 35 NRIC! 199607198R
Address: e LT ANE Y Addrz-lss: 51 Ubi Avenue 1

%oy -4 sLM\sBg ) #01-25 Paya Ubi Ind. Park S(408933)
Nationality: Nationality:

Occupation: Occubation:

|

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD '



7/16/2019 Insurance Claim

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD -gﬁ
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2
#07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 415875 m ABWIN i@m

Tel: 67139400 Fax: 67139415 ) .
Email: servicecentre@abwin.com.sg Website: www.abwinm8.com Service Centre
Company Reg. No: 201318685G GST Reg. No: 201318685G

Date : 03-Jul-2019
From : AEROGAZ (S)_PTE LTD (Name of Policyholder)

My Vehicle No. : YM9933] Other Vehicles : SHA6115M
Accident Date : 02-Jul-2019 Location : BALMORAL ROAD
LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To : INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD (Third Party and/or Third Party Insurer)

ave authorised ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD to proceed with the repairs to my accident damaged vehicle and to proceed
ith 3rd Party Insurance Claims against Third Party and / or its Insurer on my behalf for property damages, costs, and
expenses, including loss of use, loss of rental, medical fees and legal costs.

To have absolete discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim against third
party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

As ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will be handling the entire 3rd Party Claims, which includes signing / submission of all
relevant documents and negotiation of my claims on my behalf, kindly forward and make payable all proceeds to my
claims to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

I confirm that the payment of any negotiated settlement with and accepted by ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will serve as
an effectual discharge of my claims against the Third Party and / or its Insurer for the damage caused.

=Y N\ M
Policyholder's Signature / Company's Stamp (if applicable) Withness's Signature
Name : AEROGAZ (S) PTE LTD Name : SHARIFAH
NRIC No. / ROC No. : NRIC No. : %8’“@0\9

Designation :

httos://www.zettacloud.org/Apps Abwin/insc_groupl/insc_print_authorization.php?insc_id=insc20190000079
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AbwinM?9 - Sharifah

From: Suwanna (LKK Auto) <Suwanna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 October, 2019 12:53 PM

To: AbwinM9 - Sharifah

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDER - RE: COUNTER-PROPOSAL - Accident Involving YM9933J &
SHA6115M on 02/07/19

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sharifah,

Kindly send us the original document hard copy for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Suwanna Te-Uttaruang | Admin support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Email Suwanna@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: AbwinM9 - Sharifah <sharifah@abwinm9.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 October 2019 12:20 PM

To: Suwanna (LKK Auto) <Suwanna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDER - RE: COUNTER-PROPOSAL - Accident Involving YM9933) & SHA6115M on 02/07/19
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Suwanna

Please see attached signed DV and signed LOA as requested.

Please make the payment of $3,028.00 to “Abwin Service Pte Ltd” within the next 10 working days.

Thank you.

Sharifah (Ms)
Claims Executive
DID +65 6713 9408 M +65 9848 2243

B ABWIN &

Service Contre

Abwin Service Pte Ltd
T+656713 9400 | F+656713 9415
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4



#07-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit Gate 2 Singapore 415875

&l ® @& ] O 3

Repair & Al
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|

From: Suwanna (LKK Auto) [mailto:Suwanna@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 10:50 AM

To: AbwinM9 - Sharifah <sharifah@abwinm9.com>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REMINDER - RE: COUNTER-PROPOSAL - Accident Involving YM9933J & SHA6115M on 02/07/19

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We confirm settlement of $3,028.00 (all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our
necessary action: -

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Suwanna Te-Uttaruang | Admin support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Email Suwanna@lkkauto.com| fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 5:37 PM

To: Suwanna (LKK Auto) <Suwanna@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINAL REMINDER - RE: COUNTER-PROPOSAL - Accident Involving YM9933J & SHA6115M on 02/07/19

Dear Su,

For your assistance to send out DV, Will pass you the case file in a while

Many thanks

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AbwinM9 - Sharifah [mailto:sharifah@abwinm9.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2019 4:02 PM




