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> Back to OneMotoring

'Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner D Type: Company

Owner |10 D199E

Vehicle No. GBCBB7AS

Vehicle to be Exported Yeos

Intended Deregistration Date 03 Jul 201%

Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: TOYOTA DYMNA 150 MANLIAL
Primary Calour: Blue

Manufacturing Year 2013

Engine No 1KD2359320

Chassls Na, ITFAT3SY20K 202720
Maximum Power Qutput

Open Market Value: $27 854,00

Criginal Registration Date; 23 Jan 2014

First Registration Date: 23Jan 2014

Transfer Count 0

Actual ARF Paid $1.393.00

PARF Eligibility Mo

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount; $0.00

COE Expiry Date 22 Jan 2024

COE Category € - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years) 1D

PP Paid 537.532.00

COE Rebate Amount £17.081.00

Total Rebate Amaount: £17,081.00

The infermation contalned herein is correct as a0 03 Jul 2019

OK
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Friday. 26 July 2019 4:44 PM

To: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Subject: RE [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Your ref: 2557761268SG [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

VEHICLES SJP9304L AND GBCB878S ON 01/07,/2019]

Dear Jia Le,
Please proceed as recommendation

Kindly request for Rental agreement from Third party’s repairer.

Thank you

Kind regards
Norsiah

Norsiah Md Noor

AlIG

Complex Claims Examines

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapora 078120

Tel +(65) 64161606

Momiah MdNooril sig. com | www.8ig com sg

- 100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this emall {and any altschments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you rmust not use or disserminata the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immeadiately notlfy me by “Reply” command and permanently delefe the original and any
copies or prinfouts thereof. Although this amail and any aftachments are balioved fo be free of any virus or other dafect that might affect any
computer system into which i /s received and aponed, If is the rmaponsibility of the recipient fo ensure thal if is virus free and no respansibiity is
acceptod by AlG for any ioss or damage arising in any way from its usa

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:liaLe@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2019 4:06 PM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Your ref: 255776126856 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJP9304L
AND GBCBETES ON 01/07/2019]

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

AlG Ref: 25577612685G



,Daa-r sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 9304L(O1) AND GBC 88785(TP) ON 01/07/201%

We reter lo the above matter.

Mandate summary and the relevant documents had been uploaded in Merimen.
For your approval please.

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | emaik: Jinle@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 3:06 PM

To: Md Noar, Norsiah

Subject: Your ref: 25577612685G [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5)P9304L AND GBC88785 ON 01/07/2019)

AIG Ref; 2557761246B5G

LEK Ret: CC&/AIG19011797/Ada3

Dear Sirs/Modam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJFP 9304L(O1) AND GBC 88785(TP) ON 01/07/201%

We refer to the above matter.



'l

I is head fo rear collision. Liabiity is not in our driver's favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he is aware that NCD [if any) would be
affected.

We seek your approval o offer to Third Parly repairer, “"EUNOS MOTOR SERVICE" is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1, Cost of Repair $11.802.50 $5,100.00
2. Loss of Rental |édays x ¥ 770.40 % 77040 |ddays x
$120.00) [w/GST) $120.00) [w/GST)
Total | $ 12,572.90 S 587040

**Dédays recommendation for repair.

All the relevant documents had been uplooded in Merimen,

Kindly let us have your approval.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@ lkkouto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) i1s confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility 1s accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any

way from its use.



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
C Asia -
. 5. ple L4\ qpe third party claimant')
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|

| Mepiena |

of 2l _;‘I'-'“"é_,. Foed ol Ay Jﬂua.-:-.d-v G Hoi~©s fasleh S }(Eddm}-
& pe SYTES (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

cwner of
= f"f._“:" —e Ao L

.

("the workshop®) fo act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or
[Property Damage Claim) B 5 78S st es

rentel and/or loss of use (“claim®)for my vehicle no. <
damaged pursuant {o the accident which occurred on

5”'"’"3 ﬂv{.“u_..'__;__.

1| 7/19 _ (date) along
(location)
& 3T 759 L  (%the accident®).

Invelving vehicle no/s_C&c <74~

Property Damage Claim

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above munﬂunndf elalm In 2
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment furtherto settiement of my clalm _wrth payment cheque/s belng made In

favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on & without prejudice and without admission of llabllity basis insofar

as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s Is concerned.

The property damage claim should bhe without prejudice to my claim for personal injury

and related damages.

Datethis - -  dayof '~ (month)20_’ 7 (year)

5 % o oy u)
ol .__.f,,,-'“ Vi s { {1 I -
= ———t
Signed by “tha third party claimant’ Signed by “the workshop®

Thea terms of this Discharge Voucher are without
prejudice to, and resarves, the claimant's claim
for prﬂﬁigﬂfﬁ;'lagmpﬁfﬁ anal njury, in respec
of this acodent, which Ihe claimant as or may Nave.

T



Wl Eaaes Hidor leaviee ("the workshop') hentby confirm thet wen

hove rezehed on egreemenl with the cppolnted surveyer of AIG Agle Paclic lnsurtnes Plo. L,
EHE P ConBadlands P4 4 mname of surveyor') with respect 1o the Emount cisimed for

L0 00 (repecoete) SST7C - (ows of weehents) S3____(eeerchfoer) S
for veide ne, CE< S0 78 Syt vmn demieged pumient te the zesident whith ootumed Damage
ﬂﬂ..-_'l./.wﬁmm SimMA Ay s . (locxien) Ivehing
vohlola noie_ €+ B 'S 74 < € 55p Yo'y and without prejudice to any personal injury
claim relacted to cthis accidentc. i
This Ie pursugst to the Inspection conducted on 2|34 (dite ) e *the workshop".

Zr gy e LA

* Wa/l confimi thel we/I are/am suthorized by the swner /< pici e Meian v ot (hird perty claimant’)
of vehicle no_ = “C_ - © 75 to make the cleim as sat sut In the mbove permgreph end we/l have ful
sutharity fo settic the metter on his/her behalf In & menner thet we/l desm fiL We/l ehcioss hereln the latter of

authay piven by ‘the third perty clsiment’,

for only the Property Damage
We/l further confirm thet we/l will Indemnity AIG Asie Pecific Insurence Pie. Lt foc-al-damages, 1oes’ endlor
expense that they will or have sibsady Ineurres In (he svent tha! “the thind party clsimant’ sfisr the sbove said
grpament lodges & further claim sgainet the former for mny losr and expenser sufisme pansining i cocts of
mldhrHMIMrmufmmmthhﬁMbﬂ”k SRS (vehicle ne.) & € resull
of the sosident, ;

_ for only ths Property Damage
Wel ‘confirm thet the egreamant reachad above k in full snd final settement of-eny clalm of ‘the third party
" slalMeAt” pursusnt 1o the sesident and that further this settiement Is resched on & withott prejudics mnd without
sdmission of llebility basis.

ﬁkqmﬂhnﬂaﬁhhmhﬂmﬂswmmhsw Courts have exclusive
Jurisdication over eny dispute ersing out of the same.

o b . dayof ‘”"*:_ fi 20 |
I/r . month) (veer)
] ;_i' | ! ! |
Sl T
Signed by AlG appolnted surveyor Chipped b Bignsd by “the workabop'

The terms of thig Ouscharge Voucher are withoui 5
Prejudice ta, and fesarves, the claimant's claim
for Propertydermage/personal injury, in respect
ofths acodent, which the clamant has or may have.




| ' INVOICE
Speciaien in Motor Car Repin, Servicing. 3 3%} R £ 4 12 Ne 42641

Car Air-Conditioners, Car Spray Painting
knocking of Mudguarss & Cu 8o ELINOS MOTOR SERVICE

Bik 1, Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-64
N8, Prepars for ROV Inspection, Singapore 417883
Tel: 67472033, 67480107, 67473418
Fax: 67415197
Ang No. 33670100C

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSUR. PTE LTD.,

M/5
26th. July '19
, : Policy No:2019-V0106629
Owner: Neptune Mechanical Engrg Pte Ltd., ifl"!!!hﬁhk
P— GBCBB78S Toyota Dyna Ret. Our D/O No.
ITEM Price Per AMOUNT
NO QUANTITY DESCRIPTION Unit s i
Re: Accident involving vehicle GBC8B78S
and SJP9304L along Sims Drive 1.7.19
11.45
Being Lump Sum Repair by LKK AUTO
CUNSULTAN'{S PTE LTD., ADRIAN LING
WAT PING inclusive of parts and
labour charges $5100400
(S. Dollars: Five Thousand One Hundred Only TOTAL = $5100.00

! for EUNOS MOTOR SERVICE

I"

EE&D.E

Rucaived By AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Chaques 1o be made payable to Eunos Motor Service and marked AJC payes.

N.B. Ewly Rammitance will be much spprecisted.
No official receipt will be ssued for sl chegque payment unkess requested.
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CHIANG KANG ENTERPRISES CO. (PTE.) LTD.
No. 4 Petain Aoad, Petain Court Singapore 208086 Tel: 6208 1936, 6294 0246, 6204 9170 Fax: 6208 3864

@lficial Fecejpt No. 4657
gu_61H2

Rt s NECTWAE NN ENONEENNG P ED
Ko sium of Tolire. SEIEN v DnED Seden ™ BN oCvly o o

g pogeant o DYDY O O GTME I S0 ko L[H
—~ Chiang Kang Enterprises Co. (Pte) Ltd

st /"&\J

Cash/Chargue Ne: Authorised Sgnafure




@K( TS I T oL

CHIANG KANG ENTERPRISES CO. (PTE.) LTD.

No. 4 Petain Road, Petain Court Singapore 208086
Tel: 6298 1936, 6294 0246, 6294 9170 Fax: 6298 3864

GST NO: 19-8304039-K
TAX INVOICE

| | NO: 103/2019

Neptune Mechanical Engineering Pte Lid
Blk 3016 bedok North Avenue 4 #02-05 Eastech

Date: B/7r2018

Singapore 489947
Ti :
Attn : Accounts Dept e
Being rental of :
GZ4583M Toyota Dyna 1.5 tons Canopy Truck
from D1DTMB L BITMBB days. ... $ 72000
Mame Of Driver - YIU YONG SENG
5 50.40
TOTAL $ 77040

Singapore Dollars : Seven Hundred Seventy And Cents Forty Only

- CHIANG KANG ENTERPRISES CO (PTE) LTD
200




haty JCNE EL ! S
Chlang Kang Enterprises Co. (Pte.) Ltd. &« ase

TAX INVOICE No. 4 Petain Road, Petain Coun Singapore 208086 Tel: 6298 1936, 6204 0246 Fax: 6298 3864

RENTAL OF CARS, VANS, PICK-UPS & LORRIES Hi  AE - BE5E - LFRESNEE

CET Reg.No. 19-8304039-K
IM#_Y—-E':-& |h4_ AR i?ﬂ-".-*'."_ui.r'::f'f'{- —5-- I:." -l-d_lL-ﬂ'* =

HIRER'S PARTICULARS) 2 (I 2 =/ B/ k MNeoibn fpoe moe 7
If Different From = — —
Section | F’*C"‘" 'ﬂ"-"_ Fa it-el 5 “FvTYS Tel:
hereinafier called "the Hirer™ hereby confirm having agreed to hire this day from CHIANG KANG ENTERPRISES CO, (FTE.) LTD. hercinafier
called "the Owner” the undermentioned Vehicle at the rental fees as shown below and | further agree that | shall be held responsible for:-
i) THIRD PARTY ONLY MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
the Excess which is the maximum amount of $150/=to cover for any third party damage or injury claims snd also bear the full cost of any damage caused
1o the hired Vehicle remilting from any single accidem including loss from inability to let the same Vehicle out on hire or loss resulting from theft and
destruction of the Vehicle.
bl COMPREHENSIVE MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
the Excess which is the maximum amount of $2000/=for any damage caused to the hired Vehicle from any single accident or any loss resulting from third
party damage claim, injury claim, theft or destruction of the Vehicle.
€} Only persons above 14 vears of age with more than ! years driving expenence, authomised licensed and sagrming this agreement may dove the vehicle
whether or not such damuge or lpss 18 by person/persons Enown or Unknown 10 me or by neghgence or any bresch by me of the | erms ang L onditons of
Hire, hereinafier mentioned and printed at the back hereof:

Vehicle I‘-lqn No. R ~ - 53 M Rental Agreement SR No, A
Section | Hirer's-AndiOr Driver's Particulars IS /MERE ) 28 =]
[ e ﬂlll&nm“. J!T."r" = ey
Name: 7 (&0 JORE S5 Mo | mEOEREMN L=/, & 4e
o Date & TimeIN &/ 7 /0% - o
|Address: B/ 7Y fasir Fas &1 7F Chargeable |Rates  Amount
= — = |
#0 G-/ ¢ $|sre 72y B & @size]| 72
EER /NERR NECESR T | 4]
I'C No:/Passport No: Driving Licence No; =~ < ¥ fe=tC | Weeks s
EER/MEAR Pass BN A
Type of I/C-/Passpor Pass Date: Montt. @§
Hegm D
Date of Birth: Place of Issue: - ADD7% GST| = o
=SRBES 51500/ | TREBES s2000/- =En
i \Third I’myDnl]rHu:]r Excess 51 5000= hifnnqn:lunnw Policy Excess 52000/= | Delivery Fees
EMOAMREEE | b R
Vehicle Must Be Returned To Owner's Office By: | Total Charge & 770 ¥y
(it miCiR s i
Remarks & Payment Records Secunity Deposit
| Ea
Total Paysble
|
| Amount Paid
R _
o B I | Collection Fees/Misc.
IMPORTANT! For Singapore Use only! B as
[ETWAA[HMMWF] ymmis (ETRI VWY % W F | amr asss il
Fuel Tenk OUT Fuel Tank TN Rates Do Not Include Fuel | Refuelling
L gl N ¥ i z
Vehicle No: From: To: | |
| EmwE 2) i | & |
| Viehicle No: | From: To: | |
IR Wi ERE N
 Tools Spare Tyre | Accessories otal Additional Charges
EWRLA mwE
Vehicle lssued By: Yehicle Collected By:
NOTE: B
EREIIAOATMASREAR TRZEMNRE - DORE - !
HIRER AND/OR DRIVER IS LIABLE FOR ALL PARKING AND TRAFFIC et |
VIOLATIONS. o | Grand Total |
TARDRER mnnmmmmm
-‘ﬂﬂl 1/'We have read and hﬂ:hylpumﬂ:mwmdmof{;hﬂhnhnfﬁnﬁdw
=l e &R
Date: '7/* 7 Sigmarure of Hirer: el

e Py e :l?f‘
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.+-.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Notified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Adj Rt Ad] Submitted | Ins Auth'ed | Status
04 Jul 2018 oo 01 $$5,100.00  |$85,100.00 e . S for roroan
1 Eﬂltllli £ Ady Ape | gt Estimates | | view npt | Canes Case |

Hain Claim Dotails

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[Created by adjuster]
Insured: | DRANGE CARS, (Co. Aeg. No.: S3314T66M

-.?.:“m: | NEPTUNE MECHANICAL ENGINEERING PTE LTD, Co. fieg. No.: 199400199E '
1

Vehicie Reg . 103072019 11:00 - :59
No.: GBCEB78S Date of Loss: |/ g5 wonths and @ Days From LTA Reg Date [Man ¥r)]

Claim Type: | TP / 255776126856 ﬁ;"ﬁ’“’ 0999954461 (Comprehensive)

SIP9304L :‘5:"" "";r_ 2019-V0106629

. Excess!
Euncs Motor Service (HQ) 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-64 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, 417883 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 6747 2033

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid, (Express) - Tel 65-64159-3000 . [Handied by MdNoor, Morsiah] Norsiah, MdNsor@aig com

Greal American Insurance Company (HQ] - Tel. 6804 £047
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 __ [Handied by ADRIAN LING] .. | Final Rpt due 12/07/2019]

View Al | Compose Case Mai |

I
| There are no mail for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Creste tiew Task | Compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Crested On ~ Done?
' Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_c... 5/9/2019
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Claim Documents

*GBCBB78S (25577612685G)
[SIPS304L)
™
NEPTUNE MECHANICAL ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Jul 1 2019 11:00AM

Page | of 3

[ORANGE CARS]
Eunos Motor Service
Upioad Documants | Upioad Photos | Compose Wew Lener | upioss viaes | Upissa Audie | View [View in Browses [v]

| Letters / Correspondences 1 per page g )|
No | Finalired On LKK Auto Consultants Pe Lid {HQ) Thumbnall Print
t [(Dvaht) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown O e
Assassmant Reports iperpace V]| 4
o | Finafizeg On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 26/07/19 16:02 | Adjuster Immediate Advice O | Load M
‘Photos/Images 3 per page _E |
‘No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbsnail| Print
't |2507/1909:20 | Front View 0| Laaws |
3| 15/07/1909:20 | Front View 0 | toaws | B
'3 25/07/1909:20 | Front View O | wows |
:4 |25/07/19 09:20 | Front View 0 | Loediec
s | 25/07/1909:20 | Fromt View 0| ers | A
6 15/07/1909:20 | Front View O | caws | &
|7 |25/07/19 09:20 | Front View [ TR
& 25/07/1909:20 | Fromt View 0 | Laiws | 2
8 125/07/19 09:20 | Front View D | Laws | A
10 | 25/07/1909:20 | Fromt View O =ews | B
11 |25/07/19 08:20 | Front View 0 | toades | A
12 |25/07/1909:20 | Fromt View O wers | F
13 |25/07/19 09:20 | Front View 0 | e | B
|14 |25/07/19 09:20 Front View ﬁ load 1FG | B
{15 |25/07/19 09:20 | Front View 0D | s | A
ftw 25/07/12 09:20 | Front View © | oass | |
17 |25/07/1909:20 | Front View D | weawc | F
18| 25/07/16 09:20 | Front View 0 | toasec | A
119 |25/07/1909:20 | Front View 0 | eewe | A
20 25/07/1909:20 | Front View O | waows |
21 25/07/10 09120 | Front View 0| wwows | B
|22 ]'zsfnw 1909:20 | Front View D | edrc |
23 25/07/1809:20 | Front View O | weows | B
24 2507/190930 | Front View O | s | 9
25 |25/07/19.09:20 | Pront View 0 | isedwc | B
(26 |25/07/1900:20 | Front View D | tosais | (A
27 25/07/1909:30 | Front View 0 | esdrc | B
(28 (250719 09:20 | Front View D | waows |
|28 {25/07/19 09:20 Front View D | badieg | 4
30 25/07/1509:20 | Front View D | cadws | A

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 5/9/2019
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Letters/Carrespondences [tporpage  [v] B4
tio_| Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnait| Print
31 [IS07/1909:20  |Front View O t=aws | A
32 |25/07/1909:20 | Front View O | waows | B
133 |25/07/1909:20 | Front View O weows | @A
34 |25/07/1809:20 | Front View 0| s | A
35 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Phote 0 miws | B
36 I5/07/19 0%:20 | Reinspection Photo 0| cadwc | A
37 25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo 0 | i | B
38 25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Phote O wwrs | 2
39 25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0 | adws | B
40 | 25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Phota 0 | waews || A
41 |25/07/1908:20 | Reinspaction Phots D | adws | 4
I‘E | 15/07/1908:20 | Reinspection Photo D | wases | BA
41 25/07/1909:20 | Relnspection Photo O eews | 2|
44 25/07/19 09:20 Reinspection Photo g Load PG | A
45 ?5/07/1900:20 | Reinspection Phots D | lcases | A
46 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Phote O | acws &
47 |25/07/1908:20 | Reinspection Photo D | waows | A
|48 | 25/07/19 D9:20 Reinspection Photo D | loadies | A
|49 |25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Phata O | waws |
50 |25/07/19 08:20 | Reinspection Phota 0 | taws | A
51 |25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo O | isedic | B
52 |25/07/19 08:20 | Reinspection Photo D | Lesaws | B
{'5: 25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo D | tadiws | A
|54 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wows | B
55 |25/07/16 09:20 | Reinspection Photo 0D | ears | 4
igf_im:u 1908:20 | Relnspection Photo D | tosaws | B
57 25/M7/19 0930 | Reinspection Photo [+ TR |
58 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0| aaws || A
59 125/07/1509:20 | Relnspection Photo © | Losd e
80 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0 | Losdies | A
61 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo D | wwaws | @
|62 125/07/1909:20 | Reinspaction Photo D | tadirs | 4
63 |25/07/1909.20 | Relnspection Photo D | taaws | @
|64 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo O | s | &
|65 |25/07/13 0%:20 | Reinspection Photo D | waawrc | A
E-_E_& |25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photn O | weeaws | A
&7 |15/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo D | waaws | 4
(68 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo @ | tosawc | B4
|69 |25/07/18 09:20 | Relnspection Photo 0D tdrc | A
70 |25/07/1800:20 | Relnspection Phato O wwrs | &
171 |2%/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0| s |
72 |I5/07/190%:20 | Reinspection Photo D | s | A
{73 125/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo 0! wurs | A
74 25/07/19 02:20 | Relnspection Phato D | wadwc | A
75 135/07/1809:20 | Reinspection Photo @ | waaws | B3
176 |25/07/1908:20 | Reinspection Phato D | wadws | A
177 |25/07/1908:20 | Relnspection Phato O warc | B
78 2507/1908:20 | Reinspection Phato 0 eaws
| ii_z isra;flﬁi:zn Aoinspection Phata 0| tcaaws | A
‘80 |25/07/19 08:20 | Reinspection Photo O | edic | B

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 5/9/2019
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Page 3 of 3

Letters/Correspondences iperpage (v} B
Mo |Frmaloed On LEK Auto Consultants Fte Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
181 | 2%/07/19 D9:20 Heinspection Photo Load G m |
82 25/07/1909:20 | Rainspection Photo O v | B
83 ;li.r‘ﬂ?ﬂ'! 0%:30 | Reinspection Phato - O | ssdws |
B4 25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo 0D | cadwc | A
85 2507190920 | Reinspection Photo 0 | owirs | &
(86 250719 0%:20 | Reinspection Photo D | waaws | A
87 | 25/07/19 09:20 | Reinspection Photo O | adve | 4
B8 25/07/19 09:20 | Relnspection Phato 0 | erc | A
8 15/07/1% 0%:20 | Relnspection Photo © | tosaws | A
90 E:s,.rwu 09:20 | Reinspection Photo O uars | 2
91 |25/07/19 09:20 | Relnspection Photo D | wadws | A |
93 | 25/07/1209:20 | Relnspection Photo 0| s | A
ls3 25/07/1509:30 | Reinspection Photo © | s &
94 25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Phato O | sawc | & |
95 |25/07/18 09:20 | Reinspection Photo D | Lessiec | A
96 |25/07/1509:20 | Relnspection Photo 0 | oeaws | 4
197 |25/07/1909:20 | Reinspection Photo © | waows | F
98 |25/07/1602:20 | Reinspection Phote D | tosdws | M
Documantation iperpage vl A
o |Melubel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |04/D7/19 09:21 | TP GIA REPORT g Load POF

2 |26/07/19 14153 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

3 |26/07/19 14:57 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED 3 Load POF

4 14/08/19 0B:52 | MANDATE APPROVAL EMAIL Load POF

5 (05/09/15 08:06 | RENTAL RECEIPT @ | caaror

& [05/09/19 0B:DE AUTHORISATION TD ACT FORM Load FOF

7 05/09/19 08:06 | Release Voucher § Load POF

I _'ES,E'IJH,F!‘ 08:08 [ LETTER TD 01 Load POF

tig | Fmalmed Cn AlG Asia Pacilic Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print
! |04/07/1%15:21 | O1 GIA REPORT © | tosdroF }

Documents Checklist

' DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | prmt |

rTl'll'l are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist

= LKK Ltd

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Insurer
hone Bamarks sew privall cniewy you Whow | B0 sther parties
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BEREAKDOWN)
|‘Uahlr:lc No: SJPB8304L (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 D (M)
GBCBE78S (TP veh)

|Date of Accident: | 01/07/2019

Global Sum Settlement | [ [ | Yes | [X] No

Repair Eslimate = 1 12,002.50

Final Repair Cos! ] 5,100.00

Loss of Use '3 days at $0.00 per day

Rental {if any) - 770.40| 6 days

LTA | GIA Search Fee ‘5 0.00

Others: '3 0.00

‘5

Final Settlement Sum ' § 587040

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ | YES [X | NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Reqlstered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 100 %)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | Eunos Molor Senvice -1 587040
2) 4]
05 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https:/singapore. menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8VCdoc& fuseaction=dsp _docltr... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg no 1sssor1ssay

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408333
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@kkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CCB/AIG18011797T/ADAICZ
Date: 05/087/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 0955504461
ﬁ:':"“"‘ Vehicle :acearas Insured Vehicle No :  SJP3304L
Date of Loss: 01/07/2019 Mature of Claim: ™ Claim No: 255776126856
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBCBEATAS
Make & Modal: TOYOTA DYNA 150, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 1KD2359320
Reg. Date: 23/01/2014 (Man. Year: 2013) Chassis No: JTFATASY20K202720
Colour: Blue Odomater: 264833 km
Engine Capacity: 2882 cc
Market Value/Mew Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured (S$). Markel Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fron Tyre Size 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 155 R12
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgesione & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgesione & mm
The above valles represent the remaining e reads doepth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 7,162.50 303342 3.229.08 4508
Miscellanecus [tems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4.840.00 2.450.00 2,380.00 4938
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 12,002.50 6,383.42 5619.08 46.82
Approved Total (Overridden) (5§) 5,100.00
Nett Amount (S§) 12,002.50 5,100.00 6,902.50 57.51
+ Car Rental (6.0 x 5$120.00/day + 7.00% GST) (S$) 770.40
Mett Liability (S§) 5,870.40
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 02/07/2019
Data Inspected: 02/07/2019 Inspected Al: Eunos Motor Service (HQ)
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-64 AutoBay @
Kak| Bukit
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair; 6.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHAN JIA LE

NOTE: This report represants our findings al fhe bime and place of inspectan shaled henmn, Such ingpaction has been camed out 1o the best of cur
Inpwhadige and ability bul any ather lahilily under any ather circumsfances iy herby expregsy arciuded

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qly PartNo. Particulars Condition Repalirer's Amount
1 1 *REAR TAILGATE Dented 1,08530FL *1.065.30FL
2 2 *REAR TAILGATE LOCK LH/RH Mot Necessary 378.00FL ~FL
3 1 "REAR TAILGATE EMBLEM TOYOTA Necessary 175.00 FL *175.00FL
4 1 *REAR TAILGATE EMBLEM TOKM Necessary 22 50FS *15.00F8
5 1 *REAR TAILGATE EMBLEM 13PAX Mecessary 22 50FS *15.00FS
8 1 *REAR TAILGATE EMBELEM DYNA Mecessary 38.00FL “38.00FL
7 1 *REAR TAILGATE ALUMINIUM PANEL Mot Necessary 164.00FL “FL
g 1 *REAR TAILGATE END PANEL Dented 384.00FL *384 DOFL
8 1 *TAIL LAMP LH Smashed 168.70FL *168.70FL
0 1 *TAIL LAMP PANEL LH Bent 56,10FL *56 10FL
"Moo *REAR LH SIDE GATE LH Repair 1.5565.10FL ~FL
12 1 *REAR SIDE GATE LOCK LH Bent 128.00FL *128.00FL
13 1 *REAR TAIL GATE RETAINER N/S Bant T8.00FL *38.00FL
14 2 *REAR TAIL GATE STEP RUBBER Missing BB.00FL *88.00FL
15 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE PANEL Bent 150.10FL *152.10FL
16 1 *REAR SPARE TYRE CARRIER ASSY Damaged 312.00FL *312.00FL
17 1 *REAR LH CHASSIS MEMBER Repair 824.00FL ~FL
18 1 *REAR STEP BRACKET (STAIN-CASE) Bent 122 00FL “122.00FL
19 1 *REAR SIDE GATE PANEL Repair 18B.00FL *FL
20 1 *REAR FLOOR CENTRE PANEL Repair 845.00FL *FL
21 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 262.50FS *Z200.00FS
22 1 *RADIATOR Dented 1,637.00FL *1,637.00FL
23 1 *FAN BLADE Cut 182.70FL *192.7O0FL
24 2 *ENGINE MOUNTING Tom 245.00FL *245.00FL
25 1 *GEAR BOX MOUNTING Tom 117.00FL *117.00FL
28/ 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Bent 37.50FS *30.00FS

FeFranchise par S=SpcMett, L=ListhemDisc

Sub Total (S5) 9,435.00 5157.90

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (55) 227250 1,.224.48

Total Parts (S5§) T,162.50 393342

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 5/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thera are no new miscellaneous lHems solectod.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour lfems
1 TO REPAIR CHASSIS Mew 1,200.00 B00.00
2 DISMANTLE TAIL GATE New 800.00 0.00
3 TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR New B0.00 50.00
4 TO DISMANTLE RADIATOR MNew 180,00 120.00
5 TO REPAIR UNDERCARRIAGE Naw 180.00 0.00
] TO ADJUST ALIGNMENT Mew 180.00 0.00
7 TO CHECK WIRING New 120.00 30.00
8 TO SPRAY PAINTING AFFECTED ACCIDENT PARTS New 650.00 400.00
8 TO KNOCK ,STRAIGHTEN ALL NECESSARY New 800.00 B800.00
PARTS ,INCLUDING CHANGING & REPAIRING OF ALL
DAMAGED PARTS
100 TO REMOVE REAR DECK TO FACILITATE REPAIR TO REAR Mew B50.00 450,00
CHASSIS MEMBER
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 4 840.00 2,450.00

Report was unsubmilted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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