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Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 16/11/2021 8:36 PM
To:  YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'YT(HQ)' <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 November 2021 9:58 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YT(HQ)' <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'YTKB'
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi,


Accept $3000(all in) , 


Kindly let us have the DV soon,


Thank you.


Best Regards
 

SHUYI
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID: 6256 2081
Fax: 6256 2533
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61
Singapore 417800
DID: 6702 3113 
Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Sunday, 14 November 2021 10:14 AM

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Shu Yi,
 
Kindly let us have a copy of towing receipt for this matter.
 
Otherwise, please reconsider our last offer at g/s $3,000.00(all-in).
 
Thank you.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 

mailto:info@yewteegroup.com
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 16 October 2021 11:57 am

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We are pending for further mandate from AXA.
 
We will follow up and get back to you.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 October 2021 2:44 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Dear all,


Any update for this?


Thank you.

Best Regards
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SHUYI



Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
25 Kaki bukit rd 4 #01-61

Synergy @ kb s(417800)
DID:7023113
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 
From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, August 31, 2021 3:34 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YT(HQ)
<info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Dear all,


Any update for this?


Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
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P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 
From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, March 24, 2021 1:36 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YT(HQ)
(info@yewteegroup.com) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,


We propose $3500 (all in) ,


Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Sunday, January 17, 2021 12:36 PM

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)
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Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have our principal instruction to revise our offer at a global sum of $3,000.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 January 2021 2:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,


We propose $3600.00 (all in) ,

Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
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from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, January 6, 2021 12:42 PM

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have our principal instruction to revise our offer at a global sum of $2,900.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 3:22 PM

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We are seeking further mandate from our principal and will get back to you asap.
 
Thanks.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"
 
 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com> 

Sent: Monday, 21 December 2020 2:47 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Dear all,


Kindly lets us have your reply soon,


Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email
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Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 
From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com> 

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 4:55 PM

To: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Dear all,


Any update?


Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 4:44 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YT(HQ)' <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>;
YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi,
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Attached our calculation and attachment, market value less wreck value is $2503.
Please let us have the same, for our client’s consideration.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Best Regards

Sky Toh
 

Mobile: 9747 1475
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook
 
Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD
 

  
 
NORTH HQ Office:                              EAST Branch Office:                                 
Mega@Woodlands                             Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4     
39 Woodlands Close #01-12               Unit No #01-61                                        
Singapore 737856                               Singapore 417800                                                
DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines)                    DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)                                    
Fax: 6256 2533                                    Fax: 6702 3773                                      
Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg           Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg        
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email
Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely
for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately
and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents
to any person.
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 4:24 pm

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; utauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
We have our principal instruction to revise our offer as follows: - 
  

1. Total Loss* $ 1,500.00 
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2. Loss of Use (11days x $60.00) $     660.00
3. Towing Fee $     300.00

Total  $ 2,460.00
  
*For the total loss value, our principal is of the view that there is a wreck value for your client vehicle upon
deregistered. Therefore, the total loss value of your client vehicle should deduct a wreck value amount.
 
Please confirm acceptance. Thanks.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted.
 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 September 2020 9:59 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; utauto@singnet.com.sg
<utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi,


We are await for your prompt reply,


Thank you.

Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
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DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
 
 
 
 
 
From: utauto@singnet.com.sg <utauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Sent: Saturday, August 8, 2020 2:22 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'YT(HQ)' <info@yewteegroup.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi,
 
In determining the market value of the vehicle, we obtain the valuation from various approved sources, as per
our breakdown submission on our Letter of Demand.
Hence, we maintain our offer since date of accident happened last year on 28/06/2019.
 
Loss of use is based on NIMA benchmark for your reconsideration.
 
Await your prompt reply.
 
Thanks.
 
 
Best Regards

Sky Toh
 

Mobile: 9747 1475
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook
 
Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD
 

  
 
NORTH HQ Office:                              EAST Branch Office:                                 
Mega@Woodlands                             Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4     
39 Woodlands Close #01-12               Unit No #01-61                                        
Singapore 737856                               Singapore 417800                                                
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DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines)                    DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)                                    
Fax: 6256 2533                                    Fax: 6702 3773                                      
Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg           Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg        
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email
Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely
for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately
and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents
to any person.
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 7 August 2020 4:58 pm

To: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTHQ' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: - 
  

1. Total Loss $  1,500.00 
2. Loss of Use (11days x $50.00) $     550.00
3. Towing Fee $     300.00

Total  $ 2,350.00
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 August 2020 3:56 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'YTHQ' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Accident involving SJT5984D & SLZ9593S On 28.06.2019 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19011733/Upa3
 
Hi,
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Any update of this case?


We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Thank you.
 
 
Best Regards

SHUYI

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61
Singapore 417800
DID: 6702 3113 
Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg
 
Branch Office:
39 Woodlands Close,
#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856
DID:62562081
Email: info@yewteegroup.com
 
P please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed.  If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message
from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
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