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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Zahari Ahad <zahari.ahad@sterlinglaw.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 April, 2020 12:01 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); ONG LI LI; Sankar Saminathan

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20198620.A1251 Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20193802.A1233 Our 

Ref: 19/19/19/VC00/022012 [External General] - LKK REF CC4/LPC19011730/Kha3

We refer to your email below. 

 

We confirm that we required the Survey Report.  Please bill us accordingly. 

 
 

Warmest Regards  

  

Zahari AhadZahari AhadZahari AhadZahari Ahad    

(for Mr Sankar s/o Saminathan) 

 
Advocates & Solicitors  

137 Telok Ayer Street #07-05 

Hokkien Huay Kuan Building 

Singapore 068602 

DID:  6327 7156 

Fax: 6223 6328 

Email : zahari.ahad@sterlinglaw.com.sg     
  

The information contained in this email and any attachments transmitted with it may contain information that 

is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and is intended only for the use 

of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 

notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. In such 

case, you should delete this email and notify us immediately. 
 

 
 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2020 4:40 PM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; Zahari Ahad <zahari.ahad@sterlinglaw.com.sg>; Sankar Saminathan 

<sankar.sam@sterlinglaw.com.sg> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) 

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20198620.A1251 Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20193802.A1233 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VC00/022012 [External General] - LKK REF CC4/LPC19011730/Kha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Mr Zahari, 

 

We refer to the below email and to our telephone conversation earlier. 

 

Please be informed that our billing for the Survey Report is $410.00 (before gst). 
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Kindly confirm if you will purchase our Survey Report. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March, 2020 4:09 PM 

To: Zahari Ahad; Sankar Saminathan; Vic (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20198620.A1251 Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20193802.A1233 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VC00/022012 [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Zahari 
 
I am forwarding your email to LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to assist you. 

 
Dear Vic/Mei Kwan 

 
FYA – Have you billed us?  If not, you may bill the TP lawyer directly. 
 

Thank you. 
 

Regards, 

Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  

Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
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From: Zahari Ahad [mailto:zahari.ahad@sterlinglaw.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 4:02 PM 

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; Sankar Saminathan <sankar.sam@sterlinglaw.com.sg> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20198620.A1251 Your Ref: SS.19.CIV.20193802.A1233 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VC00/022012 [External General] 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

 

We refer to the above matter and to the telephone conversation between your goodself 

and our Mr Sankar. 

 

As spoken, please let us have a copy the Surveyor report from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

and the payment that you have made i.e the official receipt. 

 

We will discuss the payment of the report subsequently. 

 
 

Warmest Regards  

  

Zahari AhadZahari AhadZahari AhadZahari Ahad    

(for Mr Sankar s/o Saminathan) 

 
Advocates & Solicitors  

137 Telok Ayer Street #07-05 

Hokkien Huay Kuan Building 

Singapore 068602 

DID:  6327 7156 

Fax: 6223 6328 

Email : zahari.ahad@sterlinglaw.com.sg     
  

The information contained in this email and any attachments transmitted with it may contain information that 

is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and is intended only for the use 

of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 

notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. In such 

case, you should delete this email and notify us immediately. 
 

 

 

 

 


