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51 UBL AVE 1, #01-28 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 02564315

Your Ref: D19004271MFSH Date; 15/7/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19011704/Atd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO,___SLE 93511

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
02/7/2019 at the premises of M/s JEC Automotive have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 11.672.80

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 4,500.00 (LUMP 5UM)
“Check™ Items Amount :S§% -

Market Value +'53

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : 5%

AT Ol

Description of Damage: o T e o
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear portion.

offade
Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Adrian
Automotive Assessor



MSs @ FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tek (656222 2311 Fax(65)6222 1547

Claims & Metor Undenwriting Dept 36 Robinson Road £16-01 City House Singapore 06EATY

Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fao: (B5) 6507 2845
wiww msfirstcapital.com.sg

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited CcReg. No. 1550001060 05T Reg ho. M2-COO1G76-9

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 01-07-2019 Our Ref No. D19004271MFSH
Accident Date 30-06-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB408G Third Party Vehicle, SLE9351J
Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-11 AUTOBAY
Contact Person. AH XIAN
Contact No. Of 92327457 Fax No. 65096584
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointaa LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop JEC AUTOMOTIVE Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Scolicitor KANMAN SG TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

E Member of REEEEINE iRELURANCE GROUF




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 3:24 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc assignments; SUR; 'Eileen Lee’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004271MFSH/N

Dear Sir/Madam,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLE 9351) on 02/07/2019
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933}

From: CWS Maotor Claims IrnaiIm:cwsmomrcIaims@msﬁrstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 12:39 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims cowsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004271MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Denise Tal (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 11:57 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: assignments; SUR; ‘Eileen Lee’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004271MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SLE 9351).pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLE 9351)

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phene: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay@lkkautp.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Lbi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 3:24 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'Eileen Lee'

<EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004271MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLE 9351) on 02/07/2019
We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay (@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CW5S Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com SE]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 12:35 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19004271MFSH/1




1 Owngr, One Year In-House Warranty, High Loan Avallable, Price Ahove Stated Is Actual Sefing Price, Fully Refurbished, New Paintwork
Done, Wear And Tear Replaced, Accident Free, STA Or VICOM Evaluation Are Welkcome, Purchase Comes With Official Warranty Certifica,..

D Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till £17,800 §5,510 fyr 17-May-2006 1,794 cc 155,000 km MPY Available
05/2021)

Ore Year In-House Warranky, High Loan Awallable, Price Abowve Stated 15 Actual Selling Price, Fully Refurbished, New Paintwork Done,
Wear And Tear Replaced, Accident Free, STA Or VICOM Evaluation Are Welcome, Purchase Comes With Official Warranty Cestificate For..

Canway

[] Toyota Wish 1.84 {COE till £19,800 $10,500 fyr 22-May-2006 1,794 e - MPY Available
05,2021)

l;aFunmFullmmmlm,TnnmmmﬂmWﬁhmmew.mmlnﬂmmm
Other Financial Services To Meet Your Budoet. Call Us Or Even Batter, Come On Down Now And Dedde For Yourself.;

¥ Pl ZR-lureE019 Tags: 2006 Toyots Wsh, 2006 toyots wish, Tevoba Wishk, Byt

L__] Toyota Wish 1,84 (CIDE till S42,800 46,190 fyr 05-Jun-2006 1,794 e 165,133 km MPY Available
05/2026)

Cheapest/Safest Buy, Wish 1,BA With Low $6K Depreciation With High Paper Value, Don't Migs! Low Mileage Clocked OF 13000km

Arnually. Mo Further Repairs Needed. 1 Owner, 100% Accident Free. Call Nowdl; [ ingnins v an |

Lake Wiew Credit Pre Lid

Sall your Car for 3,000 More

With over 15K cars sold via Auction and a 500+ Dealer Network, cars on sgCarMart Quolz bypically receive up to §3,000 above market value. Quotz
Guerantees the Highest Seling Frice in Singapons - if we fail, you get $100 cash from us, Gat your Car Listed Today,

Firsd oot migere!

[7] Tayota wish 1.8A (COE till $16,800 $8,610 fyr 15-Jun-2006 1,794 ec 155,000 km MPY Available
06/2021)

Very Comfartable Drive And 1 Have Maintained It Very Well, See It To Believe It} m

I:E Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till $16,888 $B,B30 fyr 21-Jun-2006 1,794 cc 129,846 km MPY Awailable
05/2021)

W Ara The COE Specalist, No Gimmidks, Honest Dealing, 2 Owners With Low Mileage Clodkad, Car In Very Good Condfion, Full Loan

Avallable! 100% Approval, Trade In Welcorme, Bank Loan Avatable, Pleasa Call Qur Friendly Salesman For An Appaintment At Our Show... L Frilians s a0

[] Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till $16,888 $E,470 jyr 06-Jul-2006 1,784 cc 184,000 km MEY Available
06/ 2021)

Best Buy With Assurance And With A Peace Of Mind From Us, High Loan Available, Whatsapp To View Mow! By Appointment Oniyl;
350 VR Cars

[] Toyota wish 1.8A [COE till $45,800 $6,520 fyr 17-Jub-2006 1,794 cc 123,751 km PV Awvailable
05/2026)

High Loan Available, Price Above Stated 15 Actual Seling Price, New Paintwork Done, Wear And Tear Replaced, Accident Fres, Bank And
In House Loans Avallable At Flexibla Low Rate. Call To View Now Before [ts Gonel;

[[] Toyota Wish 1.84 X Limited 16,500 $8,270 fyr 17-Juk-2006 1,74 - MR Available
(COE till 062021}

2 Owreer Unit, Rare Limited Edition Model. Absolutely Well Taken Care Both Interior And Exterior By Previous Chwner Without Any Touch
Up From Us. Meticuloushy And Diligently Maintained. Drive Away With Minimum Down Payment Or 100% Loan Welcome., Come With 6 M.,

et et Torpika st virts wish watntr. L

D Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till $17.888 58,650 fyr 24-Jul-2006 1,754 oo - MEY Availahle
07/2021)
Hat Moded Sefing Again? Special Deal Offer For 3 Days ($19988-52000). Small Capitad Can Run A Rental Business Or Grab Business,
Viewing Avallable Tl 9 PM Daily. Call How!; | FREMNIN A0
R e—— i:l Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till $50,000 $6,850 fyr 20-0ct-2008 1,794 cc - MPY Available
10/2026)

Compam
o High Loan Available, High Paper Value Of $44k. Able To Get Back About $5k OF Unused COE Value At The End Of COE When



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Cwner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwiner 1D: 0070E
T 11310 ST ) R R e 3o S AL I V253 A P S S e o S PU P = FRS S 5
Vehicle Na.: SLE®351)
Wehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Jul 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: WISH18A
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2006
Engine Mo, 17724446882
Chassis Mo.: ZME100317934
Maximum Power Output: 7.0 kW (130bhp)
Cpen Market Value: $18,617.00
Original Registration Date: 25 Aug 20046
First Registration Date: 25 Aug 2006
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $20479.00
eIt ena d PARE R e e e e e e ey e )
PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
i C Ok e A e e T
COE Expiry Date: 31l 2021
COE Category: B -Car (1601cc & above)
COE PeriodiYears): 5
PQP Paid: $25,815.00
COE Rebate Amount: $10.714.00
Tatal Rebate Amount: $10,714.00

Flease note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

Tha information contained herein is correct as at 03 Jul 2019

OK
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4085933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mot 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCIM9011704/Atd3n2

Date: 16-07-2019

LNV

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 9408G Veh. Inspected SLE 9351J
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim Ne. 01900427 1MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 02/07/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH c.c 1794
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. ZNE100317936 Colour GREY
Odometer 264015 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/06/2019 Inspection Date 02/07/2019
Survey held at JEC AUTOMOTIVE
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#02-11 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. Mo 109607T188R GST Reg. No. 19-86807188-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 9351J
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |, Cstmate Y 1:]1
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 545.00 545.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @$50.20 NECESSARY 100.40 100.40
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR @$98.00 CRACKED 196.00 196.00
2|REAR BUMPER IMPACT BRACKET @$68.40 NOT NECESSARY 136.80 d
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 527 60 527.60
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 270.10 270.10
2| TAILLAMP @$409.00 NOT NECESSARY 818.00 !
2| TAILLAMP LOWER BRACKET @$45.10 NOT NECESSARY 90.20 -
1| TAILGATE DENTED 1,272.90 1,272.80
1| TAILGATE LOCK DAMAGED 395.00 395.00
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE cut 298.10 298.10
1[TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CRACKED 485.50 485.50
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1| TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 220.10 220.10
1|TOYOTA LOGO NECESSARY 45.80 4580
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 732.00
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 32.40
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD @$561.10 NOT NECESSARY 1,122.20
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS MOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|FLOOR PANEL TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 535.70 !
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,104.13
7,943.80 3,312.37
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1| TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY &0.00 60.00
400.00 320.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 1,200.00 800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011704/Atd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-H". = i 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607128R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ?;}l ﬁi
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 800.00
WIRING. 50.00 30.00
TO UNDERSEAL, 150.00 60.00
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY. 150.00 60.00
TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIPE. NMOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO REMOVE TAILGATE GLASS 180.00 120.00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTINGS. 150.00 80.00
3,330.00 2,000.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,673.80 5,632.37
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) :

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19011704/Atd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $17,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $10,714.00=NETT VALUE: $6,286.00

%g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng.,AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repcrt is made solely for the use and benadit of the Clisnt named on the frend page of this Report.




