Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 4:12 PM

To: Acher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Tan Kah Leong; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: IMANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving WCB519T (O
SNM19D203064C02(tkl) and SHB6505 (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CTI19011673/K1ea3) on
28/06/2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF - CC3/CTI19011673/K1ea3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D203064C02(tkI)

Dear Asher
We refer to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 56,381.29.

We await your payment advice to enable Kah Leong to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908

DID : (65) 6389 6183
FAX: (65) 6224 T478
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsgl | WeChat: X F§ & Taiping SG

Disclaimer; This e-mail and any files transmitted with Il s Intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential Information,
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:Ashersng@Ikkauto.com)|

Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 10:01 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving WC6519T (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHE650S (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CTI19011673/K1ea3) on 28/06/2019

Your ref : TBA
Our ref : CC3/CT119011673/K1ealq2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter,



The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 is
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at 56,381.29 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 511,198.49 $5,296.50

2. Loss of Rental (6days x 5165.46) 5 992.76 S 82730 (5days x 5165.46)
3. Loss of Income (6days x 580) S 480.00 S 250.00 (5days x 550)
4_LTA Search Fee S 7.49 S 749

Total 512,678.74 $6,381.29

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards.
Asher Sng | Cose Hondler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 4841-605]1 | emaoil: gshenng@kkayto.com | fax: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Incustrial Park, Ubl Averue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 11:46 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: G5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving WCB519T (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SH66505 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119011673/K1ea3) on 28/06/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEASTO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SH 66508 at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

= TP GIA report
* TP estimated cost of repair



¢ Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@dawto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Fayn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




10172014 Manman a-Claima

Print Received Message

This mall s associated with :

*SHD9692C (MCT18120261)
[SHC3371Z]
TP
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Dec 6 2018 7:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent on 06/09/2019 08:59 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$11070.50) - SHD9692C - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved:11070.50.

https:/isingapore.menmen.comiclaims/index.cim Pusebox=5VCmailAfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=600118108CFTOKEN=4BdECG34TTa15-3F4... 1N




Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 10:01 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Alfred Toh

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving WC&519T (Ol - CT1 -
TBA) and SHE6650S (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119011673/K1ea3) on 28/06/2019

Attachments: LOD 5H6E6505.pdf; LKK Inspection.pdf;, LKK Adjustment.pdf; LKK Survey Photo.pdf; LKK

Resurvey Photo.pdf; LETTER TO Ol.pdf

Your ref ;: TBA
Our ref : CC3/CT119011673/K1ealq2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 Is

applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $6,381.29 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 511,198.49
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $165.46) S 99276
3. Loss of Income (6days x SBO) S 480,00
4. LTA Search Fee s 7.49
Total $12,678.74

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Bedt Regordy
Asher Sng | Cose Hondier
LKK Auto Consultonis Pte Lid

phone: 684 1-6051 | emaill pshenng@kkouto.com | fax: 741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubd Indusiriol Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{405%33)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 11:46 AM

Amount Revised

$5,296.50

S B27.30 (S5days x 5165.46)
§ 250.00 (5days x $50)

S 1749

$6,381.29
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COMFORIDELGRO
Our Ref T 0619/ SHB650S /WT(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref : “ ) _
Date 09-Jul-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Degt kb by ot Bt

58 Loyang Drive &th Fli

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508369
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
slHGAPuRE ﬂ?ﬁm Workahops
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE s
Dear Sir Lojang
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SH §650S YOUR INSURED WC 6519T jaue
AND OTHER GH 2&“5.19 Bin Ming

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No : SH 66508 which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage lo the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving WC 65197
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair § 5206.50

6 6 days Loss of Rental @ _§ 16546 per day $ 992,76 .

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 3 -

4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49

5 GIA [ Police Report Fees ] -

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Feas 5 -

SubTotal: § 629675

HIRER'S CLAIM

T 6  dayslossofIncome @ _S 80.00 perdays S 480.00
TotalClaims: & 677675

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 4

h)  LTA search slip/s of : WC 65197
¢) GIA/ Paolice report/s of : SH 66505

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator

{ ) Traffic Compound { } Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Ceriificate of Insurance
{ x ) Rental Rate leter

( X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as

soon as possible

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice

to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithiully

William Tan

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : willlamtani@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO

@

L ki

Sungol Kadid

Yishun

-]
- -



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 12:56 PM

To: ANDY LEEEPASSG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING WC 65197 AND SH 66505 ON 28/06/2015

Ouwr Ref: CCYCTII2011673/K1eal

24 JULY 2019

DYNAMIC CONST & ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING WC 6519T AND SH 66505 ON 28/06/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ lkkauto.com

e.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Maotor Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MERCEDES E220 SH66505 , WC6519T
MOUNTBATTEN RD X OLD AIRPORT RD

ALONG

I we

and/or

Taxi Number

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
[NAF / PAF)

EVELYN LAM SOCK HA (Hirer) NRIC No.:

ONG HOE SENG (Relief) NRIC No.:

SH66505

hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd{CDGE):

Page | of |

ON 28-Jun-19 15:20

SXXXX931)

SKXXAXSIGZ

1. To submit my/our ciaims far damages, costs and axpense, Including loss of Income, loss of rental,
medical fes and legal costs,

L. To have absolute discretion to agree (0 any settiement O cCompensation amount in respect of my/our claim

against third party (excapt parsonal Injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf,

4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds] in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque
shall be forward directly to CDGE n accordance with CDGE's instructian and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date

Name of Hirer
Hirer NREIC

Address

Cantact No.

MName of Relief
Refief NRIC

Address

Contact No.

2B-Jun-2019

EVELYN LAM S50CK HA

SXXXX931) Signature :

10D BEDOK SOUTH AVENUE 2 #12-,.,

463010

94888951

OMG HOE SENG

SXXXA536Z Signature :

1868 GEYLANG RD NIL
389254

86197281

s o

hitp://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runnme/Runtume/View/CDG V... 28/06/2019
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

E"ﬂiir:r No : DMOVSN18045641900 Claim Mo : SHM19D203064/TANEL
Claimant : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Amount :+ 555,381.29

DOLLARS SIX THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED EIGHTY ONE AMD CENTS
TWENTY NINE ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accldent involwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : BH 66505

Insured Vehicle Mo. : WC 65187
Date of Loas : 2B/06/2019
Place of Accident ¢ MOUNTBATTEN RD X OLD AIRPORT RD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING IMSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/orc

Insurad Name : DYNAMIC CONST & ENGINEERING PTE LID
Draiver Name ¢ GUMASEKARAN ARUN

from all claims, present or future ln respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising ocut of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

il) General Damages 53
(2) Cost of Repalr/Ensess sSs 5,296.50
(3) Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 11 1,077.30
(4] GIA/Police Heports/
Investigation Resulta/Search Fees 55 T7.49
(5] Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{6} Survey Fees/P.T. F=es 55
(7) Cost including Disbursemsnt 55
TOTAL « w0 5 o a0 w % % @ % 7 @ a o & D9 6,381.29
Claimant Name : COMFORT TRANSPOHTATION PTE LTD KRIC No :

Signature : gy ALI‘L#'I’ 2ol Date -
CONFSRTRE 0 =

‘The conems o fis documnt apply 1 venicke damages only

AY personel iies and damages asing Mediian ae extedee  VOMIFU

Tom e ambi 50 aoohcation of B dooumenf



COMFOR"IDELGRO ComfontDelGro Enginearing Ple Lid

ENGINEERING
&8 member of CDMH.‘PHTmI.f-R'_:" Gy
(AMPANY HEG. N, = 19950604HW
GST REG. NO. M2-8821817-3 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
8010012 VEHLE NO lﬁ_.’l_(l“'ﬂ'!
8H BRSNS Q1453423 4. 07, 2019
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE OO (S)FI'E LD
SPRINGLEAF TOWKR MAK K

JOR NO.
. MERCKDIS RINY 305307460
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SINGAPORE (79909 WO ODOMKTRR HRADTNG

1 K220CDT (K5)
CONTACT NO: 62222366
DATE (OF HRG
30.09.2013

CHASS S JOR
WIS 200398757675
Description : 3P 28.06.19

Invoice for Lump Sum Repair

Total Ia Sim K ir hm’r 4 .950, 00

Add ::ﬂ‘l‘%p o 00 % 346, 50

Total Tnvnice ameamt 5,296, 50
TB.BUH‘] : KATHER] HI-.'_FJ\H 04.07.2009 16:271:09

apair Iﬁp Cre8n/57/5
P‘ﬂ}"ﬂﬁnt [Term : fCredit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
A mamber of COMORION.CAQ ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHO No

Head Office
205 Braddell Road
Singapare 379701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be msusd unlgss requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef CT19060731 ,\

Date: 04 July 2019

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2019 @ 15:20 hrs

ALONG MOUNTBATTEN RD X OLD AIRPORT RD
INVOLVING WCB519T

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registerad owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registralion
number SHE650S (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to EVELYN LAM SOCK HA IC NO
$1396931J a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $165.46 per day
{inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for
settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generaled letter. Mo signature is required

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 5453 3183
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" Enquire Vehicle Insurance Details
Vehicle Mo ckdent Dot Thine  Search Stotus lnsiirsnce Company Code  lmtirance Caitioany Mama

WCASTTT 280 20157/ 52000 Successhl Lal CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] FTELTD)
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