
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your vehicle XE853U; Our vehicle XE3807J Accident in…
From: Chin, Lee-Ying
To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com', Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com)
Cc: Fong, Andy-SY
Sent: 6/28/2019 10:32:04 AM
Attachments: XE3807J PRS NOTICE..pdf

Hi LKK,
 
Kindly assist to survey.
 

 
 
 
Thanks.
 
Best Regards
Lee Ying, Chin
AIG
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1947
Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
 
 
 
From: Ryder Auto workshop [mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2019 11:11 AM
To: Azlan, Syazairdina; Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd
Imran; Lim, Sheng Yang; Chan, Yoke Shi; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your vehicle XE853U; Our vehicle XE3807J Accident involving XE3807J &
XE853U On 11 March 2019
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sirs,
 
We refer to the above matter.  
 
Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action.
 
For Direct Settlement cases, we only use your in-house surveyor.  Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor.
 
Thank you.
 

http://www.aig.sg/


Best regards
June
 
 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815390

 

 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way
from its use.


