Suwanna (LKK Auto)

From: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 9:58 AM

To: Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF:AAD1412-014 Accident involving SKA9987H and SHD332B on 30/11/2014
Attachments: image001.emz; image004.emz; image007.emz; SHD332B 30.11.14 - GIA.pdf;

image003.png; AAD1412-014-LOD (comp.generate).pdf; FW: Your Ref : SHD332B * Qur
Ref : CC3/AXA14022528/K1da3 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA9987H ( Ol ) & SHD332B
(TP ) DOA ON:30.11.2014

Without prejudice

Your Ref CC3/AXA14022528/K1da3

Dear Sir/Mdm

Please refer to the attached email and preceding email.

Any offer given to us for this case?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
ﬁcag & €

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 9:40 AM

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF:AAD1412-014 Accident involving SKA9987H and SHD332B on 30/11/2014

Without prejudice

Your Ref CC3/AXA14022528/K1da3



Dear Sir/Mdm

Please refer to the attached email.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?

We regret to inform you that we do not have video footage for this caption accident.
Scene photo are included in the attached email.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
ﬂcag 69 69

Website: www.franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 February, 2019 11:50 AM

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF:AAD1412-014 Accident involving SKA9987H and SHD332B on 30/11/2014

Dear Sir/Mdm
We are making a claim against the owner of SKA9987H.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?
Attached LOD (computer generated) and GIA report for your reference.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg




TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
/-ﬁ.ca Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: CST [mailto:cst@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Sunday, 11 November, 2018 2:29 PM

To: claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: RE: TCS REF:AAD1412-014 Accident involving SKA9987H and SHD332B on 30/11/2014

Dear Mr. Calvin,
Thank you for your email.

For the incident that happened on 30/11/2014 under policy no. GA002427 (claim no. C0323705), an independent
adjuster, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD, has been appointed to assist in the Third Party Property Damage
(TPPD) claim.

With regards,

Roman De Alban | Specialist, Gl Call Centre

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: cst@axa.com.sg

Phone: 1800 880 4888 (Within Singapore) / (65) 6880 4888 (International)

--------------- Original Message ---------------

From: claims@transcab.com.sg

Sent: 08/11/2018

To: cst@axa.com.sg

Subject:TCS REF:AAD1412-014 Accident involving SKA9987H and SHD332B on 30/11/2014

Dear Sir/Mdm

We are making a claim against the owner of SKA9987H.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?

Thank You

Best Regards,
Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307



*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to
<mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg> claims@transcab.com.sg

<http://www.transcab.com.sg/>

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise

protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have

received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it

from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to
anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming
e-mails are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security

of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written
agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written
agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
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